

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT			
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY			
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS			
TABULATION			
KEY:			
I.S. INSUFFICIENT SPECS	NO SPEC. NO SPECIFICATIONS		
L.P. LOCAL PREFERENCE	NO SUB. NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED		
N.A. NOT AVAILABLE	N.S. NO SAMPLE		
N.A.S. NOT AS SPECIFIED	R.A.B. REJECT ALL BIDS		
N.B. NO BID	* RECOMMENDED		
N.C. NO CHARGE	** CHOSEN BY LOTTERY		
<p>Basis of Award: Per Section 11, RFQ to be awarded on an item-by-item basis to lowest priced responsive/responsible Vendor unless otherwise noted. Line Items 10, 11 and 12 to be awarded to one (1) Vendor on an "ALL OR NOTHING" basis.</p>			
BUYER HAS REVIEWED AND APPROVED:		DATE:	10/11/2022
SUMMARY OF RESULTS AND TOTAL COST REPORT			
VENDOR	ITEMS RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD	EXTENDED COST	
Cascade School Supplies	27, 28	\$	282.42
DGS Educational Products			
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply			
ODP Business Solutions LLC			
Pyramid School Products	2, 3, 9, 13, 14, 26, 33	\$	9,959.00
Quill			
School Specialty LLC	1, 4, 5, 6, 7, 30, 34	\$	1,635.00
Southwest School & Office Supply	8, 10, 11, 12, 16, 17, 18, 19, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 29A, 29B, 31, 32	\$	19,459.75
	TOTAL AWARD	\$	31,336.17

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #1 Brush, #8 Bristle Flat Easel. Binney & Smith (Crayola) #178, Grumbacher, Princeton #5500F-050, Standard #579-050, Charles Leonard #73550 or equal (WCSD #111/0020)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Charles Leonard 73550 - CAS143076	N/A	550	EA	\$0.66	\$ 363.00	
DGS Educational Products	Charles Leonard - 73550	276 EA	550	EA	\$0.76	\$ 418.00	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply	NO BID		550	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		550	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Charles Leonard - 73550	144 EA	550	EA	\$0.32	\$ 176.00	
Quill	NO BID		550	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 1570362	N/A	550	EA	\$0.27	\$ 148.50	*
Southwest School & Office Supply	Charles Leonard - 73550	\$1,000 minimum combo of Charles Leonard Items	550	EA	\$0.32	\$ 176.00	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #2 Brush, #18 Bristle Flat Easel. Binney & Smith (Crayola) #178, Grumbacher, Princeton #5500F-075, Schoolmate #15340, Standard #579-075, Charles Leonard 73575 or equal (WCSD #111/0030)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Charles Leonard - 73575 - CAS143077	N/A	700	EA	\$0.78	\$ 546.00	
DGS Educational Products	Charles Leonard - 73575	348 EA	700	EA	\$1.05	\$ 735.00	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply	NO BID		700	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		700	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Charles Leonard - 73575	144	700	EA	\$0.42	\$ 294.00	*
Quill	NO BID		700	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	NO BID		700	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Southwest School & Office Supply	Charles Leonard - 73575	minimum combo of Charles Leonard Items	700	EA	\$0.44	\$ 308.00	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #3 Brush, Varnish, 1" Brush width, Black Soft Bristle, 5-1/2" to 6-1/2", with Varnished Handle. Grumbacher, Princeton, Primex #357824, Dynasty #7422, FM Brush #103606, Imperial #31601 or equal (WCSD #111/0040)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	FM Brush - 19924 - CAS143106	N/A	300	EA	\$0.72	\$ 216.00	N.S.
DGS Educational Products	Dynasty - 7422	288 EA	300	EA	\$1.15	\$ 345.00	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply	NO BID		300	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		300	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Dynasty - 7422	72	300	EA	\$0.65	\$ 195.00	*
Quill	NO BID		300	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	NO BID		300	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Southwest School & Office Supply	NO BID		300	EA		\$ -	N.B.

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #4 Brush, #1 Watercolor. Binney & Smith (Liquitex) #1127, Grumbacher, Princeton #540R-1, Standard #252-1, Charles Leonard #73501 or equal (WCSD #111/0070)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Charles Leonard - 73501 - CAS143199	N/A	300	EA	\$0.54	\$ 162.00	
DGS Educational Products	Charles Leonard - 73501	144 EA	300	EA	\$0.57	\$ 171.00	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply	NO BID		300	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		300	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Charles Leonard - 73501	144	300	EA	\$0.23	\$ 69.00	
Quill	NO BID		300	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	Sax - 1567580 (Priced as each, Sold & Shipped in 3/pk)	3/PK	300	EA	\$0.15	\$ 45.00	*
Southwest School & Office Supply	Charles Leonard - 73501	\$1,000 minimum combo of Charles Leonard Items	300	EA	\$0.16	\$ 48.00	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #5 Brush, #4 Watercolor. Binney & Smith (Liquitex) #1127, Grumbacher, Princeton #2650R-4, Standard #252-4, Charles Leonard #73504 or equal (WCSD #111/0080)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Charles Leonard - 73504 - CAS143202	N/A	300	EA	\$0.57	\$ 171.00	
DGS Educational Products	Charles Leonard - 73504	144 EA	300	EA	\$0.64	\$ 192.00	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		300	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		300	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Charles Leonard - 73504	144	300	EA	\$0.26	\$ 78.00	
Quill	NO BID		300	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 1567562 (Priced as each, but sold and shipped in dz)	DZ	300	EA	\$0.12	\$ 36.00	*
Southwest School & Office Supply	Charles Leonard 73504	\$1,000 minimum combo of Charles Leonard Items (144/case)	300	EA	\$0.19	\$ 57.00	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #6 Brush, #8 Watercolor. Binney & Smith (Liquitex) #1127, Grumbacher, Princeton #2650R-8, Standard #252-8, Charles Leonard #73508 or equal (WCSD #111/0090)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Charles Leonard - 73508 - CAS143206	N/A	600	EA	\$0.60	\$ 360.00	
DGS Educational Products	Charles Leonard - 73508	300 EA	600	EA	\$0.74	\$ 444.00	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		600	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		600	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Charles Leonard - 73508	144	600	EA	\$0.30	\$ 180.00	
Quill	NO BID		600	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 1567564 (Priced as each, but sold and shipped in dz)	DZ	600	EA	\$0.17	\$ 102.00	*
Southwest School & Office Supply	Charles Leonard - 73508	\$1,000 minimum combo of Charles Leonard Items (144/case)	600	EA	\$0.23	\$ 138.00	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #7 Brush #10 Watercolor. Binney & Smith (Liquitex) #1127, Grumbacher, Princeton #2650R-10, Standard #252-10, Charles Leonard #73510 or equal (WCSD #111/0100)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Charles Leonard - 73510 - CAS143208	N/A	550	EA	\$0.62	\$ 341.00	
DGS Educational Products	Charles Leonard - 73510	276 EA	550	EA	\$0.79	\$ 434.50	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		550	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		550	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Charles Leonard - 73510	144	550	EA	\$0.35	\$ 192.50	
Quill	NO BID		550	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 1567559 (Priced as each, but sold and shipped in dz)	DZ	550	EA	\$0.20	\$ 110.00	*
Southwest School & Office Supply	Charles Leonard - 73510	\$1,000 minimum combo of Charles Leonard Items (144/case)	550	EA	\$0.25	\$ 137.50	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #8 Brush #4 Bristle Flat Easel. Binney & Smith (Crayola) #178, Grumbacher, Princeton #5500F-025, Standard #579-025, Charles Leonard #73525 or equal (WCSD #111/0010)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Charles Leonard - 73525 - CAS173075	N/A	600	EA	\$0.57	\$ 342.00	
DGS Educational Products	Charles Leonard - 73525	300 EA	600	EA	\$0.67	\$ 402.00	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		600	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		600	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Charles Leonard - 73525	144	600	EA	\$0.30	\$ 180.00	
Quill	NO BID		600	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 1567556 (Priced as each, but sold & shipped in dz)	DZ	600	EA	\$0.14	\$ 84.00	N.A.S.
Southwest School & Office Supply	Charles Leonard - 73525	\$1,000 minimum combo of Charles Leonard Items (144/case)	600	EA	\$0.20	\$ 120.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #9 Brush, #10 Stencil, Dynasty #1800-0, FM Brush #22355 or equal (WCSD #111/0060) SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Richeson - 582010 - CAS143021	N/A	175	EA	\$4.06	\$ 710.50	N.S.
DGS Educational Products	Dynasty - 1800-10	144 EA	175	EA	\$2.29	\$ 400.75	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		175	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		175	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Dynasty - 1800 (22355)	72	175	EA	\$1.39	\$ 243.25	*
Quill	NO BID		175	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	NO BID		175	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Southwest School & Office Supply	NO BID		175	EA		\$ -	N.B.

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
LINE ITEMS 10, 11, AND 12 TO BE AWARDED TO ONE VENDOR ON AN "ALL OR NOTHING" BASIS							
ITEM #10 Crayons, Assorted Colors, (Box of 16 Sticks) Non-Toxic. Binney & Smith (Crayola) #16 (WCSD #111/0200) NO SUBSTITUTES							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Crayola - 16 - CAS182574	N/A	20,000	BX	\$1.20	\$ 24,000.00	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		20,000	BX		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Crayola - C16	N/A	20,000	BX	\$2.07	\$ 41,400.00	
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Crayola - 52-3016	N/A	20,000	BX	\$1.27	\$ 25,400.00	
Pyramid School Products	Crayola 52-3016 (48/cs)	\$800 any combo of Crayola items in Full Cases	20,000	BX	\$0.42	\$ 8,400.00	
Quill	Crayola - 520016 (Quill Item #520016)	N/A	20,000	BX	\$3.39	\$ 67,800.00	
School Specialty LLC	Crayola - 52-3016 (School SSL #007512)	N/A	20,000	BX	\$0.49	\$ 9,800.00	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola - 52-0016	\$800 minimum combo of Crayoloa Items	20,000	BX	\$0.41	\$ 8,200.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #11 Crayons, Assorted Colors, (Box of 8 Sticks) Non-Toxic. Binney & Smith (Crayola) #8 (WCSD #111/0210) NO SUBSTITUTES							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Crayola #8 - CAS182572	N/A	3,000	BX	\$0.82	\$ 2,460.00	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		3,000	BX		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Crayola - C8	N/A	3,000	BX	\$0.96	\$ 2,880.00	
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Crayola - 52-0008	N/A	3,000	BX	\$0.54	\$ 1,620.00	
Pyramid School Products	Crayola 52-3008 - (48/cs)	\$800 any combo of Crayola items in Full Cases	3,000	BX	\$0.2600	\$ 780.00	
Quill	Crayola - 520008 (Quill Item #520008)	N/A	3,000	BX	\$0.69	\$ 2,070.00	
School Specialty LLC	Crayola - 52-0008 (SSL #007503)	N/A	3,000	BX	\$0.37	\$ 1,110.00	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola - 52-0008	\$800 minimum combo of Crayoloa Items	3,000	BX	\$0.2600	\$ 780.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #12 Crayons, Primary, Assorted Colors, (Box of 8 Sticks) Non-Toxic. Binney & Smith (Crayola) #80 (WCSD #111/0220) NO SUBSTITUTES							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Crayola #80 - CAS182577	N/A	2,400	BX	\$1.63	\$ 3,912.00	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		2,400	BX		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Crayola - C8P (Large Size)	N/A	2,400	BX	\$2.66	\$ 6,384.00	
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Crayoloa - 52-0080		2,400	BX	\$1.36	\$ 3,264.00	
Pyramid School Products	Crayola 52-0080 (144/cs)	\$800 any combo of Crayola items in Full Cases	2,400	BX	\$0.58	\$ 1,392.00	
Quill	Crayola - 520080 (Quill Item #520080)	N/A	2,400	BX	\$4.16	\$ 9,984.00	
School Specialty LLC	Crayola - 52-0080 (SSL #007542)	N/A	2,400	BX	\$0.98	\$ 2,352.00	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola - 52-0080	\$800 minimum combo of Crayoloa Items	2,400	BX	\$0.56	\$ 1,344.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #13 Erasers, Art Gum (1" x 1"), 24/Bx. Castell #211, Empire "Pedigree", Vitagum #1144427, Classroom Select #1107 (021069), School Smart #077359, Eterna #13-008, Imperial #13721BX (WCSD #111/0230)							
NO SUBSTITUTES							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Cascade - 154766	N/A	250	BX	\$5.12	\$ 1,280.00	NO SUB.
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		250	BX		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		250	BX		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		250	BX		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Vitagum - 1144427	60 Boxes	250	BX	\$3.90	\$ 975.00	*
Quill	NO BID		250	BX		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	Sax- 438473 Vendor Note - Direct replacement for School Smart #077359. WCSD Purchasing confirmed with Vendor that proposed product is an alternate product vs Manuf. replacement product	N/A	250	BX	\$3.75	\$ 937.50	N.A.S. (Refer to Vendor Note)
Southwest School & Office Supply	NO BID		250	BX		\$ -	N.B.

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #14 Erasers, Multi-Purpose, 5", All Felt, Sewn, 12/Pkg. for All Dry Erase Surfaces and Standard Chalkboards, Baker #EN005, Chalkbuster #2010, Status Plus #25-020 or equal (WCSD #571/2450)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	NO BID		175	PKG		\$ -	N.B.
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		175	PKG		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Colorations - CBE - 10/pkg adjusted qty - 210	N/A	210	PKG	\$14.92	\$ 3,133.20	N.A.S.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Educator's Resouce - CHL74500BN	N/A	175	PKG	\$48.29	\$ 8,450.75	N.S.
Pyramid School Products	Pyramid - 1099241	12 pkgs	175	PKG	\$7.9500	\$ 1,391.25	*
Quill	NO BID		175	PKG		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 009219 (Priced as 12/Pkg Sold & Shipped as Each)	N/A	175	PKG	\$8.76	\$ 1,533.00	
Southwest School & Office Supply	NO BID		175	PKG		\$ -	N.B.

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #15 Glue, White, 16 OZ., Non Toxic, with Nozzle Spout, Captain Creative Glue #CCP128-16, or equal (WCSD 111/0255) SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Cascade - 30135	N/A	450	PT	\$3.59	\$ 1,615.50	N.S.
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		450	PT		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		450	PT		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		450	PT		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	NO BID		450	PT		\$ -	N.B.
Quill	NO BID		450	PT		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	NO BID		450	PT		\$ -	N.B.
Southwest School & Office Supply	Charles Leonard - 38016	\$1,000 minimum combo of Charles Leonard Items (24/case)	450	PT	\$2.34	\$ 1,053.00	N.S.

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #16 Paint, Liquid Tempera-Black., Non-Toxic (16 Fl. Oz.). Certified Color (BesTemp), Binney & Smith, Prang 10709, Rich Art or equal (WCSD #111/0260)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Prang - 10709 - CAS026669	N/A	350	BTL	\$1.30	\$ 455.00	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		350	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Colorations - WSTBK	N/A	350	BTL	\$3.00	\$ 1,050.00	N.S.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		350	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Prang - 10709 (12/cs)	\$550 any combo of case pack	350	BTL	\$0.90	\$ 315.00	
Quill	Prang - 10709 (Quill Item # JV61109)	N/A	350	BTL	\$5.09	\$ 1,781.50	
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 2002738	N/A	350	BTL	\$1.18	\$ 413.00	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Prang - 10709	\$600 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items (12/case)	350	BTL	\$0.82	\$ 287.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #17 Paint, Liquid Tempera-Blue, Non-Toxic (16 Fl. Oz.). Certified Color (BesTemp), Binney & Smith, Rich Art, Prang #10705 or equal (WCSD #111/0270)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Crayola - 311542 - CAS129407	N/A	500	BTL	\$3.35	\$ 1,675.00	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		500	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Colorations - WSTBL	N/A	500	BTL	\$3.00	\$ 1,500.00	N.S.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Dixon Ticonderoga Co - 21607	N/A	500	BTL	\$3.95	\$ 1,975.00	
Pyramid School Products	Prang - 10705 (12/cs)	\$550 any combo of case pack	500	BTL	\$0.90	\$ 450.00	
Quill	Prang - 10705 (Quill Item # JV61105)	N/A	500	BTL	\$4.58	\$ 2,290.00	
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 2002745	N/A	500	BTL	\$1.18	\$ 590.00	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Prang - 10705	\$500 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items (12/case)	500	BTL	\$0.82	\$ 410.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #18 Paint, Liquid Tempera-Brown, Non-Toxic (16 Fl. Oz.). Certified Color (BesTemp), Binney & Smith, Rich Art, Prang #10708 or equal (WCSD #111/0280)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Prang - 10708 - CAS026668	N/A	275	BTL	\$1.30	\$ 357.50	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		275	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Colorations - WSTBR	N/A	275	BTL	\$3.00	\$ 825.00	N.S.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Dixon Ticonderoga Co - 21607	N/A	275	BTL	\$2.60	\$ 715.00	
Pyramid School Products	Prang - 10708 (12/cs)	\$550 any combo of case pack	275	BTL	\$0.90	\$ 247.50	
Quill	NO BID		275	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 2002741	N/A	275	BTL	\$1.18	\$ 324.50	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Prang - 10708	\$600 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items (12/case)	275	BTL	\$0.82	\$ 225.50	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #19 Paint, Liquid Tempera-Green, Non-Toxic (16 Fl. Oz.). Certified Color (BesTemp), Binney & Smith, Rich Art, Prang #10704 or equal (WCSD #111/0290)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Prang - 10704 - CAS026664	N/A	400	BTL	\$1.30	\$ 520.00	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		400	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Colorations - WSTGR	N/A	400	BTL	\$3.00	\$ 1,200.00	N.S.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		400	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Prang - 10704 (12/cs)	\$550 any combo of case pack	400	BTL	\$0.90	\$ 360.00	
Quill	Prang - 10704 (Quill item # JV61104)	N/A	400	BTL	\$5.60	\$ 2,240.00	
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 2002748	N/A	400	BTL	\$1.18	\$ 472.00	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Prang - 10704	\$600 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items	400	BTL	\$0.82	\$ 328.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #20 Paint, Liquid Tempera-Orange, Non-Toxic (16 Fl. Oz.). Certified Color (BesTemp), Binney & Smith, Rich Art, Prang #10711 or equal (WCSD #111/0300)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Prang - 10711 - CAS026662	N/A	300	BTL	\$1.30	\$ 390.00	R.A.B.
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		300	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Colorations - WSTOR	N/A	300	BTL	\$3.00	\$ 900.00	R.A.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Dixon Ticonderoga Co - 21602	N/A	300	BTL	\$2.60	\$ 780.00	R.A.B.
Pyramid School Products	Prang - 10702 (12/cs)	\$550 any combo of case pack	300	BTL	\$0.90	\$ 270.00	R.A.B.
Quill	Prang - 10702 (Quill Item #JV61102)	N/A	300	BTL	\$4.07	\$ 1,221.00	R.A.B.
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 2002743	N/A	300	BTL	\$1.18	\$ 354.00	R.A.B.
Southwest School & Office Supply	Prang - 10702	\$600 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items (12/case)	300	BTL	\$0.82	\$ 246.00	R.A.B.

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #21 Paint, Liquid Tempera-Peach, Non-Toxic (16 Fl. Oz.). Certified Color (BesTemp), Binney & Smith, Rich Art, Prang #10711 or equal (WCSD #111/0310)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Prang - 10711 - CAS026671	N/A	250	BTL	\$1.30	\$ 325.00	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		250	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		250	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Dixon Ticonderoga Co - 21634	N/A	250	BTL	\$1.80	\$ 450.00	
Pyramid School Products	Prang - 10711 (12/cs)	\$550 any combo of case pack	250	BTL	\$0.90	\$ 225.00	
Quill	NO BID		250	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	Crayola 54-3115-033 (SSL #201965)	N/A	250	BTL	\$1.71	\$ 427.50	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Prang - 10711	\$600 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items (12/case)	250	BTL	\$0.82	\$ 205.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #22 Paint, Liquid Tempera-Red, Non-Toxic (16 Fl. Oz.). Certified Color (BesTemp), Binney & Smith, Rich Art, Prang #10701 or equal (WCSD #111/0320)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Prang - 10701 - CAS026661	N/A	525	BTL	\$1.30	\$ 682.50	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		525	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Colorations - WSTRE	N/A	525	BTL	\$3.00	\$ 1,575.00	N.S.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Dixon Ticonderoga Co - 21601	N/A	525	BTL	\$2.65	\$ 1,391.25	
Pyramid School Products	Prang - 10701 (12/cs)	\$550 any combo of case pack	525	BTL	\$0.90	\$ 472.50	
Quill	Prang - DIX10701 (Quill Item # JV61101)	N/A	525	BTL	\$5.35	\$ 2,808.75	
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 2002735	N/A	525	BTL	\$1.18	\$ 619.50	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Prang - 10701	\$600 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items (12/case)	525	BTL	\$0.82	\$ 430.50	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #23 Paint, Liquid Tempera-Violet, Non-Toxic (16 Fl. Oz.). Certified Color (BesTemp), Binney & Smith, Rich Art, Prang #10706 or equal (WCSD #111/0330)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Prang - 10706 - CAS026666	N/A	300	BTL	\$1.30	\$ 390.00	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		300	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Colorations - WSTVI	N/A	300	BTL	\$3.00	\$ 900.00	N.S.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Dixon Ticonderoga Co - 21606	N/A	300	BTL	\$4.15	\$ 1,245.00	
Pyramid School Products	Prang - 10706 (12/cs)	\$550 any combo of case pack	300	BTL	\$0.90	\$ 270.00	
Quill	Prang - 10706 (Quill item # JV61106)	N/A	300	BTL	\$20.22	\$ 6,066.00	
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 2002744 (Purple)	N/A	300	BTL	\$1.18	\$ 354.00	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Prang - 10706	\$500 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items (12/case)	300	BTL	\$0.82	\$ 246.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #24 Paint, Liquid Tempera-White, Non-Toxic (16 Fl. Oz.). Certified Color (BesTemp), Binney & Smith, Rich Art, Prang #10707 or equal (WCSD #111/0340)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Prang - 10707 - CAS026667	N/A	550	BTL	\$1.30	\$ 715.00	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		550	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Colorations - WSTWH	N/A	550	BTL	\$3.00	\$ 1,650.00	N.S.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Dixon Ticonderoga Co - 21609	N/A	550	BTL	\$4.09	\$ 2,249.50	
Pyramid School Products	Prang - 10707 (12/cs)	\$550 any combo of case pack	550	BTL	\$0.90	\$ 495.00	
Quill	Prang - 10707 (Quill item # JV61107)	N/A	550	BTL	\$4.50	\$ 2,475.00	
School Specialty LLC	Crayola - 54-3115-053 (SSL #007698)	N/A	550	BTL	\$1.71	\$ 940.50	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Prang - 10707	\$500 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items (12/case)	550	BTL	\$0.82	\$ 451.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #25 Paint, Liquid Tempera-Yellow, Non-Toxic (16 Fl. Oz.). Certified Color (BesTemp), Binney & Smith, Rich Art, Prang #10703 or equal (WCSD #111/0350)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Prang - 10703 - CAS026663	N/A	450	BTL	\$1.30	\$ 585.00	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		450	BTL		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Colorations - WSTYE	N/A	450	BTL	\$3.00	\$ 1,350.00	N.S.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Dixon Ticonderoga Co - 22803	N/A	450	BTL	\$24.29	\$ 10,930.50	
Pyramid School Products	Prang - 10703 (12/cs)	\$550 any combo of case pack	450	BTL	\$0.90	\$ 405.00	
Quill	Prang - 10703 (Quill item # JV61103)	N/A	450	BTL	\$6.20	\$ 2,790.00	
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 2002740	N/A	450	BTL	\$1.18	\$ 531.00	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Prang - 10703	\$600 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items (12/case)	450	BTL	\$0.82	\$ 369.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #26 Paint, Watercolor (8 Assorted Colors), Plastic Container, Oval Pans, Natural Hair Brush, Non-Toxic. Binney & Smith (Crayola) #BIN-080, Dixon (Prang) #00800, Prang #80525 or equal (WCSD #111/0365) SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Prang - 80525 - CAS182396	N/A	5,000	EA	\$1.87	\$ 9,350.00	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		5,000	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Colorations - BVWW	N/A	5,000	EA	\$2.20	\$ 11,000.00	N.S.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Dixon Ticonderoga Co - 80525	N/A	5,000	EA	\$1.70	\$ 8,500.00	
Pyramid School Products	Crayola - 53-0525-11 (12/cs)	\$800 any combo of Crayola items in Full Cases	5,000	EA	\$1.25	\$ 6,250.00	*
Quill	Prang - 00800 (Quill item # 00800)	N/A	5,000	EA	\$4.50	\$ 22,500.00	
School Specialty LLC	Dixon/Prang - X80525 (SSL #405691)	N/A	5,000	EA	\$2.13	\$ 10,650.00	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Prang - 80525	\$600 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items (6/case)	5,000	EA	\$1.36	\$ 6,800.00	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #27 Pens, Watercolor (Plastic). Montrose Product #WC-3, Richeson #400203, SchoolSmart #30085876 or equal (WCSD #111/0370)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Richeson - 400203 - CAS142815 - Priced at \$3.31 per DZ - Total \$1,489.5	Sold by DZ	450	EA	\$0.276	\$ 124.12	*
DGS Educational Products	Richeson - 400203	444 EA	450	EA	\$0.39	\$ 175.50	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		450	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		450	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Richeson - 400203	144	450	EA	\$0.29	\$ 130.50	
Quill	NO BID		450	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 085876	N/A	450	EA	\$1.39	\$ 625.50	
Southwest School & Office Supply	NO BID		450	EA		\$ -	N.B.

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #28 Pencil Grip, Primary, Assorted Colors, Stetro #ST-100, Moon #ST-100 (25/Pkg. or 100/Pkg.) or equal (WCSD #261/1440)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Moon - ST-100 - CAS023574 Vendor bid on pkg price of \$15.83 per 100 each. Unit cost divided to provide each price.	N/A	1,000	EA	\$0.1583	\$ 158.30	*
DGS Educational Products	Moon - ST-100	100 EA	1,000	EA	\$0.69	\$ 690.00	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		1,000	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	SP Richards - TPG16412 \$3.80 per 12 pack	N/A	1,000	EA	\$0.317	\$ 316.67	N.S.
Pyramid School Products	Moon - ST-100 (100/PKG)	1,000	1,000	EA	\$0.16	\$ 160.00	
Quill	NO BID		1,000	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	NO BID		1,000	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Southwest School & Office Supply	Moon	\$600	1,000	EA	\$0.16	\$ 160.00	N.A.S. (Due to minimum order)

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #29A Scissors, 5", Blunt, Adjustable Screw. Double Pack, Molded Polypropylene Handles for Right or Left Hand use. Cuts Felt, Fabric, Yarn, String & Paper, Fiskars #153520-1005 (WCSD #571/3255)							
NO SUBSTITUTES							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Fiskars - 153520-1005 - CAS023486 - Vendor does not sell this item in a 2 pack.	N/A	2,200	PR	\$0.88	\$ 1,936.00	N.A.S.
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		2,200	PR		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		2,200	PR		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		2,200	PR		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Fiskars - 153520-1005 (36/cs)	\$700 for any combo of Fiskars Items in Full Cases	2,200	PR	\$1.69	\$ 3,718.00	
Quill	NO BID		2,200	PR		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	Schoolworks/Fiskars - 153520-1005 (SSL #1575737)	N/A	2,200	PR	\$1.51	\$ 3,322.00	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Fiskars - 153520-1005	\$300 minimum combo of Fiskars Items	2,200	PR	\$0.79	\$ 1,738.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #29B Scissors, 5", Blunt, Adjustable Screw. Each, Molded Polypropylene Handles for Right or Left Hand use. Cuts Felt, Fabric, Yarn, String & Paper, Fiskars #153520-1005 (WCSD #571/3250) NO SUBSTITUTES							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Fiskars - 153520-1005 - CAS023486	N/A	3,400	EA	\$0.88	\$ 2,992.00	
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		3,400	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		3,400	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		3,400	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Fiskars - 153520-1002 (72/cs) Vendor confirmed that this item is for single pair of scissors.	\$700 for any combo of Fiskars Items in Full Cases	3,400	EA	\$0.59	\$ 2,006.00	
Quill	NO BID		3,400	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	NO BID		3,400	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Southwest School & Office Supply	Fiskars - 153520-1002 - Vendor confirmed that this item number is for a single pair of scissors.	\$300 minimum combo of Fiskars Items	3,400	EA	\$0.54	\$ 1,836.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #30 Scissors, 5 1/2", Safety, Plastic, Inlaid Stainless Steel Blades. WTN #623A, Kingshead Kids Saf-T-Cut #05000, WTN 5 1/2", Status Plus #26-115 or equal (WCSD #571/3260)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Cascade - 167508	N/A	1,600	EA	\$0.83	\$ 1,328.00	N.S.
DGS Educational Products	WTN - 5 1/2	792 EA	1,600	EA	\$1.08	\$ 1,728.00	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		1,600	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		1,600	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	ACME Kingshead - 05000 (72/cs)	\$500 for any combo of ACME Kingshead Items in Full Case	1,600	EA	\$0.79	\$ 1,264.00	
Quill	NO BID		1,600	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 084983 (Priced as each but sold and shipped as 24 pack)	24/PK	1,600	EA	\$0.58	\$ 928.00	*
Southwest School & Office Supply	NO BID		1,600	EA		\$ -	N.B.

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #31 Scissors, 8", Sharp, Stainless Steel Blades, Precision Grounded, Adjustable Screw, Molded Propylene Handles for Left or Right Hand Use. Fiskars #4249, Durasharp #1500, Gurst-Metall Norwegia #26-213 (WCSD #571/3280) NO SUBSTITUTES							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	NO BID		775	EA		\$ -	N.B.
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		775	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		775	EA		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		775	EA		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	Fiskars - 142490 (36/cs) Vendor confirmed that manuf. changed model #, but item is still the same at 4249.	\$700 for any combo of Fiskars Items in Full Cases	775	EA	\$3.19	\$ 2,472.25	
Quill	NO BID		775	EA		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	Fiskars - 142490-1014 (SSL #1468068)	N/A	775	EA	\$4.04	\$ 3,131.00	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Fiskars - 4249	\$300 minimum combo of Fiskars Items	775	EA	\$3.05	\$ 2,363.75	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #32 Chalk, Assorted Colors, Box of 12, Hygieia Stick Assorted Color Dustless Chalk, Non-Toxic, Prang/Dixon #61400 (WCSD 111/0110)							
NO SUBSTITUTES							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Prang/Dixon - 61400 - CAS024770	N/A	450	BX	\$0.83	\$ 373.50	
DGS Educational Products	Prang/Dixon - 61400	144 EA	450	BX	\$1.15	\$ 517.50	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		450	BX		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Dixon Ticonderoga Co - 61400	N/A	450	BX	\$1.23	\$ 553.50	
Pyramid School Products	Prang/Dixon - 61400 (12 bxs/cs)	\$550 any combo of Prang in Case Pack	450	BX	\$0.34	\$ 153.00	
Quill	Prang - 61400 (Quill Item #61400)	N/A	450	BX	\$2.54	\$ 1,143.00	
School Specialty LLC	NO BID		450	BX		\$ -	N.B.
Southwest School & Office Supply	Dixon - 61400	\$600 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items	450	BX	\$0.28	\$ 126.00	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #33 Clay, Assorted Colors (1 Lb. Pkgs.), Non-Toxic. Dixon (Prang) #740, Kleen Klay, OmyaColor, Schoolmate, Happy Stix #4-1 or equal (WCSD #111/0160)							
SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Sargent Art - 224400 - CAS175265	N/A	550	LB	\$2.32	\$ 1,276.00	N.S.
DGS Educational Products	Prang/Dixon - 740	276 EA	550	LB	\$2.10	\$ 1,155.00	
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	Crayola - Modeling		550	LB	\$3.40	\$ 1,870.00	N.S.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	Crayola - 57-0300	N/A	550	LB	\$2.60	\$ 1,430.00	N.S.
Pyramid School Products	Prang/Dixon - 00740 (12/cs)	\$550 any combo of Prang in Case Pack	550	LB	\$1.11	\$ 610.50	*
Quill	Prang - 740 (Quill item # DIX00740)	N/A	550	LB	\$2.71	\$ 1,490.50	
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 2003083	N/A	550	LB	\$1.81	\$ 995.50	
Southwest School & Office Supply	Dixon - 740	\$600 minimum combo of Prang/Dixon Items	550	LB	\$1.16	\$ 638.00	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
INSTRUCTIONAL SUPPLIES FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY							
RFQ #17-QF-07-23-GS							
ITEM #34 Clay, Brown (1 Lb Pkgs.), Non-Toxic, Happy Stix #4-1 or equal (WCSD #111/0170) SAMPLE REQUIRED IF NOT SPECIFIED BRAND							
SUPPLIER	MFG/MODEL	MIN ORDER	QTY	UNIT OF ISSUE	UNIT COST	EXTENDED COST	RECOMMENDED
Cascade School Supplies	Sargent Art - 224088 - CAS028418	N/A	150	LB	\$2.32	\$ 348.00	N.S.
DGS Educational Products	NO BID		150	LB		\$ -	N.B.
Earlychildhood LLC DBA Discount School Supply Education	NO BID		150	LB		\$ -	N.B.
ODP Business Solutions LLC	NO BID		150	LB		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	NO BID		150	LB		\$ -	N.B.
Quill	NO BID		150	LB		\$ -	N.B.
School Specialty LLC	School Smart - 2003081	N/A	150	LB	\$1.77	\$ 265.50	*
Southwest School & Office Supply	NO BID		150	LB		\$ -	N.B.