



Washoe County School District

Purchasing Department • 14101 Old Virginia Road • Reno, NV 89521
Phone (775) 850-8025 • Fax (775) 857-3175

May 28, 2024

TO:
Coplite Products
GCS Imaging Inc
Pacific Office Automation
Quill LLC
Ram Discount Computer Supplies

RE: Request for Bid ~ Recommendation of Award (ROA)

For the Request for Bid for Copier & Digital Duplicator Supplies, RFB #121-B-03-24-GS, Washoe County School District's (WCSD) Purchasing Department is recommending award for an initial one (1) year term beginning June 14, 2024, and expiring on June 13, 2025, to:

GCS IMAGING INC
PACIFIC OFFICE AUTOMATION
QUILL LLC
RAM DISCOUNT COMPUTER SUPPLIES

A copy of the ROA Tabulation is attached for reference and is also available online at: <https://solicitations.washoeschools.net/Purchasing/Default?ProjectID=4670>.

Pursuant to Nevada Revised Statute (NRS), Chapter 332.068, this memo serves as formal notification that the formal appeal period has commenced and will close on June 4, 2024, at 4:30 pm (local time). Submitting appellants are advised to refer to NRS 332.068 and the RFB solicitation document available online at: <https://solicitations.washoeschools.net/Purchasing/Default?ProjectID=4670> for more instructions on filing a notice of appeal.

The anticipated award of this solicitation is June 14, 2024, with the posting and distribution of the official Notice of Award following shortly thereafter.

Please submit any inquiries or questions regarding this ROA memo in writing to:
solicitations@washoeschools.net.

Thank you for your interest in doing business with WCSD.

WCSD Purchasing Department

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT		
SOLICITATION TITLE: COPIER & DIGITAL DUPLICATOR SUPPLIES		
SOLICITATION #: 121-B-03-24-GS		
RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD - ROA TABULATION		
ITEM EVALUATION KEY:		
R.A.B. REJECT ALL BIDS	D.M.O. DECLINED MINIMUM ORDER	
I.S. INSUFFICIENT SPECS	NO SPEC. NO SPECIFICATIONS	
N.C. NO CHARGE	NO SUB. NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED	
S.R.L SAMPLE RECEIVED LATE	S.R. SAMPLE REJECTED	
N.L.A NO LONGER AVAILABLE	N.S.R. NO SAMPLE RECEIVED	
N.A.S. NOT AS SPECIFIED		
N.B. NO BID	* RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD	
N.C. NO CHARGE	** TIED / CHOSEN BY LOTTERY	
BUYER HAS REVIEWED AND APPROVED:		DATE: May 28, 2024
SURETY REQUIRED: NO		
APPEAL WINDOW CLOSSES AT 4:30 PM (LOCAL TIME) ON: June 4, 2024		
Basis of Award: Per Section 28.1, It is the intent of WCSD to award this solicitation (contract) on a "LINE BY LINE ITEM" basis to the lowest responsive and responsible Bidder(s) whose submission(s) meet all terms, conditions, and specifications of this solicitation.		
SUMMARY OF RESULTS AND TOTAL COST REPORT		
VENDOR NAME	LOW BID BY ITEM NUMBER(S)	LOW ITEM BID TOTAL
Copylite Products		\$ -
GCS Imaging Inc	1, 2, 5, 6, 11, 12, 13, 14, 16	\$ 68,095.00
Pacific Office Automation	7, 15	\$ 15,182.88
Quill LLC	3	\$ 957.60
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	4, 8, 9, 10	\$ 30,126.30
ESTIMATED TOTAL CONTRACT VALUE =		\$ 114,361.78

SECTION A - ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURERS (OEM)

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ANNUAL USAGE ESTIMATES

ITEM #1 Toner, Lanier 5622/5627 LD122, LD127, LD225, LD230, LD235, LD330, Part #841337

MUST BE LANIER/RICOH - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/5752

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	RICOH	841337	4	20	\$ 19.95	\$ 399.00	
GCS Imaging Inc	RICOH 841337	841337	N/A	20	\$ 14.50	\$ 290.00	*
Pacific Office Automation	RICOH/LANIER 841337	841337	1	20	\$ 21.40	\$ 428.00	
Quill LLC	RICOH, 841337	2712344	0	20	\$ 21.42	\$ 428.40	
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	RICOH 841337	841337		20	\$ 19.95	\$ 399.00	

ITEM #2 Toner, Lanier MP4054/MP5054, MP4055/MP5055, Part #842126

MUST BE LANIER/RICOH - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/0054

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	RICOH	842126	10	250	\$ 59.00	\$ 14,750.00	
GCS Imaging Inc	RICOH 842126	842126	N/A	250	\$ 49.00	\$ 12,250.00	*
Pacific Office Automation	RICOH/LANIER 842126	842126	1	250	\$ 58.65	\$ 14,662.50	
Quill LLC	RICOH, 2711378	2711378	0	250	\$ 65.68	\$ 16,420.00	
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	RICOH 842126	842126		250	\$ 53.75	\$ 13,437.50	

ITEM #3 Toner, Lanier 4002, 5002, LD345, Part #841346

MUST BE LANIER/RICOH - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/2900

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	RICOH	841346	4	30	\$ 43.95	\$ 1,318.50	
GCS Imaging Inc	RICOH 841346	841346	N/A	30	\$ 40.00	\$ 1,200.00	
Pacific Office Automation	RICOH/LANIER 841346	841346	1	30	\$ 47.32	\$ 1,419.60	
Quill LLC	RICOH, 841346	2712781	0	30	\$ 31.92	\$ 957.60	*
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	RICOH 841346	841346		30	\$ 423.28	\$ 12,698.40	N.A.S.

ITEM #4. Toner, Konica Bizhub 360, 361, 420, 421, 501, Part #TN511

MUST BE KONICA - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/5754

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products				120	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
GCS Imaging Inc	KONICA TN511	024E	N/A	120	\$ 44.00	\$ 5,280.00	
Pacific Office Automation	KONICA TN511	TN511	1	120	\$ 55.65	\$ 6,678.00	
Quill LLC	NO BID			120	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	KONICA TN511	TN511		120	\$ 43.99	\$ 5,278.80	*

ITEM #5. Toner, Konica Bizhub 223/283, Part #TN217

MUST BE KONICA - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/5000

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	KONICA MINOLTA	A202031 *IT HAS BEEN DEMONSTRATED THAT A202031 IS ALSO AN ACCEPTABLE KONICA PART NUMBER FOR THIS ITEM	6	8	\$ 45.00	\$ 360.00	
GCS Imaging Inc	KONICA TN217	A202031	N/A	8	\$ 30.00	\$ 240.00	*
Pacific Office Automation	KONICA TN217	TN217	1	8	\$ 41.48	\$ 331.84	
Quill LLC	NO BID			8	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	KONICA TN217	TN217		8	\$ 31.55	\$ 252.40	

ITEM #6 Toner, Konica Bizhub 363/423, Part #TN414

MUST BE KONICA - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/5100

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	KONICA MINOLTA	A202030 *IT HAS BEEN DEMONSTRATED THAT A202030 IS ALSO AN ACCEPTABLE KONICA PART NUMBER FOR THIS ITEM	6	40	\$ 39.50	\$ 1,580.00	
GCS Imaging Inc	KONICA TN414	A202030	N/A	40	\$ 32.50	\$ 1,300.00	*
Pacific Office Automation	KONICA TN414	TN414	1	40	\$ 43.21	\$ 1,728.40	
Quill LLC	NO BID			40	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	KONICA TN414	TN414		40	\$ 32.85	\$ 1,314.00	

ITEM #7 Toner, Konica Bizhub 25E/28E, Part #TN219

MUST BE KONICA - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/2800

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products				24	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
GCS Imaging Inc	KONICA TN219	DD1A002G3X	N/A	24	\$ 135.00	\$ 3,240.00	
Pacific Office Automation	KONICA TN219	TN219	1	24	\$ 91.87	\$ 2,204.88	*
Quill LLC	NO BID			24	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	KONICA TN219	TN219		24	\$ 95.00	\$ 2,280.00	

ITEM #8 Toner, Konica Bizhub 224E, 284E, 364E, Part #TN322

MUST BE KONICA - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/3000

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
		A33K030 *IT HAS BEEN DEMONSTRATED THAT A33K030 IS ALSO AN ACCEPTABLE KONICA PART NUMBER FOR THIS ITEM					
Copylite Products	KONICA MINOLTA		4	75	\$ 48.00	\$ 3,600.00	
GCS Imaging Inc	KONICA TN322	A33K030	N/A	75	\$ 39.65	\$ 2,973.75	
Pacific Office Automation	KONICA TN322	TN322	1	75	\$ 52.08	\$ 3,906.00	
Quill LLC	KONICA, TN322	2124933	0	75	\$ 48.62	\$ 3,646.50	
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	KONICA TN322	TN322		75	\$ 39.65	\$ 2,973.75	**

ITEM #9 Toner, Konica Bizhub 368, 308, Part #TN325

MUST BE KONICA - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/0368

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
		A8DA030 *IT HAS BEEN DEMONSTRATED THAT A8DA030 IS ALSO AN ACCEPTABLE KONICA PART NUMBER FOR THIS ITEM					
Copylite Products	KONICA MINOLTA		5	125	\$ 48.00	\$ 6,000.00	
GCS Imaging Inc	KONICA TN325	A8DA030	N/A	125	\$ 42.00	\$ 5,250.00	
Pacific Office Automation	KONICA TN325	TN325	1	125	\$ 55.22	\$ 6,902.50	
Quill LLC	KONICA, TN325	24471274	0	125	\$ 57.79	\$ 7,223.75	
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	KONICA TN325	TN325		125	\$ 41.99	\$ 5,248.75	*

ITEM #10 Toner, Konica Bizhub 368E, 308E, Part #TN326

MUST BE KONICA- NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/0370

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
		AAJ6030 *IT HAS BEEN DEMONSTRATED THAT AAJ6030 IS ALSO AN ACCEPTABLE KONICA PART NUMBER FOR THIS ITEM					
Copylite Products	KONICA MINOLTA		10	350	\$ 55.00	\$ 19,250.00	
GCS Imaging Inc	KONICA TN326	AAJ6030	N/A	350	\$ 48.00	\$ 16,800.00	
Pacific Office Automation	KONICA TN326	TN326	1	350	\$ 57.75	\$ 20,212.50	
Quill LLC	NO BID			350	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	KONICA TN326	TN326		350	\$ 47.50	\$ 16,625.00	*

ITEM #11 Toner, Konica Bizhub 458E, 558E, Part #TN516

MUST BE KONICA - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/0458

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
		AAJ7030 *IT HAS BEEN DEMONSTRATED THAT AAJ7030 IS ALSO AN ACCEPTABLE KONICA PART NUMBER FOR THIS ITEM					
Copylite Products	KONICA MINOLTA		10	250	\$ 39.95	\$ 9,987.50	
GCS Imaging Inc	KONICA TN516	AAJ7030	N/A	250	\$ 31.20	\$ 7,800.00	*
Pacific Office Automation	KONICA TN516	TN516	1	250	\$ 40.95	\$ 10,237.50	
Quill LLC	NO BID			250	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	KONICA TN516	TN516		250	\$ 36.89	\$ 9,222.50	

ITEM #12 Toner, Konica Bizhub 287, 227, 367, Part #TN323

MUST BE KONICA - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/3100

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	KONICA MINOLTA	A87M030 *IT HAS BEEN DEMONSTRATED THAT A87M030 IS ALSO AN ACCEPTABLE KONICA PART NUMBER FOR THIS ITEM	4	100	\$ 49.60	\$ 4,960.00	
GCS Imaging Inc	KONICA TN323	A87M030	N/A	100	\$ 39.65	\$ 3,965.00	*
Pacific Office Automation	KONICA TN323	TN323	1	100	\$ 52.15	\$ 5,215.00	
Quill LLC	NO BID			100	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	KONICA	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		100	\$ 39.60	\$ 3,960.00	NO SPEC.

ITEM #13 Toner, Konica Bizhub 300I, 630I, Part#TN330

MUST BE KONICA - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/3150

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	KONICA MINOLTA	AC7A030 *IT HAS BEEN DEMONSTRATED THAT AC7A030 IS ALSO AN ACCEPTABLE KONICA PART NUMBER FOR THIS ITEM	4	200	\$ 52.50	\$ 10,500.00	
GCS Imaging Inc	KONICA TN330	AC7A030	N/A	200	\$ 50.00	\$ 10,000.00	*
Pacific Office Automation	KONICA TN330	TN330	1	200	\$ 51.45	\$ 10,290.00	
Quill LLC	NO BID			200	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	KONICA TN330	TN330		200	\$ 52.89	\$ 10,578.00	

ITEM #14 Toner, Konica Bizhub 450I, 550I, 650I, Part #TN628

MUST BE KONICA - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/3200

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products				550	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
GCS Imaging Inc	KONICA TN628	AC79030	N/A	550	\$ 35.00	\$ 19,250.00	*
Pacific Office Automation	KONICA TN628	TN628	1	550	\$ 37.40	\$ 20,570.00	
Quill LLC	KONICA, TN628	24473989	0	550	\$ 40.43	\$ 22,236.50	
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	KONICA TN628	TN628		550	\$ 35.25	\$ 19,387.50	

ITEM #15 Ink Cartridge, Black, Pack/Carton of 2, For Risograph SF 5130 Digital Duplicator, Part #S-8113U
MUST BE RISOGRAPH - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/6004

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (PACK/CTN)	COST (PER PACK/CTN OF 2)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products				350	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
GCS Imaging Inc	RISOGRAPH S-8113U	S8113	N/A	350	\$ 45.00	\$ 15,750.00	
Pacific Office Automation	RISOGRAPH S-8113U	S-8113U	2	350	\$ 37.08	\$ 12,978.00	*
Quill LLC	NO BID			350	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	RISOGRAPH S-8113U	S-8113U		350	\$ 45.50	\$ 15,925.00	

ITEM #16 Masters, Pack/Carton of 2, For Risograph SF 5130 Digital Duplicator, PART #S-8188UA
MUST BE RISOGRAPH - NO SUBSTITUTES

WCSD #651/6005

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (PACK/CTN)	COST (PER PACK/CTN OF 2)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products				200	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
GCS Imaging Inc	RISOGRAPH S-8188UA	S8188UA	N/A	200	\$ 65.00	\$ 13,000.00	*
Pacific Office Automation	RISOGRAPH S-8188UA	S-8188UA	2	200	\$ 72.16	\$ 14,432.00	
Quill LLC	NO BID			200	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	RISOGRAPH S-8188UA	S-8188UA		200	\$ 68.50	\$ 13,700.00	

SECTION B - COMPATIBLES

Per Section 28.1, **WCSD intends to order ONLY the ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER (OEM) supplies in SECTION A.** WCSD will **POTENTIALLY** order compatible supplies if any of the awarded vendors from SECTION A can't provide the items needed within the delivery timeframe indicated in their bid submissions.

*Low bid items from this section will not be included as part of the consideration for award and the associated costs will not be reflected in the Estimated Contract Total.

QUANTITIES LISTED ARE ANNUAL USAGE ESTIMATES

ITEM #1B Toner, Compatible for Lanier 5622/5627 LD122, LD127, LD225, LD230, LD235, LD330

WCSD #651/5752

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products				20	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
GCS Imaging Inc	GENERIC TYPE 2120D/2220D	GEN2120D	N/A	20	\$ 12.58	\$ 251.60	*
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		20	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			20	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		20	\$ 19.10	\$ 382.00	NO SPEC.

ITEM #2B Toner, Compatible for Lanier MP4054/MP5054, MP4055/MP5055

WCSD #651/0054

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	COPYLITE PRODUCTS	TON6054	8	250	\$ 32.50	\$ 8,125.00	*
GCS Imaging Inc	GENERIC 842126	GEN842126	N/A	250	\$ 41.97	\$ 10,492.50	
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		250	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			250	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		250	\$ 19.99	\$ 4,997.50	NO SPEC.

ITEM #3B Toner, Compatible for Lanier 4002, 5002, LD345, Part #841346

WCSD #651/2900

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products				30	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
GCS Imaging Inc	GENERIC 480-0397	GEN4800397	N/A	30	\$ 22.21	\$ 666.30	*
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		30	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			30	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		30	\$ 54.95	\$ 1,648.50	NO SPEC.

ITEM #4B Toner, Compatible for Konica Bizhub 360, 361, 420, 421, 501, Part #TN511

WCSD #651/5754

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products				120	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
GCS Imaging Inc				120	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		120	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			120	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		120	\$ 33.00	\$ 3,960.00	NO SPEC.

ITEM #5B Toner, Compatible for Konica Bizhub 223/283

WCSD #651/5000

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	COPYLITE PRODUCTS	TONTN217	4	8	\$ 25.00	\$ 200.00	
GCS Imaging Inc	GENERIC TN217	GENA202031	N/A	8	\$ 18.85	\$ 150.80	*
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		8	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			8	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		8	\$ 24.24	\$ 193.92	NO SPEC.

ITEM #6B Toner, Compatible for Konica Bizhub 363/423, Part #TN414

WCSD #651/5100

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	COPYLITE PRODUCTS	TONTN414	8	40	\$ 21.95	\$ 878.00	*
GCS Imaging Inc	GENERIC TN414	GENA202030	N/A	40	\$ 22.16	\$ 886.40	
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		40	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			40	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies				40	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.

ITEM #7B Toner, Compatible for Konica Bizhub 25E/28E							
WCSD #651/2800							
SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products				24	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
GCS Imaging Inc				24	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		24	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			24	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies				24	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
ITEM #8B Toner, Compatible for Konica Bizhub 224E, 284E, 364E							
WCSD #651/3000							
SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	COPYLITE PRODUCTS	TON364B	5	75	\$ 31.95	\$ 2,396.25	
GCS Imaging Inc	GENERIC TN322	GENA33K030	N/A	75	\$ 16.90	\$ 1,267.50	*
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		75	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			75	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		75	\$ 36.00	\$ 2,700.00	NO SPEC.
ITEM #9B Toner, Compatible for Konica Bizhub 368, 308							
WCSD #651/0368							
SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	COPYLITE PRODUCTS	TON554B	5	125	\$ 30.95	\$ 3,868.75	*
GCS Imaging Inc	GENERIC TN325	GENA8DA030	N/A	125	\$ 36.64	\$ 4,580.00	
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		125	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			125	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		125	\$ 36.00	\$ 4,500.00	NO SPEC.
ITEM #10B Toner, Compatible for Konica Bizhub 368E, 308E							
WCSD #651/0370							
SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	COPYLITE PRODUCTS	TON554B	10	350	\$ 30.95	\$ 10,832.50	*
GCS Imaging Inc	GENERIC TN326	GENAAJ6030	N/A	350	\$ 38.64	\$ 13,524.00	
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		350	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			350	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		350	\$ 36.00	\$ 12,600.00	NO SPEC.

ITEM #11B Toner, Compatible for Konica Bizhub 458E, 558E							
WCSD #651/0458							
SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	COPYLITE PRODUCTS	TON5545B	10	250	\$ 30.95	\$ 7,737.50	
GCS Imaging Inc	GENERIC TN516	GENAAJ7030	N/A	250	\$ 28.64	\$ 7,160.00	*
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		250	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			250	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		250	\$ 36.47	\$ 9,117.50	NO SPEC.
ITEM #12B Toner, Compatible for Konica Bizhub 287, 227, 367							
WCSD #651/3100							
SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	COPYLITE PRODUCTS	TON287B	10	100	\$ 29.95	\$ 2,995.00	*
GCS Imaging Inc	GENERIC TN323	GENA87M030	N/A	100	\$ 30.02	\$ 3,002.00	
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		100	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			100	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		100	\$ 48.37	\$ 4,837.00	NO SPEC.
ITEM #13B Toner, Compatible for Konica Bizhub 300I, 630I							
WCSD #651/3150							
SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	COPYLITE PRODUCTS	TON626K	10	200	\$ 34.95	\$ 6,990.00	*
GCS Imaging Inc	GENERIC TN330	GENAC7A030	N/A	200	\$ 35.50	\$ 7,100.00	
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		200	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			200	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		200	\$ 44.00	\$ 8,800.00	NO SPEC.
ITEM #14B Toner, Compatible for Konica Bizhub 450I, 550I, 650I							
WCSD #651/3200							
SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (EACH)	COST (PER EACH)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products	COPYLITE PRODUCTS	TON626K	10	550	\$ 34.95	\$ 19,222.50	
GCS Imaging Inc	GENERIC TN628	GENAC79030	N/A	550	\$ 30.49	\$ 16,769.50	*
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		550	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			550	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		550	\$ 44.00	\$ 24,200.00	NO SPEC.

ITEM #15B Ink Cartridge, Black, Pack/Carton of 2, Compatible for Risograph SF 5130 Digital Duplicator

WCSD #651/6004

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (PACK/CTN)	COST (PER PACK/CTN OF 2)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products				350	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
GCS Imaging Inc				350	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		350	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			350	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL	NO INFORMATION PROVIDED ON BID SUBMISSION FOR THIS CELL		350	\$ 64.95	\$ 22,732.50	NO SPEC.

ITEM #16B Masters, Pack/Carton of 2, Compatible for Risograph SF 5130 Digital Duplicator

WCSD #651/6005

SUBMITTING VENDOR NAME	MANUFACTURER & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PART #	MINIMUM ORDER QTY	EST ANNUAL QTY (PACK/CTN)	COST (PER PACK/CTN OF 2)	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
Copylite Products				200	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
GCS Imaging Inc				200	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Pacific Office Automation	N/A	N/A		200	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Quill LLC	NO BID			200	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.
Ram Discount Computer Supplies				200	\$ -	\$ -	N.B.