



Washoe County School District

Purchasing Department • 14101 Old Virginia Road • Reno, NV 89521
Phone (775) 850-8025 • Fax (775) 857-3175

01/23/25

TO: BSN Sports, LLC
Central Valley Office Supply, LLC
MFAC, LLC
Pyramid School Products
United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc

RE: Request for Formal Quote ~ Recommendation of Award (ROA)

For the Request for Formal Quote for Certain Track & Field Equipment & Related Supplies, RFQ #76-QF-11-25-GS, Washoe County School District's (WCSD) Purchasing Department is recommending award for an initial one (1) year term beginning 01/31/25 and expiring on 01/30/26 to:

BSN SPORTS, LLC
MFAC, LLC
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS
UNITED CANVAS & SLING, INC., DBA UCS, INC

A copy of the ROA Tabulation is attached for reference and is also available online at: <https://solicitations.washoeschools.net/Purchasing/Default?ProjectID=4767>

This memo serves as formal notification that the public review of the ROA Tabulation period has commenced and will close on 01/30/25 at 4:30 pm (local time). The anticipated award of this solicitation is 01/31/25 with the posting and distribution of the official Notice of Award following shortly thereafter.

Please submit any inquiries or questions regarding this ROA memo in writing to: solicitations@washoeschools.net.

Thank you for your interest in doing business with WCSD.

WCSD Purchasing Department

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
1	WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							
2	SOLICITATION TITLE: Certain Track & Field Equipment & Related Supplies							
3	SOLICITATION #: 76-QF-11-25-GS							
4	RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD - ROA TABULATION							
5	ITEM EVALUATION KEY:							
6	R.A.B. REJECT ALL BIDS	D.M.O. DECLINED MINIMUM ORDER						
7	I.S. INSUFFICIENT SPECS	NO SPEC. NO SPECIFICATIONS						
8	N.C. NO CHARGE	NO SUB. NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED						
9	S.R.L SAMPLE RECEIVED LATE	S.R. SAMPLE REJECTED						
10	N.L.A NO LONGER AVAILABLE	N.S.R. NO SAMPLE RECEIVED						
11	N.A.S. NOT AS SPECIFIED	* RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD						
12	N.B. NO BID	** TIED / CHOSEN BY LOTTERY						
13	N.C. NO CHARGE							
14								
15	BUYER HAS REVIEWED AND APPROVED:					DATE:		
16	SURETY REQUIRED: NO							
17	PUBLIC REVIEW PERIOD CLOSES: 01/30/25 at 4:30 pm (local time)							
18	BASIS OF AWARD: Per Section 11 of SOLICITATION DOCUMENT, this RFQ will be awarded on a LINE-BY-LINE basis to the lowest priced, responsive, and responsible Vendor.							
19	SUMMARY OF RESULTS AND TOTAL COST REPORT							
20	VENDOR NAME	LOW BID BY ITEM NUMBER(S)						LOW ITEM BID TOTAL
21	BSN Sports, LLC	5, 10, 14, 15, 16, 26, 27, 30, 38, 39, 40, 41						\$ 3,411.03
22	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC							\$ -
23	MFAC, LLC	1, 3, 6, 8, 12, 13, 17, 18, 21, 29, 31, 32, 33, 34						\$ 59,047.00
24	Pyramid School Products	19, 20, 23, 24, 25, 28						\$ 367.77
25	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	4, 9, 11, 22, 35, 36, 37, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59						\$ 12,817.00
26	ESTIMATED TOTAL CONTRACT VALUE =						\$ 75,642.80	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
	ITEM #1: Pole Vault Landing Area/"Pit", 21'6"x24'x32", 2" Top Pad Constructed of Breathable Fabric, Measures 18'4" Behind Box, Sides and Bottoms Constructed of Vinyl Material. Must Conform to World Athletics, USATF, NCAA, NFHS Size Specifications. UCS Spirit #1800, 503 Series or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
28								
29	WCSO Index #4251							
30	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
31	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics G1 Collegiate PV Landing System *Specify Color	GA66217CXXYY	\$ 26,902.50	2	EACH	\$ 53,805.00	
32	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #1800		\$ 33,139.00	2	EACH	\$ 66,278.00	
33	MFAC, LLC	First Place *\$25 minimum order	5920	\$ 20,595.00	2	EACH	\$ 41,190.00	*
34	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	2	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
35	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #1800	1800	\$ 21,468.00	2	EACH	\$ 42,936.00	
	ITEM #2: Weather Cover for 21'6"x24'x32" Pole Vault Pit. UCS Spirit #1812 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
36								
37	WCSO Index #4252							
38	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
39	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics Cover for Item 1 (Gill Athletics#GA6621702CXX)	GA6621702CXX	\$ 2,486.30	2	EACH	\$ 4,972.60	R.A.B.
40	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #1812		\$ 2,900.00	2		\$ 5,800.00	R.A.B.
41	MFAC, LLC	First Place *\$25 minimum order	5920-WC	\$ 2,395.00	2		\$ 4,790.00	R.A.B.
42	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	2	EACH	\$ -	R.A.B.
43	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #1812	1812	\$ 2,122.00	2	EACH	\$ 4,244.00	R.A.B.
	ITEM #3: Pole Vault Standards. Adjustable from 8'-17'. UCS Spirit #510-0817 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
44								
45	WCSO Index #4250							
46	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
47	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics	GA77100	\$ 2,582.59	1	EACH	\$ 2,582.59	
48	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #510-0817		\$ 9,573.00	1	EACH	\$ 9,573.00	
49	MFAC, LLC	First Place Premier PV *\$25 minimum order	5806-04	\$ 1,525.00	1	EACH	\$ 1,525.00	*
50	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
51	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #510-0817	510-0817	\$ 6,423.00	1	EACH	\$ 6,423.00	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
52	ITEM #4: Crossbar, Pole Vault. UCS Spirit #755-133 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
53	WCSD Index #4261							
54	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
55	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics Only sold in sets of 3	AFPV1503	\$ 144.22	2	EACH	\$ 288.44	N.A.S.
56	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #755-133		\$ 137.00	2		\$ 274.00	
57	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #755133 *\$25 minimum order	5884-01	\$ 240.00	2		\$ 480.00	
58	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	2	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
59	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #755-133	755-133	\$ 91.00	2	EACH	\$ 182.00	*
60	ITEM #5: Pole Vault Box Collar System, NCAA/NFHS Legal. UCS Spirit #503-6100 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
61	WCSD Index #4253							
62	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
63	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics	1388862	\$ 388.91	1	EACH	\$ 388.91	*
64	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #503-6100		\$ 1,075.00	1	EACH	\$ 1,075.00	
65	MFAC, LLC	Gill 719 *\$25 minimum order	5835-01	\$ 970.00	1	EACH	\$ 970.00	
66	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
67	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #503-6100	503-6100	\$ 847.00	1	EACH	\$ 847.00	
68	ITEM #6: High Jump Pit - 24' 4"x 12' x 28", 2" Top Pad Constructed of Breathable Fabric, Sides and Bottoms Constructed of Vinyl Material. Must conform to NCAA requirements. UCS Spirit #1360 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
69	WCSD Index #4254							
70	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
71	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics #AGX M4 HJ Landing System 27'2" x 13'2" x 28"	GA64817CXXYY	\$ 19,296.09	1	EACH	\$ 19,296.09	N.A.S.
72	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #1360		\$ 19,590.00	1	EACH	\$ 19,590.00	
73	MFAC, LLC	First Place Premier HJ Pit *\$25 minimum order	5913	\$ 10,595.00	1	EACH	\$ 10,595.00	*
74	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
75	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #1360	1360	\$ 13,200.00	1	EACH	\$ 13,200.00	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
	ITEM #7: Weather Cover for 24' 4"x 12' x 28" High Jump Pit. UCS Spirit #1365 or EQUAL							
76	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
77	WCSD Index #4255							
78	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
79	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics Cover for Item #6 (27'2" x13'2" X 28" Landing System)	GA6481702CXX	\$ 2,148.38	1	EACH	\$ 2,148.38	R.A.B.
80	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #1365		\$ 1,751.00	1	EACH	\$ 1,751.00	R.A.B.
81	MFAC, LLC	First Place Premier HJ Pit *\$25 minimum order	5913-WC	\$ 1,225.00	1	EACH	\$ 1,225.00	R.A.B.
82	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	R.A.B.
83	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #1365	1365	\$ 1,225.00	1	EACH	\$ 1,225.00	R.A.B.
	ITEM #8: High Jump Standards, Pair. Adjustable from 3' - 8'5" (91.44cm - 2.56m). UCS Spirit #510-8601 or EQUAL							
84	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
85	WCSD Index #4262							
86	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER PAIR	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
87	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics #Gill G4 HJ Standards 2'8"-8'4"	GA782000	\$ 1,860.12	1	PAIR	\$ 1,860.12	N.A.S.
88	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #510-8601		\$ 2,430.00	1	PAIR	\$ 2,430.00	
89	MFAC, LLC	First Place Premier HJ Pit *\$25 minimum order	5871-01	\$ 1,082.00	1	PAIR	\$ 1,082.00	*
90	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	PAIR	\$ -	N.B.
91	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #510-8601	510-8601	\$ 1,791.00	1	PAIR	\$ 1,791.00	
	ITEM #9: High Jump Crossbar UCS Spirit #755-132 or EQUAL							
92	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
93	WCSD Index #4263							
94	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
95	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics *Sold in sets of 3 only	AFHJ1503	\$ 144.22	2	EACH	\$ 288.44	N.A.S.
96	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #755-132		\$ 137.00	2	EACH	\$ 274.00	
97	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit 755132 *\$25 minimum order	5884-02	\$ 250.00	2	EACH	\$ 500.00	
98	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	2	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
99	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #755-132	755-132	\$ 91.00	2	EACH	\$ 182.00	*

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
100	ITEM #10: Bungee Crossbars for Pole Vault and/or High Jump. UCS Spirit #755-BNGEE or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
101	WCSD Index #4282							
102	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
103	BSN Sports, LLC	BSN Sports	AFR050BM	\$ 12.88	2	EACH	\$ 25.76	*
104	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #755-BNGEE		\$ 68.00	2	EACH	\$ 136.00	
105	MFAC, LLC	First Place 5883-01 *\$25 minimum order	5883-01	\$ 25.00	2	EACH	\$ 50.00	
106	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	2	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
107	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #755-BNGEE	755-BNGEE	\$ 55.00	2	EACH	\$ 110.00	
108	ITEM #11: Crossbar Lifter, Telescoping, Pair. UCS Spirit #755-LFTR or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
109	WCSD Index #4283							
110	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER PAIR	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
111	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics Priced and sold individually	GA950	\$ 173.06	1	PAIR	\$ 173.06	N.A.S.
112	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #755-LFTR		\$ 440.00	1	PAIR	\$ 440.00	
113	MFAC, LLC	Gill 950 Priced as each *\$25 minimum order	950	\$ 168.00	1	PAIR	\$ 168.00	N.A.S.
114	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	PAIR	\$ -	N.B.
115	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #755-LFTR	755-LFTR	\$ 321.00	1	PAIR	\$ 321.00	*
116	ITEM #12: Pit Cart, 4' x 8', Aluminum. UCS Spirit #526-3048 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
117	WCSD Index #4259							
118	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
119	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics 5' x 10' pit cart	GA768	\$ 3,353.94	1	EACH	\$ 3,353.94	N.A.S.
120	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #526-3048		\$ 4,700.00	1	EACH	\$ 4,700.00	
121	MFAC, LLC	First Place 5890-08 *\$25 minimum order	5890-08	\$ 2,095.00	1	EACH	\$ 2,095.00	*
122	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
123	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #526-3048	526-3048	\$ 3,874.00	1	EACH	\$ 3,874.00	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
124	ITEM #13: Cart, Combo. Holds 12 Shots and 18 Discus. UCS Spirit #526-4600 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
125	WCS D Index #4257							
126	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
127	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics Gill Intl Shot/Discus Cart	GA733100	\$ 2,249.94	1	EACH	\$ 2,249.94	
128	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #526-4600		\$ 1,700.00	1	EACH	\$ 1,700.00	
129	MFAC, LLC	First Place 6083-01 *\$25 minimum order	6083-01	\$ 1,040.00	1	EACH	\$ 1,040.00	*
130	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
131	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #526-4600	526-4600	\$ 1,192.00	1	EACH	\$ 1,192.00	
132	ITEM #14: Iron Shot Put 4k UCS Spirit or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
133	WCS D Index #4264							
134	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
135	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics	GA3394	\$ 31.67	2	EACH	\$ 63.34	*
136	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 65.00	2	EACH	\$ 130.00	NO SPEC
137	MFAC, LLC	First Place 6031-4.0 *\$25 minimum order	6031-4.0	\$ 36.00	2	EACH	\$ 72.00	
138	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	2	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
139	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #721-6040	721-6040	\$ 59.00	2	EACH	\$ 118.00	
140	ITEM #15: Shot Put, Iron, 12 Lbs. UCS Spirit #721-6012 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
141	WCS D Index #4268							
142	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
143	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics	GA3312	\$ 41.58	4	EACH	\$ 166.32	*
144	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #721-6012		\$ 80.00	4	EACH	\$ 320.00	
145	MFAC, LLC	First Place 6031-12 *\$25 minimum order	6031-12	\$ 44.00	4	EACH	\$ 176.00	
146	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	4	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
147	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #721-6012	721-6012	\$ 75.00	4	EACH	\$ 300.00	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
	ITEM #16: Shot Put, Iron, 10 Lbs. UCS Spirit #721-6045 or EQUAL							
148	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
149	WCSD Index #4269							
150	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
151	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics	GA3310	\$ 28.38	4	EACH	\$ 113.52	*
152	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #721-6045		\$ 80.00	4	EACH	\$ 320.00	
153	MFAC, LLC	First Place 6031-10 *\$25 minimum order	6031-10	\$ 44.00	4	EACH	\$ 176.00	
154	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	4	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
155	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #721-6045	721-6045	\$ 75.00	4	EACH	\$ 300.00	
	ITEM #17: Discus, 1 K Blue Flyer. UCS Spirit #720-3100 or EQUAL							
156	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
157	WCSD Index #4273							
158	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
159	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics Gill S Series	GA77510	\$ 87.90	4	EACH	\$ 351.60	
160	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #720-3100		\$ 350.00	4	EACH	\$ 1,400.00	
161	MFAC, LLC	First Place Aerosphere Blue *\$25 minimum order	6121-1.0	\$ 64.00	4	EACH	\$ 256.00	*
162	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	4	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
163	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #720-3100	720-3100	\$ 241.00	4	EACH	\$ 964.00	
	ITEM #18: Discus, 1.6 K Blue Flyer. UCS Spirit #720-3160 or EQUAL							
164	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
165	WCSD Index #4274							
166	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
167	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics Gill S Series	GA77516	\$ 103.27	4	EACH	\$ 413.08	
168	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirt #720-3160		\$ 380.00	4	EACH	\$ 1,520.00	
169	MFAC, LLC	First Place Aerosphere Blue *\$25 minimum order	6121-1.6	\$ 73.00	4	EACH	\$ 292.00	*
170	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	4	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
171	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #720-3160	720-3160	\$ 259.00	4	EACH	\$ 1,036.00	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
	ITEM #19: Discus Bag. UCS Spirit #721-6141 or EQUAL							
172	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
173	WCS D Index #4276							
174	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
175	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics	GA931	\$ 21.32	5	EACH	\$ 106.60	
176	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #721-6141		\$ 56.00	5	EACH	\$ 280.00	
177	MFAC, LLC	First Place 6081-1.1 *\$25 minimum order	6081-1.1	\$ 16.00	5	EACH	\$ 80.00	
178	Pyramid School Products	CHAMPION #SD10 Minimum Order is 5 each	SD10	\$ 10.99	5	EACH	\$ 54.95	*
179	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #721-6141	721-6141	\$ 62.00	5	EACH	\$ 310.00	
	ITEM #20: Shot Put Bag. UCS Spirit #721-6151 or EQUAL							
180	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
181	WCS D Index #4275							
182	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
183	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics	GA929	\$ 22.83	5	EACH	\$ 114.15	
184	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #721-6151		\$ 56.00	5	EACH	\$ 280.00	
185	MFAC, LLC	First Place 6082-01 *\$25 minimum order	6082-01	\$ 21.00	5	EACH	\$ 105.00	
186	Pyramid School Products	CHAMPION #SD10 Minimum Order is 5 each	SD10	\$ 10.99	5	EACH	\$ 54.95	*
187	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #721-6151	721-6151	\$ 62.00	5	EACH	\$ 310.00	
	ITEM #21: Throw Markers, Metal, Set of 12. UCS Spirit #99MF-607799 or EQUAL							
188	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
189	WCS D Index #4270							
190	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
191	BSN Sports, LLC			\$ -	4	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
192	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #99MF-607799		\$ 54.00	4	EACH	\$ 216.00	
193	MFAC, LLC	First Place 6077-99 *\$25 minimum order	6077-99	\$ 20.00	4	EACH	\$ 80.00	*
194	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	4	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
195	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #99MF-607799	99MF-607799	\$ 56.00	4	EACH	\$ 224.00	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
	ITEM #22: Measuring Wheel, Professional, Electronic. UCS Spirit #528-4400 or EQUAL							
196	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
197	WCS D Index #4260							
198	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
199	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics	GA9701	\$ 347.60	1	EACH	\$ 347.60	
200	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #528-4400		\$ 250.00	1	EACH	\$ 250.00	
201	MFAC, LLC	Keson MP401E *\$25 minimum order	7005-01	\$ 260.00	1	EACH	\$ 260.00	
202	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
203	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #528-4400	528-4400	\$ 206.00	1	EACH	\$ 206.00	*
	ITEM #23: Measuring Tape, Open Reel, Fiberglass 90m/300'. UCS Spirit #528-2090 or EQUAL							
204	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
205	WCS D Index #4258							
206	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
207	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics	GA988	\$ 54.79	1	EACH	\$ 54.79	
208	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS #528-209		\$ 235.00	1	EACH	\$ 235.00	
209	MFAC, LLC	Keson OTR18M300 *\$25 minimum order	7013-330	\$ 131.00	1	EACH	\$ 131.00	
210	Pyramid School Products	CHAMPION #R300	R300	\$ 21.99	1	EACH	\$ 21.99	*
211	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #528-2090	528-2090	\$ 165.00	1	EACH	\$ 165.00	
	ITEM #24: Measuring Tape, Open Reel, Fiberglass, 60m/200'. UCS Spirit #528-2060 or EQUAL							
212	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
213	WCS D Index #4267							
214	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
215	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics	GA986	\$ 37.19	2	EACH	\$ 74.38	
216	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #528-2060		\$ 172.00	2	EACH	\$ 344.00	
217	MFAC, LLC	Keson OTR18M300 *\$25 minimum order	7013-200	\$ 104.00	2	EACH	\$ 208.00	
218	Pyramid School Products	CHAMPION #R200	R200	\$ 20.99	2	EACH	\$ 41.98	*
219	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #528-2060	528-2060	\$ 123.00	2	EACH	\$ 246.00	
	ITEM #25: Measuring Tape, Open Reel, Fiberglass, 30m/100'. UCS Spirit #528-2030 or EQUAL							
220	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
221	WCS D Index #4271							
222	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
223	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics	GA985	\$ 25.41	2	EACH	\$ 50.82	
224	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #528-2030		\$ 81.00	2	EACH	\$ 162.00	
225	MFAC, LLC	Keson OTR18M100 *\$25 minimum order	7013-100	\$ 47.00	2	EACH	\$ 94.00	
226	Pyramid School Products	CHAMPION #R100	R100	\$ 12.99	2	EACH	\$ 25.98	*
227	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #528-2030	528-2030	\$ 66.00	2	EACH	\$ 132.00	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
	ITEM #26: Relay Batons, Set of 12. UCS Spirit #569-3700 or EQUAL							
228	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
229	WCS D Index #4266							
230	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
231	BSN Sports, LLC	BSN Sports *Please specify color (Set of 12)	AALBAT	\$ 19.68	2	EACH	\$ 39.36	*
232	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #569-3700		\$ 248.00	2	EACH	\$ 496.00	
233	MFAC, LLC	First Place 7043-Color *\$25 minimum order	7043-Color	\$ 42.00	2	EACH	\$ 84.00	
234	Pyramid School Products	CHAMPION #RB-12 (Set of 12)	RB-12	\$ 35.88	2	EACH	\$ 71.76	
235	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #569-3700 (Set of 12)	569-3700	\$ 170.00	2	EACH	\$ 340.00	
	ITEM #27: Starting Block, All American. UCS Spirit #715-1515 or EQUAL							
236	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
237	WCS D Index #4278							
238	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
239	BSN Sports, LLC	Portapit	ASB4500X	\$ 102.77	8	EACH	\$ 822.16	*
240	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #715-1515		\$ 258.00	8	EACH	\$ 2,064.00	
241	MFAC, LLC	Carlton Rocket 6633-01 *\$25 minimum order	6633-01	\$ 192.00	8	EACH	\$ 1,536.00	
242	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	8	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
243	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #715-1515	715-1515	\$ 197.00	8	EACH	\$ 1,576.00	
	ITEM #28: Stopwatch. Robic #SC505W or EQUAL							
244	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
245	WCS D Index #4277							
246	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
247	BSN Sports, LLC	Robic	MSSTP505	\$ 26.48	8	EACH	\$ 211.84	
248	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Robic SC505W		\$ 68.00	8	EACH	\$ 544.00	
249	MFAC, LLC	Robic SC505W *\$25 minimum order	7417-Color	\$ 28.00	8	EACH	\$ 224.00	
250	Pyramid School Products	ROBIC #SC505W Minimum order is 8	SC505W	\$ 20.99	8	EACH	\$ 167.92	*
251	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	ROBIC #SC505W	SC505W	\$ 56.00	8	EACH	\$ 448.00	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
	ITEM #29: Blanks for Starter Device, .32. UCS Spirit #569-7110 or EQUAL							
252	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
253	WCSD Index #4272							
254	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
255	BSN Sports, LLC			\$ -	4	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
256	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #569-7110		\$ 168.00	4	EACH	\$ 672.00	
257	MFAC, LLC	Winchester 6645-32 *\$25 minimum order	6645-32	\$ 109.00	4	EACH	\$ 436.00	*
258	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	4	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
259	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #569-7110	569-7110	\$ 160.00	4	EACH	\$ 640.00	
	ITEM #30: Field Rake, 36" Width, Aluminum. UCS Spirit #569-1910 or EQUAL							
260	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
261	WCSD Index #4265							
262	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
263	BSN Sports, LLC	BSN Sports	1196245	\$ 36.41	2	EACH	\$ 72.82	*
264	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #569-1910		\$ 251.00	2	EACH	\$ 502.00	
265	MFAC, LLC	First Place 7027-36 *\$25 minimum order	7027-36	\$ 80.00	2	EACH	\$ 160.00	
266	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	2	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
267	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #569-1910	569-1910	\$ 177.00	2	EACH	\$ 354.00	
	ITEM #31: Megaphone. UCS Spirit #99MF-7045-01 or EQUAL							
268	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
269	WCSD Index #4256							
270	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
271	BSN Sports, LLC			\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
272	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	SPirit#99MF-7045-01		\$ 200.00	1	EACH	\$ 200.00	
273	MFAC, LLC	Champion 7045-01 *\$25 minimum order	7045-01	\$ 106.00	1	EACH	\$ 106.00	*
274	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
275	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #99MF-7045-01	99MF-7045-01	\$ 189.00	1	EACH	\$ 189.00	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
276	ITEM #32: Official's Flag, Red. UCS Spirit #569-2360 or EQUAL							
277	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
278	WCS D Index #4279							
279	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
280	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics Red/White	GA730271	\$ 18.84	5	EACH	\$ 94.20	N.A.S.
281	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	Spirit#569-2360		\$ 42.00	5	EACH	\$ 210.00	
282	MFAC, LLC	First Place 7026-Red	7026-Red	\$ 14.00	5	EACH	\$ 70.00	*
283	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	5	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
284	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #569-2360	569-2360	\$ 45.00	5	EACH	\$ 225.00	
285	ITEM #33: Official's Flag, White. UCS Spirit #569-2362 or EQUAL							
286	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
287	WCS D Index #4280							
288	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
289	BSN Sports, LLC			\$ -	10	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
290	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	Spirit #569-2362		\$ 42.00	10	EACH	\$ 420.00	
291	MFAC, LLC	First Place 7026-White	7026-White	\$ 14.00	10	EACH	\$ 140.00	*
292	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	10	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
293	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #569-2362	569-2362	\$ 45.00	10	EACH	\$ 450.00	
294	ITEM #34: Official's Flag, Yellow. UCS Spirit #569-2361 or EQUAL							
295	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
296	WCS D Index #4281							
297	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
298	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletics Yellow/White	GA730271	\$ 18.84	10	EACH	\$ 188.40	N.A.S.
299	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	Spirit #569-2361		\$ 42.00	10	EACH	\$ 420.00	
300	MFAC, LLC	First Place 7026-Yellow	7026-Yellow	\$ 14.00	10	EACH	\$ 140.00	*
301	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	10	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
302	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS INC #569-2361	569-2361	\$ 45.00	10	EACH	\$ 450.00	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
300	VAULTING POLES							
	ITEM #35: Vaulting Pole 10'8" 110lbs. UCS Spirit or EQUAL							
301	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
302	WCS D Index #4225							
303	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
304	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 10'6"	GA532550	\$ 391.80	1	EACH	\$ 391.80	N.A.S.
305	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 643.00	1	EACH	\$ 643.00	NO SPEC
306	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit 325/50 *\$25 minimum order	5000-108-110	\$ 562.00	1	EACH	\$ 562.00	
307	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
308	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #325/50	325/50	\$ 417.00	1	EACH	\$ 417.00	*
	ITEM #36: Vaulting Pole 10'8" 120lbs UCS Spirit or EQUAL							
309	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
310	WCS D Index #4226							
311	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
312	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 10'6"	GA532554	\$ 391.80	1	EACH	\$ 391.80	N.A.S.
313	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 643.00	1	EACH	\$ 643.00	NO SPEC
314	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #325/54 *\$25 minimum order	5000-108-130	\$ 562.00	1	EACH	\$ 562.00	
315	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
316	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #325/54	325/54	\$ 417.00	1	EACH	\$ 417.00	*
	ITEM #37: Vaulting Pole 10'8" 130lbs UCS Spirit or EQUAL							
317	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
318	WCS D Index #4227							
319	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
320	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 10'6"	GA532559	\$ 391.80	1	EACH	\$ 391.80	N.A.S.
321	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 643.00	1	EACH	\$ 643.00	NO SPEC
322	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #325/59 *\$25 minimum order	5000-108-130	\$ 562.00	1	EACH	\$ 562.00	
323	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
324	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #325/59	325/59	\$ 417.00	1	EACH	\$ 417.00	*

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
	ITEM #38: Vaulting Pole 11'6" 110lbs UCS Spirit or EQUAL							
325	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
326	WCSO Index #4228							
327	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
328	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 11'6"	GA535550	\$ 429.71	1	EACH	\$ 429.71	*
329	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 692.00	1	EACH	\$ 692.00	NO SPEC
330	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #350/50 *\$25 minimum order	5000-116-110	\$ 594.00	1	EACH	\$ 594.00	
331	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
332	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #350/50	350/50	\$ 449.00	1	EACH	\$ 449.00	
	ITEM #39: Vaulting Pole 11'6" 120lbs UCS Spirit or EQUAL							
333	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
334	WCSO Index #4229							
335	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
336	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 11'6"	GA535554	\$ 429.71	1	EACH	\$ 429.71	*
337	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 692.00	1	EACH	\$ 692.00	NO SPEC
338	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #350/54 *\$25 minimum order	5000-116-120	\$ 594.00	1	EACH	\$ 594.00	
339	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
340	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #350/54	350/54	\$ 449.00	1	EACH	\$ 449.00	
	ITEM #40: Vaulting Pole 11'6" 130lbs UCS Spirit or EQUAL							
341	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
342	WCSO Index #4230							
343	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
344	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 11'6"	GA535559	\$ 429.71	1	EACH	\$ 429.71	*
345	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 692.00	1	EACH	\$ 692.00	NO SPEC
346	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #350/59 *\$25 minimum order	5000-116-130	\$ 594.00	1	EACH	\$ 594.00	
347	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
348	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #350/59	350/59	\$ 449.00	1	EACH	\$ 449.00	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
	ITEM #41: Vaulting Pole 11'6" 140lbs UCS Spirit or EQUAL							
349	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
350	WCSD Index #4231							
351	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
352	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 11'6"	GA535563	\$ 429.71	1	EACH	\$ 429.71	*
353	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 962.00	1	EACH	\$ 962.00	NO SPEC
354	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #350/63 *\$25 minimum order	5000-116-140	\$ 594.00	1	EACH	\$ 594.00	
355	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
356	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #350/63	350/63	\$ 449.00	1	EACH	\$ 449.00	
	ITEM #42: Vaulting Pole 12'1" 120lbs UCS Spirit or EQUAL							
357	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
358	WCSD Index #4232							
359	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
360	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 12'	GA536054	\$ 442.19	1	EACH	\$ 442.19	N.A.S.
361	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 765.00	1	EACH	\$ 765.00	NO SPEC
362	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #370/54 *\$25 minimum order	5000-121-120	\$ 642.00	1	EACH	\$ 642.00	
363	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
364	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #370/54	370/54	\$ 497.00	1	EACH	\$ 497.00	*
	ITEM #43: Vaulting Pole 12'1" 130lbs UCS Spirit or EQUAL							
365	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
366	WCSD Index #4233							
367	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
368	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 12'	GA536059	\$ 442.19	1	EACH	\$ 442.19	N.A.S.
369	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 765.00	1	EACH	\$ 765.00	NO SPEC
370	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #370/59 *\$25 minimum order	5000-121-130	\$ 642.00	1	EACH	\$ 642.00	
371	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
372	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #370/59	370/59	\$ 497.00	1	EACH	\$ 497.00	*

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
373	ITEM #44: Vaulting Pole 12'1" 140lbs UCS Spirit or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
374	WCS D Index #4234							
375	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
376	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 12'	GA536063	\$ 442.19	1	EACH	\$ 442.19	N.A.S.
377	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 765.00	1	EACH	\$ 765.00	NO SPEC
378	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #370/63 *\$25 minimum order	5000-121-140	\$ 642.00	1	EACH	\$ 642.00	
379	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
380	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #370/63	370/63	\$ 497.00	1	EACH	\$ 497.00	*
381	ITEM #45: Vaulting Pole 12'1" 150lbs UCS Spirit or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
382	WCS D Index #4235							
383	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
384	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 12'	GA536068	\$ 442.19	1	EACH	\$ 442.19	N.A.S.
385	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 765.00	1	EACH	\$ 765.00	NO SPEC
386	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #370/68 *\$25 minimum order	5000-121-150	\$ 642.00	1	EACH	\$ 642.00	
387	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
388	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #370/68	370/68	\$ 497.00	1	EACH	\$ 497.00	*
389	ITEM #46: Vaulting Pole 12'1" 160lbs UCS Spirit or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
390	WCS D Index #4236							
391	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
392	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 12'	GA536073	\$ 442.19	1	EACH	\$ 442.19	N.A.S.
393	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS		\$ 765.00	1	EACH	\$ 765.00	NO SPEC
394	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #370/73 *\$25 minimum order	5000-121-160	\$ 642.00	1	EACH	\$ 642.00	
395	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
396	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #370/73	370/73	\$ 497.00	1	EACH	\$ 497.00	*

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
397	ITEM #47: Vaulting Pole, 12'1", 170lbs. UCS Spirit #370/77 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
398	WCS D Index #4237							
399	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
400	BSN Sports, LLC			\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
401	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #370/77		\$ 765.00	1	EACH	\$ 765.00	
402	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #370/77						
403	Pyramid School Products	*\$25 minimum order	5000-121-170	\$ 642.00	1	EACH	\$ 642.00	
404	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #370/77	370/77	\$ 497.00	1	EACH	\$ 497.00	*
405	ITEM #48: Vaulting Pole, 13'1", 140lbs. UCS Spirit #400/63 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
406	WCS D Index #4238							
407	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
408	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 13'	GA540063	\$ 487.78	1	EACH	\$ 487.78	N.A.S.
409	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #400/63		\$ 865.00	1	EACH	\$ 865.00	
410	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #400/63						
411	Pyramid School Products	*\$25 minimum order	5000-131-140	\$ 706.00	1	EACH	\$ 706.00	
412	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #400/63	400/63	\$ 561.00	1	EACH	\$ 561.00	*
413	ITEM #49: Vaulting Pole, 13'1", 145lbs. UCS Spirit #400/66 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
414	WCS D Index #4239							
415	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
416	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 13'	GA540068	\$ 487.78	1	EACH	\$ 487.78	N.A.S.
417	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #400/66		\$ 865.00	1	EACH	\$ 865.00	
418	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #400/66						
419	Pyramid School Products	*\$25 minimum order	5000-131-145	\$ 706.00	1	EACH	\$ 706.00	
420	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #400/66	400/66	\$ 561.00	1	EACH	\$ 561.00	*

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
421	ITEM #50: Vaulting Pole, 13'1", 150lbs. UCS Spirit #400/68 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
422	WCS D Index #4240							
423	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
424	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 13'	GA540068	\$ 487.78	1	EACH	\$ 487.78	N.A.S.
425	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #400/68		\$ 865.00	1	EACH	\$ 865.00	
426	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #400/68 *\$25 minimum order	5000-131-150	\$ 706.00	1	EACH	\$ 706.00	
427	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
428	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #400/68	400/68	\$ 561.00	1	EACH	\$ 561.00	*
429	ITEM #51: Vaulting Pole, 13'1", 155lbs. UCS Spirit #400/70 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
430	WCS D Index #4241							
431	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
432	BSN Sports, LLC			\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
433	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #400/70		\$ 865.00	1	EACH	\$ 865.00	
434	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #400/70 *\$25 minimum order	5000-131-155	\$ 706.00	1	EACH	\$ 706.00	
435	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
436	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #400/70	400/70	\$ 561.00	1	EACH	\$ 561.00	*
437	ITEM #52: Vaulting Pole, 13'1", 160lbs. UCS Spirit #400/73 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
438	WCS D Index #4242							
439	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
440	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 13'	GA540073	\$ 487.78	1	EACH	\$ 487.78	N.A.S.
441	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #400/73		\$ 865.00	1	EACH	\$ 865.00	
442	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #400/73 *\$25 minimum order	500-131-160	\$ 706.00	1	EACH	\$ 706.00	
443	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
444	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #400/73	400/73	\$ 561.00	1	EACH	\$ 561.00	*

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
	ITEM #53: Vaulting Pole, 13'1", 165lbs. UCS Spirit #400/75 or EQUAL							
445	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
446	WCS D Index #4243							
447	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
448	BSN Sports, LLC			\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
449	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #400/75		\$ 865.00	1	EACH	\$ 865.00	
450	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #400/75						
451	Pyramid School Products	*\$25 minimum order	5000-131-165	\$ 706.00	1	EACH	\$ 706.00	
452	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #400/75	400/75	\$ 561.00	1	EACH	\$ 561.00	*
	ITEM #54: Vaulting Pole, 13'1", 170lbs. UCS Spirit #400/77 or EQUAL							
453	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
454	WCS D Index #4244							
455	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
456	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 13'	GA540077	\$ 487.78	1	EACH	\$ 487.78	N.A.S.
457	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #400/77		\$ 865.00	1	EACH	\$ 865.00	
458	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #400/77						
459	Pyramid School Products	*\$25 minimum order	5000-131-170	\$ 706.00	1	EACH	\$ 706.00	
460	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #400/77	400/77	\$ 561.00	1	EACH	\$ 561.00	*
	ITEM #55: Vaulting Pole, 13'7", 160lbs. UCS Spirit #415/73 or EQUAL							
461	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
462	WCS D Index #4245							
463	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
464	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 13'6"	GA741573	\$ 700.02	1	EACH	\$ 700.02	N.A.S.
465	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #415/73		\$ 930.00	1	EACH	\$ 930.00	
466	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #415/73						
467	Pyramid School Products	*\$25 minimum order	5000-137-160	\$ 746.00	1	EACH	\$ 746.00	
468	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #415/73	415/73	\$ 601.00	1	EACH	\$ 601.00	*

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
469	ITEM #56: Vaulting Pole, 13'7", 165lbs. UCS Spirit #415/75 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
470	WCS D Index #4246							
471	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
472	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 13'6"	GA741575	\$ 700.02	1	EACH	\$ 700.02	N.A.S.
473	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #415/75		\$ 930.00	1	EACH	\$ 930.00	
474	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #415/75 *\$25 minimum order	5000-137-165	\$ 746.00	1	EACH	\$ 746.00	
475	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
476	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #415/75	415/75	\$ 601.00	1	EACH	\$ 601.00	*
477	ITEM #57: Vaulting Pole, 14'1", 165lbs. UCS Spirit #430/75 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
478	WCS D Index #4247							
479	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
480	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 14'	GA742575	\$ 717.90	2	EACH	\$ 1,435.80	N.A.S.
481	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #430/75		\$ 990.00	2	EACH	\$ 1,980.00	
482	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #430/75 *\$25 minimum order	5000-141-165	\$ 786.00	2	EACH	\$ 1,572.00	
483	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	2	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
484	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #430/75	430/75	\$ 641.00	2	EACH	\$ 1,282.00	*
485	ITEM #58: Vaulting Pole, 14'1", 170lbs. UCS Spirit #430/77 or EQUAL IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
486	WCS D Index #4248							
487	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
488	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 14'	GA742577	\$ 717.90	1	EACH	\$ 717.90	N.A.S.
489	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #430/77		\$ 990.00	1	EACH	\$ 990.00	
490	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #430/77 *\$25 minimum order	5000-141-170	\$ 786.00	1	EACH	\$ 786.00	
491	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
492	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #430/77	430/77	\$ 641.00	1	EACH	\$ 641.00	*

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
	ITEM #59: Vaulting Pole, 14'1", 175lbs. UCS Spirit #430/80 or EQUAL							
493	IF SUBMITTING PRICING FOR AN "EQUAL" PRODUCT, THEN SPECIFICATIONS ARE REQUIRED							
494	WCSD Index #4249							
495	VENDOR NAME	MFG. NAME & MODEL #	VENDOR STOCK/PRODUCT #	COST PER EACH	ESTIMATED QTY	UNIT OF MEASURE	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
496	BSN Sports, LLC	Gill Athletic Gill Pacer Advantage 14'	GA742580	\$ 717.90	1	EACH	\$ 717.90	N.A.S.
497	Central Valley Office Supply, LLC	UCS Spirit #430/80		\$ 990.00	1	EACH	\$ 990.00	
498	MFAC, LLC	UCS/Spirit #430/80 *\$25 minimum order	5000-141-175	\$ 786.00	1	EACH	\$ 786.00	
499	Pyramid School Products	NO BID		\$ -	1	EACH	\$ -	N.B.
500	United Canvas & Sling, Inc, dba UCS, Inc	UCS/Spirit #430/80	430/80	\$ 641.00	1	EACH	\$ 641.00	*