



Washoe County School District

Purchasing Department • 14101 Old Virginia Road • Reno, NV 89521
Phone (775) 850-8025 • Fax (775) 857-3175

March 26, 2025

TO:

ODP Business Solutions, LLC

Pyramid School Products

School Specialty, LLC

Staples Contract & Commercial

RE: Request for Formal Quote ~ Recommendation of Award (ROA)

For the Request for Formal Quote for Classroom Paper, RFQ #97-QF-01-25-GS, Washoe County School District's (WCSD) Purchasing Department is recommending award for an initial one (1) year term beginning April 4, 2025 and expiring on April 3, 2026 to:

STAPLES CONTRACT & COMMERCIAL

A copy of the ROA Tabulation is attached for reference and is also available online at: <https://solicitations.washoeschools.net/Purchasing/Default?ProjectID=4803>

This memo serves as formal notification that the public review of the ROA Tabulation period has commenced and will close on April 2, 2025 at 4:30 pm (local time). The anticipated award of this solicitation is April 3, 2025 with the posting and distribution of the official Notice of Award following shortly thereafter.

Please submit any inquiries or questions regarding this ROA memo in writing to: solicitations@washoeschools.net.

Thank you for your interest in doing business with WCSD.

WCSD Purchasing Department

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SOLICITATION TITLE: CLASSROOM PAPER
SOLICITATION #: 97-QF-01-25-GS
RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD - ROA TABULATION
ITEM EVALUATION KEY:
R.A.B. REJECT ALL BIDS **D.M.O.** DECLINED MINIMUM ORDER

I.S. INSUFFICIENT SPECS **NO SPEC.** NO SPECIFICATIONS

N.C. NO CHARGE **NO SUB.** NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED

S.R.L SAMPLE RECEIVED LATE **S.R.** SAMPLE REJECTED

N.L.A NO LONGER AVAILABLE **N.S.R.** NO SAMPLE RECEIVED

N.A.S. NOT AS SPECIFIED

N.B. NO BID **R.O.A.** RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD

N.C. NO CHARGE **R.O.A.T.** TIED / CHOSEN BY LOTTERY

**BUYER HAS REVIEWED AND
APPROVED:**
DATE:
March 26, 2025

SURETY REQUIRED: NO
PUBLIC REVIEW PERIOD CLOSING AT 4:30 PM (LOCAL TIME) ON: April 2, 2025
SUMMARY OF RESULTS AND TOTAL COST REPORT

VENDOR NAME	LOW BID BY ITEM NUMBER(S)	LOW ITEM BID TOTAL
ODP Business Solutions, LLC		\$0.00
Pyramid School Products		\$0.00
School Specialty, LLC		\$0.00
Staples Contract & Commercial	1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20 21 22	\$22,590.52
ESTIMATED TOTAL CONTRACT VALUE =		\$22,590.52

BASIS OF AWARD: Per Section 11, This RFQ will be awarded on an ALL OR NOTHING basis to the lowest priced, responsive, and responsible Vendor.

ITEM #1 Paper, Binder, White (3/8" Ruled, Both Sides) 3 Hole, Sub 16, 8-1/2" x 11". Pacon 2402, APC 130P, or EQUAL

SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL

(WCSD #611/3790)

VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	43500-10	337998		1425	\$ 2.88	\$ 4,104.000	N.S.R
Pyramid School Products	APC 130P	APC 130P	10 REAMS/CS FULL CASES	1425	\$ 3.69	\$ 5,258.250	
School Specialty, LLC	APC 130P	245332	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	1425	\$ 4.07	\$ 5,799.750	
Staples Contract & Commercial	PACON P2402		\$2500 MIN COMBINED PACON ORDER / FULL CASES / ONLY 10/CS	1425	\$ 3.55	\$ 5,058.750	R.O.A.

ITEM #2 Paper, Binder, Yellow (3/8" Ruled, Both Sides), Sub 16, 8-1/2" x 11" with Margin. APC 130CS, School Smart 085423, or EQUAL

SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL

(WCSD #611/3800)

VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			75		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC 130CS *SPECIAL RULING*	APC 130CS	80 REAMS / 10REAMS PER CS	75	\$ 7.49	\$ 561.750	
School Specialty, LLC	SCHOOL SMART BY APC 085423	085423	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	75	\$ 12.29	\$ 921.750	
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC 130CS		\$3000 MIN COMBINED APC ORDER 10CS MIN / 8/CS	75	\$ 11.89	\$ 891.750	R.O.A.

EXHIBIT C

PRICE SCHEDULE/SPEC SHEET (REQUIRED FORM)

ITEM #3 Paper, Butcher, White, 30" x 1000', 50 lb. Basis. APC 5030WK or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/3810)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (ROLLS)	COST PER ROLL	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			18		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC 5030WK	APC 5030WK		18	\$ 46.79	\$ 842.220	
School Specialty, LLC	SCHOOL SMART BY APC 5036WK	086654	APC MIN ORDER \$6000 \$3000 MIN COMBINED APC ORDER	18	\$ 46.95	\$ 845.100	
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC 5030WK			18	\$ 42.51	\$ 765.180	R.O.A.
ITEM #4 Paper, Chart, White, 24" x 36", w/Blue Lines, 16 lb. Basis, 1-1/2" x 3/4" x 1-1/2" Skip, SW, Alt. Dark & Light. APC ARS2404 or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/3820)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			60		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC ARS2404 SPECIAL RULING	APC ARS2404 SPECIAL RULING	60 REAMS / 2 CS	60	\$ 43.95	\$ 2,637.000	
School Specialty, LLC	APC ARS2404	ARS2404	APC MIN ORDER \$6000 \$3000 MIN COMBINED APC ORDER / 60 REAM MIN - 2/CS	60	\$ 46.95	\$ 2,817.000	
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC ARS2404			60	\$ 42.51	\$ 2,550.600	R.O.A.
ITEM #5 Paper, Chart, White, 24" x 32", Plain, 2-Hole Punched, 25 Sheets/Pad. APC APS24P or EQUAL (NO SPIRALS)							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/3821)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (PADS)	COST PER PAD	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			188		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC APS24P	APC APS24P	12/CS FULL CASES	188	\$ 3.29	\$ 618.520	
School Specialty, LLC	APC APS24P	APC APS24P	APC MIN ORDER \$6000 \$3000 MIN COMBINED APC ORDER / 12/CS	188	\$ 3.39	\$ 637.320	
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC APS24P			188	\$ 3.17	\$ 595.960	R.O.A.
ITEM #6 Paper, Graph, 8-1/2" x 11, 1/4" quad., White, Ruled Both Sides, 16 lb. Basis. Pacon 2411 or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4240)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	INC 99476	533840		1200	\$ 2.47	\$ 2,964.000	N.S.R
Pyramid School Products	APC 811-42S	APC 811-42S	10/CS FULL CASES PACON/DIXON MIN ORDER \$3000	1200	\$ 3.79	\$ 4,548.000	
School Specialty, LLC	PACON/DIXON P2411RM	2002860	\$2500 MIN COMBINED PACON ORDER / FULL CASES / ONLY 10/CS	1200	\$ 3.55	\$ 4,260.000	
Staples Contract & Commercial	PACON P2411			1200	\$ 3.56	\$ 4,272.000	R.O.A.
ITEM #7 Paper, Drawing, White Sulphite, 60 lb. Basis, 9" x 12". APC 609W or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4380)							

VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	RESOURCE PACMMK50105F-12	7891440		90	\$ 2.17	\$ 195.300	N.S.R
Pyramid School Products	APC 609W	APC 609W	8 REAMS/CS FULL CASES PACON/DIXON MIN ORDER	90	\$ 7.69	\$ 692.100	
School Specialty, LLC	SAX BY PACON/DIXON 053931	053931	\$3000	90	\$ 7.69	\$ 692.100	
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC 609W		\$3000 MIN COMBINED APC ORDER / 8/CS	90	\$ 7.68	\$ 691.200	R.O.A.
ITEM #8 Paper, Drawing, White Sulphite, 60 lb. Basis, 12" x 18". APC 612W or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4390)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	PACON CORP 4722	352306		90	\$ 21.82	\$ 1,963.800	
Pyramid School Products	APC 612W	APC 612W	4 REAMS/CS FULL CASES PACON/DIXON MIN ORDER	90	\$ 15.29	\$ 1,376.100	
School Specialty, LLC	SAX BY PACON/DIXON 053934	053934	\$3000	90	\$ 15.19	\$ 1,367.100	
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC 612W		\$3000 MION COMBINED APC ORDER / 4/CS	90	\$ 15.36	\$ 1,382.400	R.O.A.
ITEM #9 Drawing, Manila, 60 lb. Basis, 9" X 12". APC 609M, PAC 4209, or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4400)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	PACON CORP 4209	367148		24	\$ 9.56	\$ 229.440	
Pyramid School Products	APC 609M	APC 609M	8 REAMS/CS FULL CASES	24	\$ 6.69	\$ 160.560	
School Specialty, LLC	SAX BY APC 609M	085570	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	24	\$ 6.85	\$ 164.400	
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC 609M		\$3000 MIN COMBINED APC ORDER / 8/CS	24	\$ 6.57	\$ 157.680	R.O.A.

ITEM #10 Drawing, Manila, 60 lb. Basis, 12" X 18": APC 612M, Sax 085574, or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4410)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			12		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC 612M	APC 612M	4 REAMS/CS FULL CASES	12	\$ 13.09	\$ 157.080	
School Specialty, LLC	SAX BY APC 612M	085574	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	12	\$ 13.70	\$ 164.400	
			\$3000 MIN COMBINED				
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC 612M		APC ORDER / 4/CS	12	\$ 13.15	\$ 157.800	R.O.A.
ITEM #11 Paper, News-Ruled, (LW), 10-1/2" x 8", 3/4" Top Margin, 5/16" ALT, 11/32" Red Line x 9/32", 30 lb. Basis. Pacon 2682, APC GR2-DOT, or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4470)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			15		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC GR2-DOT	APC GR2-DOT	10 REAMS/CS FULL CASES	15	\$ 3.45	\$ 51.750	
School Specialty, LLC	SCHOOL SMART BY APC GR2-DOT	085333	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	15	\$ 3.49	\$ 52.350	
			\$3000 MIN COMBINED				
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC GR2-DOT		APC ORDER / 10/CS	15	\$ 3.34	\$ 50.100	R.O.A.
ITEM #12 News-Ruled, (LW), 10-1/2" x 8", 1-3/4" Top Margin, 1/4" ALT 1/4" Red Line x 8/32", 30 lb. Basis. APC GR3-DOT or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4480)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	EDUCATORS RESOURCE			15	\$ 9.94	\$ 149.100	
Pyramid School Products	PACZP2609-3	5395813	10REAMS/CS FULL CASES	15	\$ 3.45	\$ 51.750	
School Specialty, LLC	APC GR3-DOT	APC GR3-DOT	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	15	\$ 3.49	\$ 52.350	
			\$3000 MIN COMBINED				
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC GR3-DOT		APC ORDER / 10/CS	15	\$ 3.34	\$ 50.100	R.O.A.
ITEM #13 Paper, News-Ruled, 8" X 10-1/2", 1/4" Top Margin. School Smart by APC 085339, APC ARN0801, or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4490)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			15		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC ARN0801	APC ARN0801	10 REAMS/CS FULL CASES	15	\$ 3.45	\$ 51.750	
School Specialty, LLC	SCHOOL SMART BY APC ARN0801	085339	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	15	\$ 3.49	\$ 52.350	
			\$3000 MIN COMBINED				
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC ARN0801		APC ORDER / 10/CS	15	\$ 3.50	\$ 52.500	R.O.A.
ITEM #14 Paper, News-Ruled, (SW), 8-1/2" x 11", 3/4" Top Margin, 1/4" Alt, 30 lb. Basis. APC ARN0803, Pacon P2696, or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4500)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			15		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC ARN 8508	APC ARN 8508	20 REAMS	15	\$ 4.29	\$ 64.350	
School Specialty, LLC	SPECIAL RULING	ARN8508	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	15	\$ 4.19	\$ 62.850	
			\$2500 MIN COMBINED				
Staples Contract & Commercial	PACON P2696		PACON ORDER / FULL CASES ONLY 10/CS	15	\$ 4.12	\$ 61.800	R.O.A.

ITEM #15 Paper, News-Ruled, (SW), 8" x 10-1/2", 1-1/2" Top Margin, 3/8" Ruling, Pacon 2645, APC 700W, or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4510)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			15		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC 700W	APC 700W	10 REAMS/CS FULL CASES	15	\$ 7.29	\$ 109.350	
School Specialty, LLC	APC 700W	700W	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	15	\$ 8.00	\$ 120.000	
			\$3000 MIN COMBINED				
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC 700W		APC ORDER / 10/CS	15	\$ 2.96	\$ 44.400	R.O.A.
ITEM #16 Paper, Penmanship (SW) 8" x 10-1/2", 3/8" Ruling, Sub 16, Bond, No Margin. APC 700, Pacon 2433, or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4620)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			15		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC 700	APC 700	10 REAMS/CS FULL CASES	15	\$ 3.49	\$ 52.350	
School Specialty, LLC	SCHOOL SMART BY APC 700C	085236	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	15	\$ 3.90	\$ 58.500	
			\$3000 MIN COMBINED				
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC 700		ORDER APC ORDER / 10/CS	15	\$ 3.69	\$ 55.350	R.O.A.
ITEM #17 Paper, Penmanship (LW) 10-1/2" x 8", Sub 16, Bond, 1-1/8" Top Margin, 1/4" Alt x 1/4" x 1/2" Skip. APC 773-816, Pacon X2449AB, or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4630)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			30		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC 773-816 SPECIAL RULING	APC 773-816 SPECIAL RULING	30 REAMS	30	\$ 7.89	\$ 236.700	
School Specialty, LLC	APC 773-816	773-816	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	30	\$ 8.00	\$ 240.000	
			\$3000 MIN COMBINED				
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC 773-816		ORDER APC ORDER / 10/CS	30	\$ 7.70	\$ 231.000	R.O.A.
ITEM #18 Paper, Tag Board, Manila, 8-1/2" x 22-1/2", 150 lb. Basis (100 Sheets/Pkg.), APC AMT8501 or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4640)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (PKGS)	COST PER PKG	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			75		\$ -	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC AMT8501-6	APC AMT8501-6	6 PKGS/CS FULL CASES	75	\$ 7.79	\$ 584.250	
School Specialty, LLC	APC AMT8501-6	AMT8501-6	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	75	\$ 7.99	\$ 599.250	
			\$3000 MIN COMBINED				
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC AMT8501		ORDER APC ORDER / 6/CS	75	\$ 7.58	\$ 568.500	R.O.A.

ITEM #19 Paper, Tag Board, Manila, 9" x 12", 150 lb. Basis (100 Sheets/Pkg.). APC 1509MP, Pacon 5111, or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4650)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (PKGS)	COST PER PKG	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	PACON CORPORATION 5111	208505		165	\$	986.700	
Pyramid School Products	APC 1509MP	APC 1509MP	12 PKGS/CS FULL CASES	165	\$	575.850	
School Specialty, LLC	PACON/DIXON P5111	085510	PACON/DIXON MIN ORDER \$3000	165	\$	594.000	
Staples Contract & Commercial	PACON P5111		\$2500 MIN COMBINED PACON ORDER / FULL CASES ONLY 12/CS	165	\$	552.750	R.O.A.
ITEM #20 Paper, Tag Board, Manila, 22" x 28", 150 lb. Basis (100 Sheets/Pkg.). APC 1522MC or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4660)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (SHEETS)	COST PER SHEET	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	NO BID			5550		\$	N.B.
Pyramid School Products	APC 1522MC	APC 1522MC	100 SHEETS/CS FULL CASES	5550	\$	1,221.000	
School Specialty, LLC	APC 1522MC	1522MC	APC MIN ORDER \$6000 100/PK	5550	\$	1,221.000	
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC 1522MC		\$3000 MIN COMBINED ORDER APC ORDER / 100 SHEETS/CS	5550	\$	1,143.300	R.O.A.
ITEM #21 Paper, Writing, 8-1/2" x 11", 16 lb., White, 1/4" ALT x 1" x 1/2" Skip. APC ARS8541 or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4460)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (REEMS)	COST PER REEM	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	SP RICHARDS MEA17208	530722		240	\$	1,173.600	N.S.R
Pyramid School Products	APC ARS8541	APC ARS8541	240 REAMS	240	\$	1,269.600	
School Specialty, LLC	SPECIAL RULING APC ARS8541	ARS8541	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	240	\$	1,413.600	
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC ARS8541		\$3000 MIN COMBINED APC ORDER / 240 REAM MINIMUM / 10/CS	240	\$	1,214.400	R.O.A.
ITEM #22 Sentence Strips, 100% Tag Board, 3" x 24" Guideline Rule of 1-1/2", 100/Pkg Assorted Colors. APC 9765KL or EQUAL							
*SAMPLE REQUIRED IF QUOTING AN EQUAL *							
(WCSD #611/4465)							
VENDOR NAME	MFR. MODEL #	VENDOR PART/STOCK #	MIN ORDER QTY.	ESTIMATED QTY. (PKG)	COST PER PKG	EXTENDED COST	ITEM EVALUATION KEY
ODP Business Solutions, LLC	PACON CORPORATION 5165	196363		900	\$	3,366.000	
Pyramid School Products	APC 9765KL	APC 9765KL	24 PKGS/CS FULL CASES	900	\$	2,061.000	
School Specialty, LLC	SCHOOL SMART BY APC 9765KL	000267	APC MIN ORDER \$6000	900	\$	2,061.000	
Staples Contract & Commercial	APC 9765KL		\$3000 MIN COMBINED APC ORDER / 24/CS	900	\$	2,043.000	R.O.A.