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V Washoe County School District

Purchasing Department « 14101 Old Virginia Road « Reno, NV 89521
Phone (775) 850-8025 « Fax (775) 857-3175

ADDENDUM #1 — QUESTIONS & ANSWERS
CERTAIN CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT
RFB #47-B-09-23-PH
October 13, 2022
The following information, clarifications, changes, and modifications are by reference incorporated into the
Request for Bid (RFB) document for the above-referenced project. Any work item or contract provision not
changed or modified will remain in full force and effect. It is the prospective Vendor’s responsibility to read the
entire RFB and all appendices and to respond to all requirements completely.
All prospective Vendors should acknowledge receipt of this Addendum by signing this document and returning
it with the RFB submission. Failure to acknowledge receipt of this Addendum may result in a rejection of RFB

submission.

As a reminder, bid submissions for RFB #47-B-09-23-PH Certain Custodial Equipment are due October 26, 2022,
no later than 2:00 P.M. (local time).
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1. QUESTION: Can you please provide a tubulation of the last bid for each of these items?

ANSWER: Please refer to: Attachment A RFB #054-16-10-20 tabulation for Custodial Equipment
Attachment B RFQ #JP-1112-19 tabulation for Custodial Cleaning Equipment
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ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT
FOR ADDENDUM #1 — QUESTIONS & ANSWERS

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE PRINT NAME

BIDDING VENDOR NAME TITLE
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Attachment A, Tabulation for RFB #054-16-10-20

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

CERTAIN CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT

BID #054-16-10-20

TABULATION

KEY:

I.S. INSUFFICIENT SPECS NO SPEC. NO SPECIFICATIONS

L.P. LOCAL PREFERENCE NO SUB. NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED
N.A. NOT AVAILABLE N.S. NO SAMPLE

N.A.S. NOT AS SPECIFIED R.A.B. REJECT ALL BIDS

N.B. NOBID * RECOMMENDED

N.C. NO CHARGE *¥ CHOSEN BY LOTTERY

BUYER HAS REVIEWED AND APPROVED Jenny Perry

DATE 10/22/19

APPEAL WINDOW CLOSES ON Tuesday, October 29, 2019

ITEM #1 RESTROOM CLEANING MACHINE, HEPA Filtration, 500 psi Pump, Compact, Removable “Black Box” Engine Compartment, CRI

Silver Rated Carpet Extraction Capability. Kaivac 1750 No-Touch Cleaning System. NO SUBSTITUTES

SUPPLIER MFG./MODEL QTY. EA PRICE EXT. PRICE| RECOMMENDED
Brady Industries No Bid 4 $ - N.B.
Central Sanitary Supply Kaivac 1750 4 $ 4,110.00| $ 16,440.00

Ferguson Enterprises, LLC No Bid 4 $ - N.B.
Inland Supply Co. No Bid 4 $ - N.B.
Tahoe Supply Co. Kaivac 1750 4 $ 3,300.94| $13,203.76 *

ITEM #2 FLOOR SCRUBBER, AUTOMATIC, W/Traction Drive, 11 Gal. Solution and 13 Gal. Recovery Tanks, 20” Single Disk Scrub. Betco
Stealth ASD20BT W/Pad Driver and Battery Pack. NO SUBSTITUTES

SUPPLIER MFG./MODEL QTY. EA PRICE EXT. PRICE| RECOMMENDED
Brady Industries No Bid 5 $ - N.B.
Central Sanitary Supply (1) with wet Batt 5 $ 5,730.00| $ 28,650.00

Central Sanitary Supply (2) with AGM Batt 5 $ 5,995.00| $ 29,975.00

Ferguson Enterprises, LLC No Bid 5 $ - N.B.
Inland Supply Co. Stealth ASD20BT 5 $ 4,450.00| $22,250.00 *

Tahoe Supply Co. No Bid 5 $ - N.B.

ITEM #3 FLOOR SCRUBBER, AUTOMATIC, 18", 2-Stage Motor, 13.5 amps, 1 hp, 250 rpm W/85’ Safety Orange Power Cord. Triple S
(SSS) Panther 17C or Viper Fang 17C. NO SUBSTITUTES

SUPPLIER MFG./MODEL QTY. EA PRICE EXT. PRICE| RECOMMENDED
Brady Industries Clarke 50000226 6 $ 1,358.00 $ 8,148.00 N.A.S.
Central Sanitary Supply No Bid 6 $ - N.B.
Ferguson Enterprises, LLC No Bid 6 $ - N.B.
Inland Supply Co. Viper Fang 17C 6 $1,420.00 $ 8,520.00 *

Tahoe Supply Co. Viper AS430C (min. order 2) 6 $ 1,549.85| $ 9,299.10

ITEM #4  CARPET EXTRACTOR, 16” Cleaning Path, 8 Gal. Solution Tank, 6 Gal. Recovery Tank, 1.5 hp, 3 Stage Motor. Advance ES300ST.
NO SUBSTITUTES

SUPPLIER MFG./MODEL QTY. EA PRICE EXT. PRICE| RECOMMENDED
Brady Industries No Bid 15 $ - N.B.
Central Sanitary Supply Advance E5300ST 15 $ 2,995.00| $ 44,925.00

Ferguson Enterprises, LLC Advance E5300ST 15 $2,161.16| $32,417.40

Inland Supply Co. Advance E5300ST 15 $ 2,210.00| $ 33,150.00

Tahoe Supply Co. Advance E5300ST (min. order 4) 15 $ 2,097.00| $ 31,455.00 N.A.S.
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WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

ATTACHMENT A

CERTAIN CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT

BID #054-16-10-20

ITEM #5 FLOOR MACHINE, 20" Diameter, 2-Stage Motor, 1.5 hp, 175 rpm W/55’ Safety Orange Power Cord. Triple S (SSS) Cougar 20
or Viper Venom 20. NO SUBSTITUTES

SUPPLIER MFG./MODEL QTY. EA PRICE EXT. PRICE| RECOMMENDED
Brady Industries Clarke VN2015 5 $ 459.00| $ 2,295.00 N.A.S.
Central Sanitary Supply 5 $ 795.000 $ 3,975.00

Ferguson Enterprises, LLC No Bid 5 $ - N.B.
Inland Supply Co. Viper Venom 20 5 $ 505.000 $ 2,525.00 *

Tahoe Supply Co. Viper Venom 20 (min. order 4) 5 $ 572.52| $ 2,862.60

ITEM #6  VACUUM, WET/DRY, CORDLESS, 18 Volt, 60 CFM Airflow, 3 Gal. Tank, Lithiu

m Ion battery.

ProTeam ProGuard LI 3. NO

SUBSTITUTES

SUPPLIER MFG./MODEL QTY. EA PRICE EXT. PRICE| RECOMMENDED
Brady Industries ProTeam 107495 5 $ 210.00| $ 1,050.00

Central Sanitary Supply Viper 5 $ 294.00 $ 1,470.00

Ferguson Enterprises, LLC ProTeam ProGuard LI 3 5 $ 218.83| $¢ 1,094.15

Inland Supply Co. ProTeam ProGuard LI 3 5 $ 208.80| $ 1,044.00

Tahoe Supply Co. ProTeam ProGuard LI 3 5 $ 203.99 $ 1,019.95 *

ITEM #7 VACUUM, WET/DRY, W/TOOLS, 18 Gallon, 24" Squeegee, 2 Stage Vacuum W/100" Waterlift, 55’ Safety Orange Cord. Viper

Shovelnose, Triple S (SSS) Blackcat. NO SUBSTITUTES

SUPPLIER MFG./MODEL QTY. | EACH PRICE EXT. PRICE| RECOMMENDED
Brady Industries Clarke SN18WD 20 $ 477.00] $ 9,540.00 N.A.S.
Central Sanitary Supply Shovelnoes 20 $ 955.00/ $ 19,100.00

Ferguson Enterprises, LLC No Bid 20 $ - N.B.
Inland Supply Co. Viper Shovelnose 20 $ 528.000 $10,560.00 *

Tahoe Supply Co. Viper Shovelnose (min. order 4) 20 $ 554.97| $ 11,099.40

ITEM #8 VACUUM, Backpack, 10 gt., Airflow 150 CFM, 1-1>" Static-Dissipating Hose, 50’ Extension Cord, to include 2 Intercept Micro
Filters. Pro Team Super CoachVac Hepa. NO SUBSTITUTES

SUPPLIER MFG./MODEL QTY. EA PRICE EXT. PRICE| RECOMMENDED
Brady Industries ProTeam 107109 15 $ 315.00| $ 4,725.00

Central Sanitary Supply ProTeam 107109 15 $ 350.00| $ 5,250.00

Ferguson Enterprises, LLC ProTeam SuperCoach Vac 107109 15 $ 335.17| $ 5,027.55

Inland Supply Co. ProTeam SuperCoach Vac Hepa 15 $ 315.05| $ 4,725.75

Tahoe Supply Co. ProTeam SuperCoach 107109 15 $ 309.91 $ 4,648.65 *

ITEM #9 VACUUM, Backpack, 6 gt., Airflow 150 CFM, 1-142" Static-Dissipating Hose, 50" Extension Co

Filters. ProTeam SuperQuarterVac Hepa. NO SUBSTITUTES

rd, to include 2 Intercept Micro

SUPPLIER MFG./MODEL QTY. EA PRICE EXT. PRICE| RECOMMENDED
Brady Industries ProTeam 107108 10 $ 314.00| $ 3,140.00
Central Sanitary Supply ProTeam 107108 10 $ 385.00 $ 3,850.00
Ferguson Enterprises, LLC ProTeam SuperQuarter Vac 107118 10 $ 332.24| $ 3,322.40
Inland Supply Co. ProTeam SuperQuarter Vac Hepa 10 $ 313.00 $ 3,130.00
Tahoe Supply Co. ProTeam SuperCoach 107118 10 $ 307.31 $ 3,073.10 *
SUPPLIER Items EXT. PRICE
Ferguson Enterprises, LLC 4 $32,417.40
Inland Supply Co. 2,3,5,7 $43,855.00
Tahoe Supply Co. 1,6,8,9 $21,945.46
Total $98,217.86
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Attachment B - Tabulation for RFQ JP-1112-19

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

CUSTODIAL CLEANING EQUIPMENT

RFQ JP-1112-19

TABULATION

BUYER HAS REVIEWED AND APPROVED: Jenny Perry

DATE: 5/10/19

ITEM #1 - 28" Ride-On Floor Scrubber, Tennant T7 Micro Ride-On, Clarke Focus Il Rider or Equal.

SUPPLIER MFG./MODEL QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE RECOMMENDED
Central Sanitary Supply Nobles/Tennant - SSR-700-C 2 $13,134.00 $26,268.00
Inland Supply Clarke Focus Il Rider 28 2 $13,495.00 $26,990.00
Tahoe Supply Tomcat PRO-ST 28 Disc 2 $9,279.83 $18,559.66 *
Tahoe Supply Tomcat PRO-HD 28 Edge 2 $10,371.11  $20,742.22
ITEM #2 - 20” Floor Buffer, Low Speed, 1.5HP, Pacific Steamex FM-20HD or Equal.
SUPPLIER MFG./MODEL QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE RECOMMENDED
Central Sanitary Supply Nobles/Tennant - 9007336 2 $745.00  $1,490.00 R.A.B.
Inland Supply SSS Cougar 20 2 $549.00  $1,098.00 R.A.B.
Tahoe Supply Hawk F0012-BH 2 $598.13  $1,196.26 R.AB.
ITEM #3 - Portable Heated Carpet Extractor, Minimum 12 gallon, Solus 500R or Equal.
SUPPLIER MFG./MODEL QUANTITY UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE RECOMMENDED
Central Sanitary Supply |Nobles/Explorer H2 - 9011453 2 $3,155.20  $6,310.40
Inland Supply Hydramaster Pex 500 2 $2,795.00  $5,590.00

Edic 2000CX-HR (includes

wand, solution & vacuum

hose, heater, and circuit
Tahoe Supply locator) 2 $2,382.25  $4,764.50 *
SUPPLIER ITEMS TOTAL RECOMMENDED
Central Sanitary Supply $32,578.40
Inland Supply $32,580.00
Tahoe Supply 1,3 $23,324.16 *
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