
Date Revised: 07/03/23 PUR-F208 Page 1 of 1 

07/18/23 

TO:    
Henry Schein Medical a division of Henry Schein, Inc 
Inland Supply Co. Inc. 
Interboro Packaging Corporation 
McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions LLC 
Mini Wing USA 
Pyramid School Products 
Quill LLC 
Rally Inc. 
School Health Corporation 
UniPak Corp.  

RE:  Request for Formal Quote ~ Recommendation of Award (ROA) 

For the Request for Formal Quote for Health Services Supplies, RFQ #152-QF-04-23-GS, 
Washoe County School District’s (WCSD) Purchasing Department is recommending award 
for an initial one (1) year term beginning 7/26/23 and expiring on 07/25/24 to: 

HENRY SCHEIN MEDICAL A DIVISION OF HENRY SCHEIN, INC. 
INLAND SUPPLY CO. INC. 

SCHOOL HEALTH CORPORATION 

A copy of the ROA Tabulation is attached for reference and is also available online at: 
https://solicitations.washoeschools.net/purchasing/Default?ProjectID=4550  

This memo serves as formal notification that the public review of the ROA Tabulation period 
has commenced and will close on 07/25/23 at 4:30 pm (local time). The anticipated award date 
of this solicitation is 07/26/23 with the posting and distribution of the official Notice of Award 
following shortly thereafter. 

Please submit any inquiries or questions regarding this ROA memo in writing to: 
solicitations@washoeschools.net. 

Thank you for your interest in doing business with WCSD. 

WCSD Purchasing Department 

https://solicitations.washoeschools.net/purchasing/Default?ProjectID=4550
mailto:solicitations@washoeschools.net


R.A.B.   REJECT ALL BIDS D.M.O.         DECLINED MINIMUM ORDER
I.S.        INSUFFICIENT SPECS

N.C.      NO CHARGE
S.R.L    SAMPLE RECEIVED 
LATE

S.R.             SAMPLE REJECTED

N.L.A    NO LONGER AVAILABLE

N.A.S.   NOT AS SPECIFIED
N.B.      NO BID
N.C.      NO CHARGE

* RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD
** TIED / CHOSEN BY LOTTERY

BASIS OF AWARD: Per Section 11, this RFQ will be awarded on a LINE-BY-LINE basis to the lowest priced, responsive, and responsible Supplier.

ITEM EVALUATION KEY:

NO SPEC.    NO SPECIFICATIONS

NO SUB.      NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED

SURETY REQUIRED:  _____ YES   X NO

DATE: BUYER HAS REVIEWED AND APPROVED: 

N.S.R.          NO SAMPLE RECEIVED

PUBLIC REVIEW PERIOD CLOSES AT 4:30 PM (LOCAL TIME) ON: 

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
HEALTH SERVICES SUPPLIES
152-QF-04-23-GS

RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD - ROA TABULATION

DATE: 01/13/23 PUR-F238(B) Page 1 of 30

ATTACHMENT A

July 18, 2023

July 25, 2023



VENDOR NAME
LOW ITEM BID 

TOTAL
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. $3,775.52 
Inland Supply Co. Inc. $22,895.50 
Interboro Packaging Corporation

$0.00 
McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC $0.00 
Mini Wing USA $0.00 
Pyramid School Products $0.00 
Quill LLC $0.00 
Rally Inc. $0.00 
School Health Corporation $5,010.43 
UniPak Corp. $0.00 

$31,681.45

SUMMARY OF RESULTS AND TOTAL COST REPORT

LOW BID BY ITEM NUMBER(S)

1, 4, 14

7, 12, 16, 17, 18, 26, 27

ESTIMATED TOTAL CONTRACT VALUE = 

2, 5, 8, 9, 13, 21, 22, 25
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

BOTTLE EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division 
of Henry Schein, Inc. 1127067 H.S.I. 96 1  $              1.550  $           148.800 *

Inland Supply Co. Inc. MEDLINE 98003Z 96 1  $ 4.110  $           394.560 
Interboro Packaging Corporation

96  $ -     $ -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Undstr 1022856 96 EA  $ 4.740  $           455.040 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA MEDLINE MDS098003E 96 96  $ 2.350  $           225.600 N.A.S./N.S.R.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 96  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Quill LLC MEDLINE #2439938 96 0  $ 2.530  $           242.880 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #P907016 96 12 Bottles 
(CASE)  $ 3.250  $           312.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation MCKESSON 23-D0222/SH #1039746 96  $ 2.540  $           243.840 
UniPak Corp. 96  $ -     $ -    N.B.

ITEM # 1:  Alcohol, Isopropyl, 70%, 16 oz.
EXPIRATION DATE MUST EXTEND 2 YEARS INTO FUTURE FROM PURCHASE ORDER DATE
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 2 EACH
Pre-approve product numbers:
Henry Schein 1127067
McKesson 1022856
Swan 34042
Medline 969696

WCSD #431/1000
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

BOX EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 9330132 Dukal 855 200 1  $ 2.980  $           596.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. FIRST AID ONLY H307 
50/BOX 200 1 BOX  $ 6.600  $        1,320.000 

Interboro Packaging Corporation
200  $ -     $ -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm16 865276 200 BX  $ 3.000  $           600.000 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 200  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 200  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 200  $ -     $ -    N.B.

Rally Inc. Dukal #855 200 20 Boxes 
(CASE)  $ 4.000  $           800.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation PROFESSIONAL MEDICAL 061-1303/SH #49174 200 0  $              3.900  $           780.000 *

UniPak Corp. 200  $ -     $ -    N.B.

ITEM # 2:  Antiseptic Towelettes, Benzalkonium Chloride (BZK), Individually Wrapped, Unscented, No latex, No common allergens, 100/Box.
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 2 BOX
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 865276
Kentron 69556-003-001
Dynarex 49174

WCSD #431/1005
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

EACH EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. no bid 1075  $ -     $ -    N.B.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 1075  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation Mfr: IBS/Pitt/ Glopack, INT-4212-H, $8.32/100, As per 

sample #3 1075 0  $ 0.083  $             89.440 N.A.S./S.R.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC No-Bid 1075  $ -     $ -    R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 1075  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 1075  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 1075  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Rally Inc. N/A 1075  $ -     $ -    N.B.
School Health Corporation NO BID 1075  $ -     $ -    N.B.
UniPak Corp. 1075  $ -     $ -    N.B.

ITEM # 3:  Bags, Ice, Twist and Tie, No-leak, 4" x 2" x 12", 100/Package. SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 2 EACH
Pre-approve product numbers:
El Kay Plastics T408030-1

WCSD #431/1030
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

BOX EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division 
of Henry Schein, Inc. 1126133 H.S.I 2000 1  $              1.780  $        3,560.000 *

Inland Supply Co. Inc. JOHNSON & JOHNSON 4444 2000 1 BOX  $ 8.750  $      17,500.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

2000  $ -     $ -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm16 466872 2000 BX  $ 2.620  $        5,240.000 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA MEDLINE NON25660 2000 CASE= 12 BOX  $ 3.230  $        6,460.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Pyramid School Products NO BID 2000  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Quill LLC FIRST AID ONLY #898936 2000 0  $ 5.280  $      10,560.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #P150120 2000 12 Boxes 
(CASE)  $ 3.850  $        7,700.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation MEDLINE SH32006/SH #32006 2000  $ 2.910  $        5,820.000 
UniPak Corp. 2000  $ -     $ -    N.B.

ITEM # 4:  Bandaids, Adhesive, 1” x 3”, Flexible/Fabric, Latex-Free. 100/Box. 
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 BOX
Pre-approve product numbers:
Henry Schein 1126133
McKesson 466872
Nutramax/DermaScience 85949 
Curaplex 1122-14960

WCSD #431/1060
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

BOX EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 3369508 Hartmann 276 1  $ 3.120  $           861.120 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 276  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

276  $ -     $ -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm16 1103072 276 BX  $ 2.770  $           764.520 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 276  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 276  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 276  $ -     $ -    N.B.

Rally Inc. Hartmann #46150001 276 24 Boxes 
(CASE)  $ 4.550  $        1,255.800 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation BSN-JOBST 7645612/SH #1041348 276  $ 8.580  $        2,368.080 *
UniPak Corp. 276  $ -     $ -    N.B.

ITEM # 5:  Bandaids, Adhesive, 1 x 1-1/4 Inch Fabric, Oval, Tan, Sterile.
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 BOX
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 1103072

WCSD #431/1070
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

BOX EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 2674121 676  $ 3.260  $        2,203.760 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 676  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

676  $ -     $ -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm16 514534 676 BX  $ 5.550  $        3,751.800 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA MEDLINE CURAD CUR0072RBVIH 2X4 10CT 676 BOX  $ 3.250  $        2,197.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 676  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 676  $ -     $ -    N.B.

Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #P150125 676 12 Boxes 
(CASE)  $ 5.700  $        3,853.200 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation MEDLINE SH32120/SH #32120 676  $ 4.070  $        2,751.320 N.A.S./S.R.
UniPak Corp. 676  $ -     $ -    N.B.

WCSD #431/1080

ITEM # 6:  Bandaids, Adhesive, Large, 2” x 4-1/4”, Flexible/Fabric, Sheer or Plastic/Vinyl, 	Latex-Free. 50/Box.
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 BOX
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 514534
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

BOX EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 1043319 Hartmann 2X1-3/4" 180 1  $ 3.690  $           664.200 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. FIRST AID ONLY G126
40/BX 180 1 BOX  $              7.800  $        1,404.000 *

Interboro Packaging Corporation
180  $ -     $ -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm16 466875 180 BX  $ 5.330  $           959.400 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 180  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 180  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Quill LLC CURAD #113640MED 180 0  $ 7.030  $        1,265.400 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. BSN Medical #7645609 180 12 Boxes 
(CASE)  $            11.650  $        2,097.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation BSN-JOBST 7645612/SH #1041357 180  $ -     $ -    N.B.
UniPak Corp. 180  $ -     $ -    N.B.

WCSD #431/1100

ITEM # 7:  Bandaids, Fabric, Fingertip, 2” x 1-1/2”, Latex-Free. 100/Box.
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 BOX
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 466875
Curaplex 1122-14962
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

BOX EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 1126144 H.S.I. 216 1  $ 2.460  $           531.360 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. MEDLINE 25510 216 1 BOX  $ 5.650  $        1,220.400 

Interboro Packaging Corporation 216  $ -     $ -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm16 466873 216 BX  $ 5.970  $        1,289.520 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 216  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 216  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Quill LLC MEDLINE #113638MED 216 0  $ 5.370  $        1,159.920 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #P150110 216 12 Boxes 
(CASE)  $ 5.500  $        1,188.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation MEDLINE SH32230/SH #32230 216  $              4.750  $        1,026.000 *
UniPak Corp. 216  $ -     $ -    N.B.

ITEM # 8:  Bandaids, Fabric, Knuckle, 1-1/2” x 3, Latex-Free. 100/Box.
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 BOX
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 466873
Curaplex 14966

WCSD #431/1110
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

EACH EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 9338389 96 1  $ 0.820  $             78.720 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 96  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

96  $ -     $ -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC No-Bid 96  $ -     $ -    R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 96  $ -     $ -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 96  $ -     $ -    N.B.

Quill LLC
DYNAREX #24556503 52 X 84 

*Price per each determined based on Quill clarification
that price per case of 24 blankets is $38. 

96 0  $ 1.583  $           151.997 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. N/A 96  $ -     $ -    N.B.
School Health Corporation NDC 721/SH #48025 96  $              0.640  $             61.440 *
UniPak Corp. 96  $ -     $ -    N.B.

ITEM # 9:  Emergency Mylar/Foil Blanket, Disposable, Minimum 52” x 80”, Individually wrapped.
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 2 EACH
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 1112301
Dynarex 572224
Kentron 886656
Curaplex 12945

WCSD #431/1120
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 
PACKAGE EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. no bid 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC No-Bid 36  $                  -     $                    -    R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #P159045 (1000 Balls Size Large/Bag) 36 2 Bags (CASE)  $            18.000  $           648.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #P159025 
(2000 Balls Size Medium/Bag) 36 2 Bags (CASE)  $            17.000  $           612.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation NO BID 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
UniPak Corp. 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

ITEM # 10:   Cotton Balls, Non-Sterile. 500/Package.
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 PACKAGE
Pre-approve product numbers:
Kendall K102600
Kentron 4440010-500
Covidien 30011

WCSD #431/1160
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

EACH EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 4990464 Allied 36 1  $              8.560  $           308.160 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC No-Bid 36  $                  -     $                    -    R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Rally Inc. N/A 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
School Health Corporation AREO HEALTH AM01-SH/SH #59701 36  $            10.300  $           370.800 N.A.S./N.S.R.
UniPak Corp. 36  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

ITEM # 11: CPR Pocket Mask, One-way valve, Adult or Adult/Child, Latex-Free, No Oxygen Inlet, Hard or Soft Case. Must not require license for purchase
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 2 EACH
Pre-approved product number(s):
MedSource MS PM104 

WCSD #431/1190
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

CASE EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. no bid 60  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. BOARDWALK TRANSCUP 3CT
125/SLEEVE 20 SL/CS 60 1 CASE  $            35.400  $        2,124.000 *

Interboro Packaging Corporation
60  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC No-Bid 60  $                  -     $                    -    R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 60  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products DART DCCY35 60 10 CASE  $            83.980  $        5,038.800 
Quill LLC DART #35N25 2500/CT 60 0  $          100.770  $        6,046.200 N.A.S./N.S.R.
Rally Inc. TIDI #9243 (1000/CASE) 60 1 CASE  $            50.000  $        3,000.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.
School Health Corporation ESSENDANT DCC Y35 / SH #1030643 60  $            90.090  $        5,405.400 
UniPak Corp. 60  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

ITEM # 12:  Cups, Plastic, 3.5 Oz. 25 Bags/Case (100 Cups/Bag).
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 CASE
Pre-approve product numbers:
TIDI 1017762
Solo Cup 1014664
Kentron 884235
Dart DCY35
Essendant 1030643

WCSD #431/1190

DATE: 01/13/23 PUR-F238(B) Page 14 of 30



VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

CASE EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 1009865 H.S.I. 12 1 CS  $            25.190  $           302.280 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 12  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

12  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm143 919570 12 CS  $            22.000  $           264.000 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 12  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 12  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 12  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Rally Inc. Graham #002 12 1 CASE  $            53.000  $           636.000 
Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #P751018 12 1 CASE  $            47.000  $           564.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.
School Health Corporation NORTECH LAB N18125/ SH #1030647 12  $            32.310  $           387.720 *
UniPak Corp. 12  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

ITEM # 13:  Examination Table Paper, 18” x 125’, Crepe or Smooth. 12 Rolls/Case. 
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 CASE
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 919570
Kentron 918125
Medline #MIINON 24324
Graham #002
Tidi 23324
Avalon 77095

WCSD #431/1230
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 
PACKAGE EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division 
of Henry Schein, Inc. 1048825 H.S.I. 48 1  $              1.390  $             66.720 *

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 48  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

48  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mmc16 1067841 48 BG  $              2.920  $           140.160 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 48  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 48  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 48  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

Rally Inc. AMD Ritmed #D205 48 8 Packages 
(CASE)  $              4.000  $           192.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. Dynarex #3102 48 8 Packages 
(CASE)/$250  $              4.500  $           216.000 

School Health Corporation MEDLINE SH27551/ SH #27551 48  $              1.260  $             60.480 N.A.S./S.R.
UniPak Corp. 48  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

WCSD #431/1260

ITEM # 14:  Gauze Bandage, Elastic, Rolled, Minimum 2” x 3½ Yards, Non-Sterile. 12/Package.
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 PACKAGE
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 1067841
McKesson 993032
Kentron 440002
Dynarex 3102
HIS 104-8825

DATE: 01/13/23 PUR-F238(B) Page 16 of 30



VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 
PACKAGE EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 5702640 H.S.I. 84 1  $              2.750  $           231.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 84  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

84  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm16 446030 84 PK  $              4.070  $           341.880 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 84  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 84  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 84  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #P157113 84 20 Packages 
(CASE)  $              5.750  $           483.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation MEDLINE SH27545/SH #27545 84  $              2.900  $           243.600 N.A.S./N.S.R.
UniPak Corp. 84  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

WCSD #431/1270

ITEM # 15:  Gauze Pads, 3” x 3”, Non-Sterile. 200/Package.
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 PACKAGE
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 446030
Kentron 338111
Medpride MPR-60583

DATE: 01/13/23 PUR-F238(B) Page 17 of 30



VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

BOX EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 5700088 H.S.I. 150 1  $              5.170  $           775.500 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. ROYALTY RPGPPFV-S VINYL 150 10 BOXES  $              2.490  $           373.500 N.A.S./S.R.
Inland Supply Co. Inc. HONGRAY NUS7021 NITRILE 150 10 BOXES   $              4.450  $           667.500 *
Interboro Packaging Corporation Med Pride-Sm-VPFG-E, Mfr:Med Pride, As per sample 

#16, Vinyl Exam Powder Free 150 0  $              1.980  $           297.000 N.A.S./S.R.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm14 832681 150 BX  $              6.820  $        1,023.000 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA
DIAMOND IF 48 EXAM 150 1 CASE = 10 

BOX  $              7.690  $        1,153.500 N.A.S./S.R.

Pyramid School Products HOSPECO #VPF232 150 150 BOX  $              2.980  $           447.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.
Quill LLC AMMEX #24550204 150 0  $              4.400  $           660.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. Innovative Healthcare #162100 150 10 Boxes 
(CASE)  $              6.000  $           900.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #P359402 150 10 Boxes 
(CASE)  $              5.750  $           862.500 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation INTCO MEDICAL BMPF-3001/SH #1020145 150  $              3.150  $           472.500 N.A.S./S.R.
UniPak Corp. UPC NPF-S 150 0  $              4.750  $           712.500 N.A.S./N.S.R.

WCSD #431/1810

ITEM # 16:  Synthetic Latex-Free, powder-free Nitrile or Vinyl exam gloves 100/Box, Size Small. 
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 BOX
Pre-approve product numbers:
School Health 21324
McKesson 832681

DATE: 01/13/23 PUR-F238(B) Page 18 of 30



VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

BOX EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 5700089 H.S.I. 500 1  $              5.170  $        2,585.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. ROYALTY RPGPPFV-M VINYL 500 10 BOXES  $              2.490  $        1,245.000 N.A.S./S.R.
Inland Supply Co. Inc. HONGRAY NUS7022 NITRILE 500 10 BOXES  $              4.450  $        2,225.000 *
Interboro Packaging Corporation Med Pride-Med-VPFG-E, Mfr: Med Pride, As per sample 

#17, Vinyl Exam Powder Free 500 0  $              1.980  $           990.000 N.A.S./S.R.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm14 832682 500 BX  $              6.820  $        3,410.000 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA
DIAMOND IF 48 EXAM 500 1 CASE = 10 

BOX  $              7.690  $        3,845.000 N.A.S./S.R.

Pyramid School Products HOSPECO #VPF235 500 500 BOX  $              2.980  $        1,490.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.
Quill LLC AMMEX #24474483 500 0  $              5.710  $        2,855.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. Innovative Healthcare #162200 500 10 Boxes 
(CASE)  $              6.000  $        3,000.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #P359403 500 10 Boxes 
(CASE)  $              5.750  $        2,875.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation INTCO MEDICAL BMPF-3002/SH #1020146 500  $              3.150  $        1,575.000 N.A.S./S.R.
UniPak Corp. UPC NPF-M 500 0  $              4.750  $        2,375.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

WCSD #431/1820

ITEM # 17:  Synthetic Latex-Free, powder-free Nitrile or Vinyl exam gloves 100/Box, Size Medium.
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 BOX
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 832682
School Health 21325

DATE: 01/13/23 PUR-F238(B) Page 19 of 30



VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

BOX EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 5700090 H.S.I. 500 1  $              5.170  $        2,585.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. ROYALTY RPGPPFV-L VINYL 500 10 BOXES   $              2.490  $        1,245.000 N.A.S./S.R.
Inland Supply Co. Inc. HONGRAY NUS7023 NITRILE 500 10 BOXES   $              4.450  $        2,225.000 *
Interboro Packaging Corporation Med Pride-Lrg-VPFG-E, Mfr: Med Pride, As per sample 

#18, Vinyl Exam Powder Free 500 0  $              1.980  $           990.000 N.A.S./S.R.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm14 832683 500 BX  $              6.820  $        3,410.000 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA DIAMOND IF48EXAM VINYL 500 1 CASE = 10 
BOX  $              7.690  $        3,845.000 N.A.S./S.R.

Pyramid School Products HOSPECO #VPF236 500 500 BOX  $              2.980  $        1,490.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.
Quill LLC AMMEX #24474489 500 0  $              6.120  $        3,060.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. Innovative Healthcare #162300 500 10 Boxes 
(CASE)  $              6.000  $        3,000.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #P359407 500 10 Boxes 
(CASE)  $              5.750  $        2,875.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation INTCO MEDICAL BMPF-3003/ SH #1020147 500  $              3.150  $        1,575.000 N.A.S./S.R.
UniPak Corp. UPC NPF-L 500  $              4.750  $        2,375.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

WCSD #431/1830

ITEM # 18:  Synthetic Latex-Free, powder-free Nitrile or Vinyl exam gloves 100/Box, Size Large.
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 BOX
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 832683
School Health 21327

DATE: 01/13/23 PUR-F238(B) Page 20 of 30



VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

EACH EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 3582719 LYSOL 40 1  $              6.850  $           274.000 R.A.B.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. LYSOL IC FOAM DISINF. #RAC02775 CT 40 1 EACH  $              4.090  $           163.600 R.A.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

40  $                  -     $                    -    R.A.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Lagase 773022 40 EA  $              3.290  $           131.600 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA DIAMOND IF48EXAM VINYL 40 1 CASE = 10 
BOX  $              7.690  $           307.600 R.A.B.

Pyramid School Products NO BID 40  $                  -     $                    -    R.A.B.
Quill LLC LYSOL #02775 40 0  $              4.570  $           182.800 R.A.B.
Rally Inc. N/A 40  $                  -     $                    -    R.A.B.
School Health Corporation LYSOL RAC95524CT/SH #34233 40  $              4.570  $           182.800 R.A.B.
UniPak Corp. 40  $                  -     $                    -    R.A.B.

ITEM # 19:  Lysol IC Disinfectant Foam Surface Cleaner or other quaternary disinfectant approved to kill norovirus in 5 minutes or less, No strong scents.
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 2 EACH
Pre-approved product number(s):
Lysol 34233

WCSD #431/1310

DATE: 01/13/23 PUR-F238(B) Page 21 of 30



VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

EACH EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. no bid 1300  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 1300  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

1300  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm18 1107575 1300 EA  $              0.190  $           247.000 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 1300  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 1300  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 1300  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Rally Inc. P230023 (100 per CASE) 1300 1 CASE of 100  $              0.470  $           611.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.
School Health Corporation NO BID 1300  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
UniPak Corp. 1300  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

ITEM # 20:  Pillow Covers, Poly, Disposable, 21" x 30", Latex-Free.
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 2 EACH
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 1107575
Kentron 213012
WCSD #431/1320
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

EACH EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 3789798 Chanby 18 1  $              3.750  $             67.500 

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 18  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

18  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm43 487479 18 EA  $              3.530  $             63.540 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 18  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 18  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 18  $                  -     $                    -    N.A.S./N.S.R.
Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #N407025 18 1  $            37.330  $           671.940 N.A.S./N.S.R.
School Health Corporation LISTER W36030/SH #36222 18  $              1.330  $             23.940 *
UniPak Corp. 18  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

ITEM # 21:  Scissors, Lister Bandage, 4-1/2”, Stainless Steel.
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 EACH
Pre-approve product numbers:
Chanby 3789798
McKesson 487479
Kentron KI144
Lister 36222

WCSD #431/1340

DATE: 01/13/23 PUR-F238(B) Page 23 of 30



VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 
PACKAGE EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 1019278 H.S.I. 75 1  $              1.240  $             93.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 75  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

75  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm16 446034 75 PK  $              1.000  $             75.000 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 75  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 75  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 75  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #P159522 75 20 Packages 
(CASE)  $              2.050  $           153.750 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation MEDLINE SH27539/SH #27539 75  $              0.950  $             71.250 *
UniPak Corp. 75  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

WCSD #431/1420

ITEM # 22:  Sponge, Nu Gauze, 2” x 2”, 4-Ply Absorbency, Non-Sterile, General Use. 200/Pack.
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 PACKAGE
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 446034
Kentron 250224
Dukal 8520094
Moore #44122 
Kimcon 41200
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

ROLL EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. no bid 120  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 120  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

120  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm115 944357 120 EA  $              0.230  $             27.600 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 120  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 120  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 120  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

Rally Inc. 3M Health Care #1530-0 (24 rolls per Box) 120
10 Boxes 

(CASE) (240 
rolls)

 $              0.390  $             46.800 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation NDC 1530-0/SH #28069 120  $              8.500  $        1,020.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.
UniPak Corp. 120  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

WCSD #431/1430

ITEM # 23:  Tape, Micropore Surgical, ½” x 10 Yards, Latex-Free.
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 2 EACH
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 944357

DATE: 01/13/23 PUR-F238(B) Page 25 of 30



VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

ROLL EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. no bid 150  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 150  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

150  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm115 944358 150 BX  $              5.790  $           868.500 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 150  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 150  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC 3M #152711 150 0  $            21.710  $        3,256.500 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. 3M Health Care #1530-1 (24 rolls per Box) 150
10 Boxes 

(CASE) (240 
rolls)

 $              0.390  $             58.500 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation NDC 1530-1/SH #28072 150  $              9.230  $        1,384.500 N.A.S./N.S.R.
UniPak Corp. 150  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

WCSD #431/1440

ITEM # 24:  Tape, Micropore Surgical, 1” x 10 Yards, Latex-Free.
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 2 EACH
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 944358
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

BOX EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 1002416 H.S.I. 40 1  $              7.810  $           312.400 

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 40  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

40  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm16 484942 40 BX  $              6.820  $           272.800 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 40  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 40  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC MEDLINE #111638MED 40 0  $            14.610  $           584.400 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. ProAdvantage #72000 40 10 Boxes 
(CASE)  $            10.000  $           400.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation MEDLINE SH90022/SH #90022 40  $              7.300  $           292.000 *
UniPak Corp. 40  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

WCSD #431/1470

ITEM # 25:  Tongue Depressors, 500/Box, Non-sterile, Non-flavored.
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 BOX
Pre-approve product numbers:
HSI 1002416
McKesson 484942
Kentron 450675
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 
PACKAGE EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 6430235 500 1  $              6.850  $        3,425.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. KC X70 41200
76/PK 12PK/CS 500 1 CASE (12 

PKS)  $              9.900  $        4,950.000 *

Interboro Packaging Corporation
500  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Kclapc 519209 500 PK  $            10.550  $        5,275.000 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 500  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 500  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 500  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

Rally Inc. Kimberly Clark X70 #41200 500 12 Packages 
(CASE)/$250  $            13.000  $        6,500.000 

School Health Corporation NO BID 500  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
UniPak Corp. 500  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

WCSD #431/1490

ITEM # 26:  Wash Cloths, Hygienic, 12.5 x 14.4, 1-Ply, ¼ Fold.
SAMPLE REQUIRED
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 1 PACKAGE
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 519209
Kimberly Clark x70 41200
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

TUB EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 185/2 cs 1187784 300 1  $            68.440  $      20,532.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. CLOROX 30826
185/TUB 2 TUB/CS 300 1 CASE (2 

TUBS)  $            31.000  $        9,300.000 *

Inland Supply Co. Inc. DIVERSEY OXIVIR 5627427 
160 WIPES/TUB 4 TUBS/CS 300 1 CASE (4 

TUBS)  $            31.500  $        9,450.000 

Interboro Packaging Corporation
300  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Clrxco 853531 300 CT  $            26.110  $        7,833.000 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 300  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products CLOROX #30826 300 300 TUBS  $            31.980  $        9,594.000 
Quill LLC CLOROX #934425Q 300 0  $            61.410  $      18,423.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Rally Inc. Clorox Healthcare #30826 300 2 Each (CASE)  $            43.000  $      12,900.000 

School Health Corporation NO BID 300  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
UniPak Corp. 300  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

ITEM # 27:  Wipes, Hydrogen Peroxide.
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 2 EACH
Pre-approved product number(s):
Clorox Healthcare 30826
WCSD #431/1510
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VENDOR NAME
BID ITEM DESCRIPTION: MFG. NAME / BRAND / 

PART #
ESTIMATED 

QTY.
MINIMUM 

ORDER QTY.
PRICE PER 

EACH EXT. PRICE

ITEM 
EVALUATION 

KEY
Henry Schein Medical a division of 
Henry Schein, Inc. 7021943 Vomex, LLC - VOMEX-1 3800 1  $              2.080  $        7,904.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

Inland Supply Co. Inc. NB 3800  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Interboro Packaging Corporation

3800  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

McKesson Medical-Surgical 
Government Solutions LLC Mgm16 831668 3800 EA  $              1.080  $        4,104.000 R.A.B.

Mini Wing USA 3800  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Pyramid School Products NO BID 3800  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
Quill LLC NO BID 3800  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

Rally Inc. Medgen Medical Products #3933 (25 per Bag / 4 Bags 
per Case) 3800 4 Bags (CASE) 

(100 each)  $              0.300  $        1,140.000 N.A.S./N.S.R.

School Health Corporation NO BID 3800  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.
UniPak Corp. 3800  $                  -     $                    -    N.B.

WCSD #431/1205

ITEM # 28:  Emesis Bag, Twist and Lock Collar, Latex-Free.
IF BIDDING AN "EQUAL" A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED - QTY 2 EACH
Pre-approve product numbers:
McKesson 831668
HIS 2900727

DATE: 01/13/23 PUR-F238(B) Page 30 of 30
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	7 12 16 17 18 26 27McKesson MedicalSurgical Government Solutions LLC: 
	7 12 16 17 18 26 27Mini Wing USA: 
	7 12 16 17 18 26 27Pyramid School Products: 
	7 12 16 17 18 26 27Quill LLC: 
	7 12 16 17 18 26 27Rally Inc: 
	2 8 9 13 21 22 25UniPak Corp: 
	ITEM  1 Alcohol Isopropyl 70 16 oz EXPIRATION DATE MUST EXTEND 2 YEARS INTO FUTURE FROM PURCHASE ORDER DATE IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 2 EACH Preapprove product numbers Henry Schein 1127067 McKesson 1022856 Swan 34042 Medline 969696: 
	WCSD 4311000: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_2: 
	 394560: 
	MEDLINE 98003ZInterboro Packaging Corporation: 
	196: 
	Mini Wing USA: 
	9696: 
	Quill LLC: 
	Rally Inc: 
	12 Bottles CASE96: 
	NASNSR 243840: 
	MCKESSON 23D0222SH 1039746UniPak Corp: 
	12 Bottles CASE96_2: 
	WCSD 4311005: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_3: 
	NASNSR 1320000: 
	FIRST AID ONLY H307 50BOXInterboro Packaging Corporation: 
	1 BOX200: 
	Mgm16 865276Mini Wing USA: 
	BX200: 
	BX200_2: 
	Quill LLC_2: 
	BX200_3: 
	Rally Inc_2: 
	fill_14: 
	PROFESSIONAL MEDICAL 0611303SH 49174UniPak Corp: 
	0200: 
	ITEM  3 Bags Ice Twist and Tie Noleak 4 x 2 x 12 100Package SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 2 EACH Preapprove product numbers El Kay Plastics T4080301: 
	WCSD 4311030: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY1075: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_4: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY1075_2: 
	Interboro Packaging Corporation: 
	1075: 
	 0083: 
	 89440: 
	NASSR: 
	01075: 
	NoBidMini Wing USA: 
	01075_2: 
	01075_3: 
	Quill LLC_3: 
	01075_4: 
	Rally Inc_3: 
	01075_5: 
	01075_6: 
	NO BIDUniPak Corp: 
	01075_7: 
	ITEM  4 Bandaids Adhesive 1 x 3 FlexibleFabric LatexFree 100Box SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 BOX Preapprove product numbers Henry Schein 1126133 McKesson 466872 NutramaxDermaScience 85949 Curaplex 112214960: 
	WCSD 4311060: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_5: 
	JOHNSON  JOHNSON 4444Interboro Packaging Corporation: 
	1 BOX2000: 
	Mini Wing USA_2: 
	CASE 12 BOX2000: 
	Quill LLC_4: 
	Rally Inc_4: 
	12 Boxes CASE2000: 
	NASNSR 5820000: 
	MEDLINE SH32006SH 32006UniPak Corp: 
	12 Boxes CASE2000_2: 
	ITEM  5 Bandaids Adhesive 1 x 114 Inch Fabric Oval Tan Sterile SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 BOX Preapprove product numbers McKesson 1103072: 
	WCSD 4311070: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_6: 
	1276: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation: 
	1276_2: 
	Mgm16 1103072Mini Wing USA: 
	BX276: 
	BX276_2: 
	Quill LLC_5: 
	BX276_3: 
	Rally Inc_5: 
	24 Boxes CASE276: 
	BSNJOBST 7645612SH 1041348UniPak Corp: 
	24 Boxes CASE276_2: 
	ITEM  6 Bandaids Adhesive Large 2 x 414 FlexibleFabric Sheer or PlasticVinyl 	 LatexFree 50Box IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 BOX Preapprove product numbers McKesson 514534: 
	WCSD 4311080: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY676: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_7: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY676_2: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_2: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY676_3: 
	Mini Wing USA_3: 
	BOX676: 
	Quill LLC_6: 
	BOX676_2: 
	Rally Inc_6: 
	12 Boxes CASE676: 
	MEDLINE SH32120SH 32120UniPak Corp: 
	12 Boxes CASE676_2: 
	ITEM  7 Bandaids Fabric Fingertip 2 x 112 LatexFree 100Box SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 BOX Preapprove product numbers McKesson 466875 Curaplex 112214962: 
	WCSD 4311100: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_8: 
	FIRST AID ONLY G126 40BXInterboro Packaging Corporation: 
	1 BOX180: 
	Mgm16 466875Mini Wing USA: 
	BX180: 
	BX180_2: 
	Quill LLC_7: 
	Rally Inc_7: 
	12 Boxes CASE180: 
	BSNJOBST 7645612SH 1041357UniPak Corp: 
	12 Boxes CASE180_2: 
	ITEM  8 Bandaids Fabric Knuckle 112 x 3 LatexFree 100Box SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 BOX Preapprove product numbers McKesson 466873 Curaplex 14966: 
	WCSD 4311110: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_9: 
	NASNSR 1220400: 
	MEDLINE 25510Interboro Packaging Corporation: 
	1 BOX216: 
	Mgm16 466873Mini Wing USA: 
	BX216: 
	BX216_2: 
	Quill LLC_8: 
	Rally Inc_8: 
	12 Boxes CASE216: 
	MEDLINE SH32230SH 32230UniPak Corp: 
	12 Boxes CASE216_2: 
	ITEM  9 Emergency MylarFoil Blanket Disposable Minimum 52 x 80 Individually wrapped IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 2 EACH Preapprove product numbers McKesson 1112301 Dynarex 572224 Kentron 886656 Curaplex 12945: 
	WCSD 4311120: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_10: 
	196_2: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_3: 
	196_3: 
	196_4: 
	NoBidMini Wing USA_2: 
	196_5: 
	196_6: 
	Quill LLC_9: 
	Rally Inc_9: 
	096: 
	096_2: 
	NDC 721SH 48025UniPak Corp: 
	096_3: 
	ITEM  10 Cotton Balls NonSterile 500Package IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 PACKAGE Preapprove product numbers Kendall K102600 Kentron 4440010500 Covidien 30011: 
	WCSD 4311160: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY36: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_11: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY36_2: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_4: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY36_3: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY36_4: 
	NoBidMini Wing USA_3: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY36_5: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY36_6: 
	Quill LLC_10: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY36_7: 
	Rally Inc_10: 
	Rally Inc_11: 
	2 Bags CASE36: 
	NO BIDUniPak Corp_2: 
	2 Bags CASE36_2: 
	WCSD 4311190: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_12: 
	136: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_5: 
	136_2: 
	136_3: 
	NoBidMini Wing USA_4: 
	136_4: 
	136_5: 
	Quill LLC_11: 
	136_6: 
	Rally Inc_12: 
	136_7: 
	136_8: 
	AREO HEALTH AM01SHSH 59701UniPak Corp: 
	136_9: 
	ITEM  12 Cups Plastic 35 Oz 25 BagsCase 100 CupsBag IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 CASE Preapprove product numbers TIDI 1017762 Solo Cup 1014664 Kentron 884235 Dart DCY35 Essendant 1030643: 
	WCSD 4311190_2: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY60: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_13: 
	BOARDWALK TRANSCUP 3CT 125SLEEVE 20 SLCSInterboro Packaging Corporation: 
	1 CASE60: 
	1 CASE60_2: 
	NoBidMini Wing USA_5: 
	1 CASE60_3: 
	NB 5038800: 
	Quill LLC_12: 
	Rally Inc_13: 
	1 CASE60_4: 
	NASNSR 5405400: 
	ESSENDANT DCC Y35  SH 1030643UniPak Corp: 
	1 CASE60_5: 
	ITEM  13 Examination Table Paper 18 x 125 Crepe or Smooth 12 RollsCase IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 CASE Preapprove product numbers McKesson 919570 Kentron 918125 Medline MIINON 24324 Graham 002 Tidi 23324 Avalon 77095: 
	WCSD 4311230: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_14: 
	1 CS12: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_6: 
	1 CS12_2: 
	Mgm143 919570Mini Wing USA: 
	CS12: 
	CS12_2: 
	Quill LLC_13: 
	CS12_3: 
	Rally Inc_14: 
	NB 636000: 
	Rally Inc_15: 
	1 CASE12: 
	NORTECH LAB N18125 SH 1030647UniPak Corp: 
	1 CASE12_2: 
	ITEM  14 Gauze Bandage Elastic Rolled Minimum 2 x 3½ Yards NonSterile 12Package SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 PACKAGE Preapprove product numbers McKesson 1067841 McKesson 993032 Kentron 440002 Dynarex 3102 HIS 1048825: 
	WCSD 4311260: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_15: 
	148: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_7: 
	148_2: 
	Mmc16 1067841Mini Wing USA: 
	BG48: 
	BG48_2: 
	Quill LLC_14: 
	BG48_3: 
	Rally Inc_16: 
	Rally Inc_17: 
	NASNSR 216000: 
	8 Packages CASE25048: 
	MEDLINE SH27551 SH 27551UniPak Corp: 
	8 Packages CASE25048_2: 
	ITEM  15 Gauze Pads 3 x 3 NonSterile 200Package SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 PACKAGE Preapprove product numbers McKesson 446030 Kentron 338111 Medpride MPR60583: 
	WCSD 4311270: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_16: 
	184: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_8: 
	184_2: 
	Mgm16 446030Mini Wing USA: 
	PK84: 
	PK84_2: 
	Quill LLC_15: 
	PK84_3: 
	Rally Inc_18: 
	20 Packages CASE84: 
	MEDLINE SH27545SH 27545UniPak Corp: 
	20 Packages CASE84_2: 
	ITEM  16 Synthetic LatexFree powderfree Nitrile or Vinyl exam gloves 100Box Size Small SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 BOX Preapprove product numbers School Health 21324 McKesson 832681: 
	WCSD 4311810: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_17: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_18: 
	Interboro Packaging Corporation_2: 
	Mini Wing USA_4: 
	Quill LLC_16: 
	Rally Inc_19: 
	Rally Inc_20: 
	10 Boxes CASE150: 
	UniPak Corp: 
	ITEM  17 Synthetic LatexFree powderfree Nitrile or Vinyl exam gloves 100Box Size Medium SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 BOX Preapprove product numbers McKesson 832682 School Health 21325: 
	WCSD 4311820: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_19: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_20: 
	Interboro Packaging Corporation_3: 
	Mini Wing USA_5: 
	Quill LLC_17: 
	Rally Inc_21: 
	Rally Inc_22: 
	10 Boxes CASE500: 
	UniPak Corp_2: 
	ITEM  18 Synthetic LatexFree powderfree Nitrile or Vinyl exam gloves 100Box Size Large SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 BOX Preapprove product numbers McKesson 832683 School Health 21327: 
	WCSD 4311830: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_21: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_22: 
	Interboro Packaging Corporation_4: 
	Mgm14 832683: 
	500: 
	BX: 
	 6820: 
	 3410000: 
	RAB: 
	Mini Wing USA_6: 
	Quill LLC_18: 
	Rally Inc_23: 
	Rally Inc_24: 
	10 Boxes CASE500_2: 
	UniPak Corp_3: 
	10 Boxes CASE500_3: 
	WCSD 4311310: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_23: 
	LYSOL IC FOAM DISINF RAC02775 CTInterboro Packaging Corporation: 
	1 EACH40: 
	Mini Wing USA_7: 
	1 CASE  10 BOX40: 
	Quill LLC_19: 
	Rally Inc_25: 
	040: 
	040_2: 
	LYSOL RAC95524CTSH 34233UniPak Corp: 
	040_3: 
	ITEM  20 Pillow Covers Poly Disposable 21 x 30 LatexFree IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 2 EACH Preapprove product numbers McKesson 1107575 Kentron 213012: 
	WCSD 4311320: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY1300: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_24: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY1300_2: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_9: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY1300_3: 
	Mgm18 1107575Mini Wing USA: 
	EA1300: 
	EA1300_2: 
	Quill LLC_20: 
	EA1300_3: 
	Rally Inc_26: 
	1 CASE of 1001300: 
	NO BIDUniPak Corp_3: 
	1 CASE of 1001300_2: 
	ITEM  21 Scissors Lister Bandage 412 Stainless Steel IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 EACH Preapprove product numbers Chanby 3789798 McKesson 487479 Kentron KI144 Lister 36222: 
	WCSD 4311340: 
	ITEM EVALUATION KEY 67500: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_25: 
	118: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_10: 
	118_2: 
	Mgm43 487479Mini Wing USA: 
	EA18: 
	EA18_2: 
	Quill LLC_21: 
	EA18_3: 
	Rally Inc_27: 
	118_3: 
	LISTER W36030SH 36222UniPak Corp: 
	118_4: 
	ITEM  22 Sponge Nu Gauze 2 x 2 4Ply Absorbency NonSterile General Use 200Pack SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 PACKAGE Preapprove product numbers McKesson 446034 Kentron 250224 Dukal 8520094 Moore 44122 Kimcon 41200: 
	WCSD 4311420: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_26: 
	175: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_11: 
	175_2: 
	Mgm16 446034Mini Wing USA: 
	PK75: 
	PK75_2: 
	Quill LLC_22: 
	PK75_3: 
	Rally Inc_28: 
	20 Packages CASE75: 
	MEDLINE SH27539SH 27539UniPak Corp: 
	20 Packages CASE75_2: 
	ITEM  23 Tape Micropore Surgical ½ x 10 Yards LatexFree SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 2 EACH Preapprove product numbers McKesson 944357: 
	WCSD 4311430: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY120: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_27: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY120_2: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_12: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY120_3: 
	Mgm115 944357Mini Wing USA: 
	EA120: 
	EA120_2: 
	Quill LLC_23: 
	EA120_3: 
	Rally Inc_29: 
	10 Boxes CASE 240 rolls120: 
	NDC 15300SH 28069UniPak Corp: 
	10 Boxes CASE 240 rolls120_2: 
	ITEM  24 Tape Micropore Surgical 1 x 10 Yards LatexFree SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 2 EACH Preapprove product numbers McKesson 944358: 
	WCSD 4311440: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY150: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_28: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY150_2: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_13: 
	MINIMUM ORDER QTY150_3: 
	Mgm115 944358Mini Wing USA: 
	BX150: 
	BX150_2: 
	Quill LLC_24: 
	Rally Inc_30: 
	10 Boxes CASE 240 rolls150: 
	NDC 15301SH 28072UniPak Corp: 
	10 Boxes CASE 240 rolls150_2: 
	ITEM  25 Tongue Depressors 500Box Nonsterile Nonflavored IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 BOX Preapprove product numbers HSI 1002416 McKesson 484942 Kentron 450675: 
	WCSD 4311470: 
	ITEM EVALUATION KEY 312400: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_29: 
	140: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_14: 
	140_2: 
	Mgm16 484942Mini Wing USA: 
	BX40: 
	BX40_2: 
	Quill LLC_25: 
	Rally Inc_31: 
	10 Boxes CASE40: 
	MEDLINE SH90022SH 90022UniPak Corp: 
	10 Boxes CASE40_2: 
	ITEM  26 Wash Cloths Hygienic 125 x 144 1Ply ¼ Fold SAMPLE REQUIRED IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 1 PACKAGE Preapprove product numbers McKesson 519209 Kimberly Clark x70 41200: 
	WCSD 4311490: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_30: 
	KC X70 41200 76PK 12PKCSInterboro Packaging Corporation: 
	1 CASE 12 PKS500: 
	Kclapc 519209Mini Wing USA: 
	PK500: 
	PK500_2: 
	Quill LLC_26: 
	PK500_3: 
	Rally Inc_32: 
	NB 6500000: 
	12 Packages CASE250500: 
	NO BIDUniPak Corp_4: 
	12 Packages CASE250500_2: 
	ITEM  27 Wipes Hydrogen Peroxide IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 2 EACH Preapproved product numbers Clorox Healthcare 30826: 
	WCSD 4311510: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_31: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_32: 
	 9450000: 
	DIVERSEY OXIVIR 5627427 160 WIPESTUB 4 TUBSCSInterboro Packaging Corporation: 
	1 CASE 4 TUBS300: 
	Clrxco 853531Mini Wing USA: 
	CT300: 
	NB 9594000: 
	Quill LLC_27: 
	Rally Inc_33: 
	NASNSR 12900000: 
	2 Each CASE300: 
	NO BIDUniPak Corp_5: 
	2 Each CASE300_2: 
	ITEM  28 Emesis Bag Twist and Lock Collar LatexFree IF BIDDING AN EQUAL A SAMPLE MUST BE PROVIDED  QTY 2 EACH Preapprove product numbers McKesson 831668 HIS 2900727: 
	WCSD 4311205: 
	Inland Supply Co Inc_33: 
	13800: 
	NBInterboro Packaging Corporation_15: 
	13800_2: 
	Mgm16 831668Mini Wing USA: 
	EA3800: 
	EA3800_2: 
	Quill LLC_28: 
	EA3800_3: 
	Rally Inc_34: 
	4 Bags CASE 100 each3800: 
	NO BIDUniPak Corp_6: 
	4 Bags CASE 100 each3800_2: 
		2023-07-18T17:36:32-0700
	Gretchen Seiders




