0 .Y,
V Washoe County School District

Purchasing Department - 14101 Old Virginia Road « Reno, NV 89521
Phone (775) 850-8025 « Fax (775) 857-3175

03/25/26

TO:

Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid School Products
S&S Worldwide

School Specialty LLC

The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office Plus of Nevada

RE: Request for Bid ~ Recommendation of Award (ROA)

For the Request for Bid for Classroom Art Paper for Warehouse Inventory, RFB #86-B-01-
26-GS, Washoe County School District’s (WCSD) Purchasing Department is recommending
award for an initial one (1) year term beginning 04/02/26 and expiring on 04/01/27 to:

PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY D/B/A PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS
THE OFFICE SUPPLIERS INC. DBA OFFICE PLUS OF NEVADA

A copy of the ROA Tabulation is attached for reference and is also available online at:
https://solicitations.washoeschools.net/Purchasing/Default?ProjectID=4960

Pursuant to Nevada Revised Statute (NRS), Chapter 332.068, this memo serves as formal
notification that the formal appeal period has commenced and will close on 04/01/26 at 4:30
pm (local time). For more instructions on filing a notice of appeal, submitting appellants are
advised to refer to NRS 332.068 and the RFB solicitation document available online at:
https://solicitations.washoeschools.net/Purchasing/Default?ProjectID=4960

The anticipated award of this solicitation is 04/02/26 with the posting and distribution of the
official Notice of Award following shortly thereafter.

Please submit any inquiries or questions regarding the ROA in writing to:
solicitations@washoeschools.net.

Thank you for your interest in doing business with WCSD.

WCSD Purchasing Department
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WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

SOLICITATION TITLE: CLASSROOM ART PAPER FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY

SOLICITATION #: 86-B-01-26-GS

RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD - ROA TABULATION

ITEM EVALUATION KEY:

RAB  REJECT ALL BIDS (PER ITEM) (RB REJECT BID (PER VENDOR)
IS INSUFFICIENT SPECS NO SPEC  NO SPECIFICATIONS

NC NO CHARGE NO SUB NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED
SRL  SAMPLE RECEIVED LATE SR SAMPLE REJECTED

NLA  NO LONGER AVAILABLE NSR NO SAMPLE RECEIVED

NAS  NOT AS SPECIFIED DMO DECLINED MINIMUM ORDER
NB NO BID ROA RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD
NC NO CHARGE ROA-T TIED/ CHOSEN BY LOTTERY
PBO  PARTIAL BID ONLY

Digitally signed by Gretchen Seiders

BUYER HAS REVIEWED AND APPROVED: GretChen SEIderS Date: 2026.03.25 11:49:26 -0700" | DATE: March 25, 2026

SURETY REQUIRED: NO

PUBLIC REVIEW WINDOW CLOSES AT 4:30 PM (LOCAL TIME) ON: April 1, 2026

SUMMARY OF RESULTS AND TOTAL COST REPORT

VENDOR NAME

LOW BID BY ITEM NUMBER(S)

LOW ITEM BID

TOTAL

Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply

Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid
School Products

1,2,3,4,56,7,8,9

19,417.50

S&S Worldwide

School Specialty LLC

The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office Plus

of Nevada

10, 11, 12, 13, 14,15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38

58,833.00

ESTIMATED CONTRACT TOTAL VALUE (INITIAL TERM)=

$

78,250.50

DELIVERY: Per Section 30.1 of the SOLICITATION DOCUMENT: All bid item pallets must be uniform in case quantity with a pallet height no greater than 88" for delivery.

BASIS OF AWARD: Per Section 29.1 of the SOLICITATION DOCUMENT: It is the intent of WCSD to award this solicitation (contract) on a "BY SECTION” basis to up to two (2) Vendors deemed to be the lowest responsive and
responsible Bidder(s) whose submission(s) meet all terms, conditions, and specifications of this solicitation.

REVISED DATE: 09/15/22

EXHIBIT C
PRICE SCHEDULE/SPEC SHEET (REQUIRED FORM)
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SECTION A - ART ROLL PAPER
ITEM #1 Paper, Art Roll, Black, 50 Ib. Basis, 36” X 1000’
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUO-FINISH P0067301 "Black"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/3700)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER ROLL COST PER CASE (ROLLS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 45 $ - NB
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Dixon/Pacon Dixon/Pacon in Full
Pyramid School Products Dixon/Pacon P0067301 P0067301 Cases $ 58.640( $ 58.640 45 $ 2,638.800 ROA
S&S Worldwide (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) 45 $ - NB
School Specialty LLC Dixon ARTKRAFT P0067301 006261 0 $ 72.790 (BLANK) 45 $ 3,275.550
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office Plus|
of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P0067301 (BLANK) 1 $ 65.160 65.16 45 $ 2,932.200
ITEM #2 Paper, Art Roll, Dark Blue, 50 Ib. Basis, 36” X 1000’
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUO-FINISH P0067181 "Dark Blue"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/3710)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER ROLL COST PER CASE (ROLLS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 30 $ - NB
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Dixon/Pacon Dixon/Pacon in Full
Pyramid School Products Dixon/Pacon P0067181 P0067181 Cases $ 54.240| $ 52.240 30 $ 1,627.200 ROA
S&S Worldwide (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) 30 $ - NB
School Specialty LLC Dixon ARTKRAFT P0067181 006258 0 $ 70.220 (BLANK) 30 $ 2,106.600
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office Plus
of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P0067181 (BLANK) 1 $ 60.270 60.27 30 $ 1,808.100
EXHIBIT C
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Approved Product:

ITEM #3 Paper, Art Roll, Brown, 50 Ib. Basis, 36” X 1000"

DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUO-FINISH P0067021 "Brown"

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

(WCSD #611/3720)

MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER ROLL COST PER CASE (ROLLS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 30 $ - NB
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Dixon/Pacon Dixon/Pacon in Full
Pyramid School Products Dixon/Pacon P0067021 P0067021 Cases $ 52.890| $ 52.890 30 $ 1,586.700 ROA
S&S Worldwide (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) 30 $ - NB
School Specialty LLC Dixon ARTKRAFT P0067021 006243 0 $ 70.230 (BLANK) 30 $ 2,106.900
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office Plus|
of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P0067021 (BLANK) 1 $ 58.770 | $ 58.770 30 $ 1,763.100
ITEM #4 Paper, Art Roll, Green, 50 Ib. Basis, 36” X 1000"
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUO-FINISH P0067141 "Emerald"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/3730)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER ROLL COST PER CASE (ROLLS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 30 $ - NB
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Dixon/Pacon Dixon/Pacon in Full
Pyramid School Products Dixon/Pacon P0067141 P0067141 Cases $ 50.280( $ 50.280 30 $ 1,508.400 ROA
S&S Worldwide (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) 30 $ - NB
School Specialty LLC Dixon ARTKRAFT P0067141 006255 0 $ 64.990| $ - 30 $ 1,949.700
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office Plus|
of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P0067141 (BLANK) 0 $ 70.540| $ 70.540 30 $ 2,116.200
EXHIBIT C
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ITEM #5 Paper, Art Roll, Orange, 50 Ib. Basis, 36” X 1000
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUO-FINISH P0067101 "Orange"

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

(WCSD #611/3740)

MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER ROLL COST PER CASE (ROLLS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 30 $ - NB
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Dixon/Pacon Dixon/Pacon in Full
Pyramid School Products Dixon/Pacon P0067101 P0067101 Cases $ 63.490( $ 63.490 30 $ 1,904.700 ROA
S&S Worldwide (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) 30 $ - NB
School Specialty LLC Dixon ARTKRAFT P0067101 006252 0 $ 85.020| $ - 30 $ 2,550.600
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office Plus
of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P0067101 (BLANK) 0 $ 70.540| $ 70.540 30 $ 2,116.200
ITEM #6 Paper, Art Roll, Pink, 50 Ib. Basis, 36” X 1000"
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUO-FINISH P0067261 "Pink"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/3750)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER ROLL COST PER CASE (ROLLS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 30 $ - NB
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Dixon/Pacon Dixon/Pacon in Full
Pyramid School Products Dixon/Pacon P0067261 P0067261 Cases $ 61.550( $ 61.550 30 $ 1,846.500 ROA
S&S Worldwide (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) 30 $ - NB
School Specialty LLC Dixon ARTKRAFT P0067261 006459 0 $ 80.200| $ - 30 $ 2,406.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office Plus
of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P0067261 (BLANK) 1 $ 68.390 | $ 68.390 30 $ 2,051.700
EXHIBIT C
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Approved Product:

ITEM #7 Paper, Art Roll, Red, 50 Ib. Basis, 36” X 1000

DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUO-FINISH P0067041 "Scarlet"

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

(WCSD #611/3760)

MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER ROLL COST PER CASE (ROLLS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 30 $ - NB
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Dixon/Pacon Dixon/Pacon in Full
Pyramid School Products Dixon/Pacon P0067041 P0067041 Cases $ 57.320| $ 57.320 30 $ 1,719.600 ROA
S&S Worldwide (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) 30 $ - NB
School Specialty LLC Dixon ARTKRAFT P0067041 006546 0 $ 76.200| $ - 30 $ 2,286.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office Plus
of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P0067041 (BLANK) 1 $ 63.720| $ 63.720 30 $ 1,911.600
ITEM #8 Paper, Art Roll, White, 50 Ib. Basis, 36” X 1000”
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUO-FINISH P0067001 "White"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/3770)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER ROLL COST PER CASE (ROLLS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 90 $ - NB
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Dixon/Pacon Dixon/Pacon in Full
Pyramid School Products Dixon/Pacon P0067001 P0067001 Cases $ 52.010| $ 52.010 90 $ 4,680.900 ROA
DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON
S&S Worldwide ARTKRAFT DUO-FINISH P0067001 PE2132003 N/A 99.59 99.59 90 $ 8,963.100 RB
School Specialty LLC Dixon ARTKRAFT P0067001 006240 0 $ 66.750| $ - 90 $ 6,007.500
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office Plus
of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P0067001 (BLANK) 1 $ 57.790( $ 57.790 90 $ 5,201.100
EXHIBIT C
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Approved Product:

ITEM #9 Paper, Art Roll, Yellow, 50 Ib. Basis, 36” X 1000”

DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUO-FINISH P0067081 "Canary"

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

(WCSD #611/3780)

MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION

VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER ROLL COST PER CASE (ROLLS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 30 $ - NB

$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Dixon/Pacon Dixon/Pacon in Full
Pyramid School Products Dixon/Pacon P0067081 P0067081 Cases $ 63.490( $ 63.490 30 $ 1,904.700 ROA
S&S Worldwide (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) (BLANK) 30 $ - NB
School Specialty LLC Dixon ARTKRAFT P0067081 006249 0 $ 85.390| $ - 30 $ 2,561.700
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office Plus|
of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P0067081 (BLANK) 1 $ 70.540| $ 70.540 30 $ 2,116.200
SECTION B - CONSTRUCTION PAPER
ITEM #10 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Black, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103029 "Black"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/3940)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION

VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103029 9SULFBK No mininum $ 3.140| $ 78.500 1700 $ 5,338.000 PBO

$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103029 P103029 Cases $ 1.490| $ 74.500 1700 $ 2,533.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103029 PE470 N/A 2.010 107.070 1700 $ 3,417.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103029 1006763 0 1.930( $ 96.500 1700 $ 3,281.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103029 (BLANK) 1 $ 1.660| $ 82.780 1700 $ 2,822.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
REVISED DATE: 09/15/22 PAGE 6 OF 20
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Approved Product:

DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103022 "Blue"

ITEM #11 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Blue, Pack of 50

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

(WCSD #611/3950)

MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION

VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103022 9SULFBL No mininum $ 3.140| $ 78.500 1400 $ 4,396.000 PBO

$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103022 P103022 Cases $ 1.730| $ 86.500 1400 $ 2,422.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103022 PE463 N/A $ 2.010| $ 107.070 1400 $ 2,814.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103022 054027 0 $ 1.970( $ 98.500 1400 $ 2,758.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103022 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.920| $ 96.110 1400 $ 2,688.000 ROA
ITEM #12 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Dark Brown, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103024 "Dark Brown"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/3960)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION

VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 600 $ - PBO

$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103024 P103024 Cases $ 1.630| $ 81.500 600 $ 978.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103024 PE465 N/A $ 2.010| $ 107.070 600 $ 1,206.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103024 054033 0 $ 1.800( $ 90.000 600 $ 1,080.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103024 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.810| $ 90.560 600 $ 1,086.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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ITEM #13 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Deep Green, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P102960 "Holiday Green"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/3970)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 450 $ - PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P102960 P102960 Cases $ 1.760| $ 88.000 450 $ 792.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P10296 PE448 N/A $ 2.010| $ 107.070 450 $ 904.500
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P102960 216777 0 $ 2.250| $ 112.500 450 $ 1,012.500
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P102960 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.960| $ 97.780 450 $ 882.000 ROA
ITEM #14 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Deep Red, Pack of 50.
Approved Product Number(s):
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P102993 "Holiday Red."
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/3980)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 300 $ - PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P102993 P102993 Cases $ 1.680| $ 84.000 300 $ 504.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P102993 PE471 N/A $ 2.010| $ 107.070 300 $ 603.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P102993 216775 0 $ 2.250| $ 112.500 300 $ 675.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P102993 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.870| $ 88.330 300 $ 561.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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Approved Product:

DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103027 "Gray"

ITEM #15 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Gray, Pack of 50

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

(WCSD #611/3990)

MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION

VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 650 $ - PBO

$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103027 P103027 Cases $ 1.590( $ 79.500 650 $ 1,033.500 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103027 PE1911 N/A $ 2.010| $ 111.930 650 $ 1,306.500
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103027 054042 0 $ 1.800( $ 90.000 650 $ 1,170.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103027 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.770 | $ 88.330 650 $ 1,150.500 ROA
ITEM #16 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Green, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103006 "Festive Green"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4000)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION

VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103006 9SULFGR No minimum $ 3.140| $ 78.500 1000 $ 3,140.000 PBO

$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103006 P103006 Cases $ 1.900| $ 95.000 1000 $ 1,900.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103006 PE1908 N/A $ 2.010| $ 107.070 1000 $ 2,010.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103006 053976 0 $ 2.170| $ 108.500 1000 $ 2,170.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103006 (BLANK) 0 $ 2,110 $ 105.560 1000 $ 2,110.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
REVISED DATE: 09/15/22 PAGE 9 OF 20
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Approved Product:

DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103016 "Sky Blue"

ITEM #17 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Light Blue, Pack of 50

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

(WCSD #611/4010)

REVISED DATE: 09/15/22

PRICE SCHEDULE/SPEC SHEET (REQUIRED FORM)

MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION

VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103016 9SULFSB No minimum $ 3.140| $ 78.500 800 $ 2,512.000 PBO

$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103016 P103016 Cases $ 1.540| $ 77.000 800 $ 1,232.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103016 PE458 N/A $ 2.010| $ 107.070 800 $ 1,608.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103016 054009 0 1.800| $ 90.000 800 $ 1,440.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103016 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.710| $ 85.560 800 $ 1,368.000 ROA
ITEM #18 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Light Brown, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103025 "Warm Brown"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4020)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION

VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103025 9SULFBR No minimum $ 3.140| $ 78.500 400 $ 1,256.000 PBO

$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103025 P103025 Cases $ 1.530| $ 76.500 400 $ 612.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103025 PE466 N/A 2.010 107.070 400 804.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103025 054036 0 1.800 90.000 400 720.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103025 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.700 | $ 85.000 400 $ 680.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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REVISED DATE: 09/15/22

PRICE SCHEDULE/SPEC SHEET (REQUIRED FORM)

ITEM #19 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Light Green, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103423 19SC "Brilliant Lime"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4030)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103423 9SULFLI No minimum $ 3.140| $ 78.500 500 $ 1,570.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103423 P103423 Cases $ 1.800| $ 90.000 500 $ 900.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103423 19SC PE1907 N/A 2.010| $ 111.930 500 $ 1,005.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103423 053985 0 $ 1.970| $ 98.500 500 $ 985.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103423 (BLANK) 0 $ 2,000 | $ 100.000 500 $ 1,000.000 ROA
ITEM #20 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Magenta, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103000 "Magenta"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4040)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 350 $ - PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103000 P103000 Cases $ 1.780( $ 89.000 350 $ 623.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103000 PE1909 N/A $ 2.010| $ 111.930 350 $ 703.500
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103000 053958 0 $ 1.970 98.500 350 $ 689.500
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103000 (BLANK) 0 $ 1980 | $ 98.890 350 $ 693.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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Approved Product:

DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103002 "Orange"

ITEM #21 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Orange, Pack of 50

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

(WCSD #611/4050)

REVISED DATE: 09/15/22

PRICE SCHEDULE/SPEC SHEET (REQUIRED FORM)

MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103002 9SULFOR No minimum $ 3.140| $ 78.500 1000 $ 3,140.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103002 P103002 Cases $ 1.680( $ 84.000 1000 $ 1,680.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103002 PE444 N/A $ 2.010| $ 107.070 1000 $ 2,010.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103002 053964 0 $ 1.970( $ 98.500 1000 $ 1,970.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103002 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.870( $ 93.330 1000 $ 1,870.000 ROA
ITEM #22 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Bright Pink, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103013 "Shocking Pink"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4060)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103013 9SULFPI No minimum $ 3.140| $ 78.500 1100 $ 3,454.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103013 P103013 Cases $ 1.700( $ 85.000 1100 $ 1,870.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103013 PE1968 N/A $ 2.010| $ 107.070 1100 $ 2,211.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103013 054000 0 $ 1.970( $ 98.500 1100 $ 2,167.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103013 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.890| $ 94.440 1100 $ 2,079.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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Approved Product:

DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103431 "Festive Red"

ITEM #23 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Red, Pack of 50

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

(WCSD #611/4070)

REVISED DATE: 09/15/22

PRICE SCHEDULE/SPEC SHEET (REQUIRED FORM)

MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103431 9SULFRE No minimum $ 3.140| $ 78.500 1300 $ 4,082.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103431 P103431 Cases $ 1.680| $ 84.000 1300 $ 2,184.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103431 PE508 N/A 2.010| $ 107.070 1300 $ 2,613.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103431 054648 0 1.970( $ 98.500 1300 $ 2,561.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103431 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.870| $ 93.330 1300 $ 2,431.000 ROA
ITEM #24 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Violet, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103009 "Violet"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4080)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKGS) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103009 9SULFPU No minimum $ 3.140| $ 78.500 950 $ 2,983.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103009 P103009 Cases $ 1.630| $ 81.500 950 $ 1,548.500 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103009 PE451 N/A $ 2.010| $ 107.070 950 $ 1,909.500
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103009 053988 0 $ 1.930( $ 96.500 950 $ 1,833.500
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103009 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.810| $ 90.560 950 $ 1,719.500 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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Approved Product:

DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103026 53SC "White"

ITEM #25 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, White, Pack of 50

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

(WCSD #611/4090)

REVISED DATE: 09/15/22

PRICE SCHEDULE/SPEC SHEET (REQUIRED FORM)

MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103026 9SULFWH No minimum $ 3.140| $ 78.500 5200 $ 16,328.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103026 P103026 Cases $ 1.410| $ 70.500 5200 $ 7,332.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103026 53SC PE467 N/A $ 2.010| $ 107.070 5200 $ 10,452.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P10302 1006764 0 $ 1.590( $ 79.500 5200 $ 8,268.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103026 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.570| $ 78.330 5200 $ 8,164.000 ROA
ITEM #26 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 9 x 12 Inches, Yellow, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103004 "Yellow"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4100)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103004 9SULFYE No minimum $ 3.140| $ 78.500 1800 $ 5,652.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103004 P103004 Cases $ 1.620( $ 81.000 1800 $ 2,916.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103004 PE446 N/A $ 2.010| $ 107.070 1800 $ 3,618.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103004 053970 0 $ 1.930( $ 96.500 1800 $ 3,474.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103004 (BLANK) 0 $ 1.800| $ 90.000 1800 $ 3,240.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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REVISED DATE: 09/15/22

PRICE SCHEDULE/SPEC SHEET (REQUIRED FORM)

ITEM #27 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 12 x 18 Inches, Black, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103061 "Black"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4110)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103061 12SULFBK No minimum $ 5.660( $ 141.500 1000 $ 5,660.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103061 P103061 Cases $ 2,770 $ 69.250 1000 $ 2,770.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103061 PE501 N/A $ 4.000| $ 106.710 1000 $ 4,000.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103061 054150 0 $ 3.700| $ 92.500 1000 $ 3,700.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103061 (BLANK) 0 $ 3.080( $ 76.940 1000 $ 3,080.000 ROA
ITEM #28 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 12 x 18 Inches, Blue, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103054 "Blue"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4120)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103061 12SULFBL No minimum $ 5.660( $ 141.500 650 $ 3,679.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103054 P103054 Cases $ 3.300| $ 82.500 650 $ 2,145.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103054 PE494 N/A $ 4.000| $ 106.710 650 $ 2,600.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103054 054129 0 $ 3.840| $ 96.000 650 $ 2,496.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103054 (BLANK) 0 $ 3.670 | $ 91.670 650 $ 2,385.500 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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REVISED DATE: 09/15/22

PRICE SCHEDULE/SPEC SHEET (REQUIRED FORM)

ITEM #29 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 12 x 18 Inches, Brown, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103056 "Dark Brown"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4130)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 250 $ - PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103056 P103056 Cases $ 3.120| $ 78.000 250 $ 780.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P10305 PE496 N/A $ 4.000| $ 106.710 250 $ 1,000.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103056 054135 0 $ 3.650| $ 91.250 250 $ 912.500
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103056 (BLANK) 0 $ 3.470( $ 86.670 250 $ 867.500 ROA
ITEM #30 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 12 x 18 Inches, Deep Green, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P102961 "Holiday Green"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4140)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply NO BID $ - $ - 150 $ - PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P102961 P102961 Cases $ 3.420| $ 85.500 150 $ 513.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P102961 PE479 N/A $ 4.000| $ 106.710 150 $ 600.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P102961 216778 0 $ 4.440| $ 111.000 150 $ 666.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P102961 (BLANK) 0 $ 3.800( $ 95.000 150 $ 570.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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REVISED DATE: 09/15/22

PRICE SCHEDULE/SPEC SHEET (REQUIRED FORM)

ITEM #31 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 12 x 18 Inches, Green, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103038 "Festive Green"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4150)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103038 12SULFGR No minimum $ 5.660( $ 141.500 600 $ 3,396.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103038 P103038 Cases $ 3.670| $ 91.750 600 $ 2,202.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103038 PE1925 N/A $ 4.000| $ 106.710 600 $ 2,400.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103038 054075 0 $ 4.220| $ 105.500 600 $ 2,532.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103038 (BLANK) 0 $ 4.080 | $ 101.940 600 $ 2,448.000 ROA
ITEM #32 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 12 x 18 Inches, Light Brown, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103057 "Warm Brown"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4160)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103057 12SULFBR No minimum $ 5.940( $ 148.500 150 $ 891.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103057 P103057 Cases $ 2920| $ 73.000 150 $ 438.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103057 PE497 N/A $ 4.000| $ 106.710 150 $ 600.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103057 054138 0 $ 3.610| $ 90.250 150 $ 541.500
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103057 (BLANK) 0 $ 3.240( $ 81.110 150 $ 486.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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REVISED DATE: 09/15/22

PRICE SCHEDULE/SPEC SHEET (REQUIRED FORM)

ITEM #33 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 12 x 18 Inches, Orange, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103034 "Orange"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4170)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103034 12SULFOR No minimum $ 5.660( $ 141.500 250 $ 1,415.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103034 P103034 Cases $ 3.200| $ 80.000 250 $ 800.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103034 PE475 N/A $ 4.000| $ 106.710 250 $ 1,000.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103034 054063 0 $ 3.840| $ 96.000 250 $ 960.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103034 (BLANK) 0 $ 3.560 | $ 88.890 250 $ 890.000 ROA
ITEM #34 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 12 x 18 Inches, Bright Pink, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103045 "Shocking Pink"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4180)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103045 12SULFSP No minimum $ 5.660| $ 141.500 400 $ 2,264.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103045 P103045 Cases $ 3.240| $ 81.000 400 $ 1,296.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103045 PE1923 N/A $ 4.000| $ 106.710 400 $ 1,600.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103045 054099 0 $ 3.840| $ 96.000 400 $ 1,536.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103045 (BLANK) 0 $ 3.600( $ 90.000 400 $ 1,440.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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REVISED DATE: 09/15/22

PRICE SCHEDULE/SPEC SHEET (REQUIRED FORM)

ITEM #35 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 12 x 18 Inches, Red, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103432 "Festive Red"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4190)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103432 12SULFRE No minimum $ 5.660( $ 141.500 500 $ 2,830.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103432 P103432 Cases $ 3.200| $ 80.000 500 $ 1,600.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103432 PE509 N/A $ 4.000| $ 106.710 500 $ 2,000.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103432 054651 0 $ 3.840| $ 96.000 500 $ 1,920.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103432 (BLANK) 0 $ 3.560 | $ 88.890 500 $ 1,780.000 ROA
ITEM #36 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 12 x 18 Inches, Violet, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103041 "Violet"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4200)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103041 12SULFPU No minimum $ 5.660( $ 141.500 300 $ 1,698.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103041 P103041 Cases $ 3.140| $ 78.500 300 $ 942.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103041 PE482 N/A $ 4.000| $ 106.710 300 $ 1,200.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103041 054087 0 $ 3.840| $ 96.000 300 $ 1,152.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103041 (BLANK) 0 $ 3.490( $ 87.220 300 $ 1,047.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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ITEM #37 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 12 x 18 Inches, White, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103058 "White"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4210)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103058 12SULFWH No minimum $ 5.660( $ 141.500 2500 $ 14,150.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103058 P103058 Cases $ 2.720| $ 68.000 2500 $ 6,800.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103058 PE498 N/A $ 4.000| $ 106.710 2500 $ 10,000.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103058 054141 0 $ 2.960| $ 74.000 2500 $ 7,400.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103058 (BLANK) 0 $ 3.020( $ 75.560 2500 $ 7,550.000 ROA
ITEM #38 Paper, Construction, Sulphite, Heavyweight, 12 x 18 Inches, Yellow, Pack of 50
Approved Product:
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY P103036 "Yellow"
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(WCSD #611/4220)
MANUFACTURER & MFR. VENDOR ESTIMATED QTY. EVALUATION
VENDOR NAME MODEL # PART/STOCK # MIN ORDER QTY. COST PER PKG COST PER CASE (PKG) EXTENDED COST KEY
Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School
Supply Dixon Ticonderoga P103036 12SULFYE No minimum $ 5.660( $ 141.500 500 $ 2,830.000 PBO
$3,200 any
combination of
Pyramid Paper Company d/b/a Pyramid Dixon/Pacon TruRay Dixon/Pacon in Full
School Products Dixon/Pacon TruRay P103036 P103036 Cases $ 3.140| $ 78.500 500 $ 1,570.000 DMO
DIXON TICONDEROGA TRU-RAY
S&S Worldwide P103036 PE477 N/A $ 4.000| $ 106.710 500 $ 2,000.000
School Specialty LLC Dixon TRU-RAY P103036 054069 0 $ 3.700| $ 92.500 500 $ 1,850.000
The Office Suppliers Inc. dba Office
Plus of Nevada Dixon Ticonderoga P103036 (BLANK) 0 $ 3.490( $ 87.220 500 $ 1,745.000 ROA
EXHIBIT C
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	EXHIBIT C

	WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT: 
	SOLICITATION TITLE CLASSROOM ART PAPER FOR WAREHOUSE INVENTORY: 
	SOLICITATION  86B0126GS: 
	ITEM EVALUATION KEY: 
	RB REJECT BID PER VENDOR: 
	NO SPEC NO SPECIFICATIONS: 
	NC NO CHARGE: 
	NO SUB NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED: 
	SR SAMPLE REJECTED: 
	NSR NO SAMPLE RECEIVED: 
	DMO DECLINED MINIMUM ORDER: 
	NB NO BID: 
	ROA RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD: 
	NC NO CHARGE_2: 
	ROAT TIED CHOSEN BY LOTTERYPBO PARTIAL BID ONLY: 
	VENDOR NAME: 
	LOW BID BY ITEM NUMBERSEarlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply: 
	1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9SS Worldwide: 
	1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9School Specialty LLC: 
	10 11 12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20 21 22 23 24 25 26 27 28 29 30 31 32 33 34 35 36 37 38: 
	ITEM 1 Paper Art Roll Black 50 lb Basis 36 X 1000 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUOFINISH P0067301 Black: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS: 
	WCSD 6113700: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID: 
	SS Worldwide: 
	School Specialty LLC: 
	NB 3275550: 
	NB 2932200: 
	ITEM 2 Paper Art Roll Dark Blue 50 lb Basis 36 X 1000 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUOFINISH P0067181 Dark Blue: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_2: 
	WCSD 6113710: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_2: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_2: 
	SS Worldwide_2: 
	School Specialty LLC_2: 
	NB 2106600: 
	NB 1808100: 
	ITEM 3 Paper Art Roll Brown 50 lb Basis 36 X 1000 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUOFINISH P0067021 Brown: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_3: 
	WCSD 6113720: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_3: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_3: 
	SS Worldwide_3: 
	School Specialty LLC_3: 
	NB 2106900: 
	NB 1763100: 
	ITEM 4 Paper Art Roll Green 50 lb Basis 36 X 1000 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUOFINISH P0067141 Emerald: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_4: 
	WCSD 6113730: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_4: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_4: 
	SS Worldwide_4: 
	School Specialty LLC_4: 
	NB 1949700: 
	NB 2116200: 
	ITEM 5 Paper Art Roll Orange 50 lb Basis 36 X 1000 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUOFINISH P0067101 Orange: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_5: 
	WCSD 6113740: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_5: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_5: 
	SS Worldwide_5: 
	School Specialty LLC_5: 
	NB 2550600: 
	NB 2116200_2: 
	ITEM 6 Paper Art Roll Pink 50 lb Basis 36 X 1000 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUOFINISH P0067261 Pink: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_6: 
	WCSD 6113750: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_6: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_6: 
	SS Worldwide_6: 
	School Specialty LLC_6: 
	NB 2406000: 
	NB 2051700: 
	ITEM 7 Paper Art Roll Red 50 lb Basis 36 X 1000 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUOFINISH P0067041 Scarlet: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_7: 
	WCSD 6113760: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_7: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_7: 
	SS Worldwide_7: 
	School Specialty LLC_7: 
	NB 2286000: 
	NB 1911600: 
	ITEM 8 Paper Art Roll White 50 lb Basis 36 X 1000 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUOFINISH P0067001 White: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_8: 
	WCSD 6113770: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_8: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_8: 
	SS Worldwide_8: 
	School Specialty LLC_8: 
	RB 6007500: 
	RB 5201100: 
	ITEM 9 Paper Art Roll Yellow 50 lb Basis 36 X 1000 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA PACON ARTKRAFT DUOFINISH P0067081 Canary: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_9: 
	WCSD 6113780: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_9: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_9: 
	SS Worldwide_9: 
	School Specialty LLC_9: 
	NB 2561700: 
	NB 2116200_3: 
	SECTION B  CONSTRUCTION PAPER: 
	ITEM 10 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Black Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103029 Black: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_10: 
	WCSD 6113940: 
	SS Worldwide_10: 
	DMO 3417000: 
	School Specialty LLC_10: 
	DMO 3281000: 
	ITEM 11 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Blue Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103022 Blue: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_11: 
	WCSD 6113950: 
	SS Worldwide_11: 
	DMO 2814000: 
	School Specialty LLC_11: 
	DMO 2758000: 
	ITEM 12 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Dark Brown Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103024 Dark Brown: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_12: 
	WCSD 6113960: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_10: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_10: 
	SS Worldwide_12: 
	DMO 1206000: 
	School Specialty LLC_12: 
	DMO 1080000: 
	ITEM 13 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Deep Green Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P102960 Holiday Green: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_13: 
	WCSD 6113970: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_11: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_11: 
	SS Worldwide_13: 
	DMO 904500: 
	School Specialty LLC_13: 
	DMO 1012500: 
	ITEM 14 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Deep Red Pack of 50 Approved Product Numbers DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P102993 Holiday Red: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_14: 
	WCSD 6113980: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_12: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_12: 
	SS Worldwide_14: 
	DMO 603000: 
	School Specialty LLC_14: 
	DMO 675000: 
	ITEM 15 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Gray Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103027 Gray: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_15: 
	WCSD 6113990: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_13: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_13: 
	SS Worldwide_15: 
	DMO 1306500: 
	School Specialty LLC_15: 
	DMO 1170000: 
	ITEM 16 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Green Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103006 Festive Green: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_16: 
	WCSD 6114000: 
	SS Worldwide_16: 
	DMO 2010000: 
	School Specialty LLC_16: 
	DMO 2170000: 
	ITEM 17 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Light Blue Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103016 Sky Blue: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_17: 
	WCSD 6114010: 
	SS Worldwide_17: 
	DMO 1608000: 
	School Specialty LLC_17: 
	DMO 1440000: 
	ITEM 18 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Light Brown Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103025 Warm Brown: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_18: 
	WCSD 6114020: 
	SS Worldwide_18: 
	DMO 804000: 
	School Specialty LLC_18: 
	DMO 720000: 
	ITEM 19 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Light Green Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103423 19SC Brilliant Lime: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_19: 
	WCSD 6114030: 
	SS Worldwide_19: 
	DMO 1005000: 
	School Specialty LLC_19: 
	DMO 985000: 
	ITEM 20 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Magenta Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103000 Magenta: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_20: 
	WCSD 6114040: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_14: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_14: 
	SS Worldwide_20: 
	DMO 703500: 
	School Specialty LLC_20: 
	DMO 689500: 
	ITEM 21 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Orange Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103002 Orange: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_21: 
	WCSD 6114050: 
	SS Worldwide_21: 
	DMO 2010000_2: 
	School Specialty LLC_21: 
	DMO 1970000: 
	ITEM 22 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Bright Pink Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103013 Shocking Pink: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_22: 
	WCSD 6114060: 
	SS Worldwide_22: 
	DMO 2211000: 
	School Specialty LLC_22: 
	DMO 2167000: 
	ITEM 23 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Red Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103431 Festive Red: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_23: 
	WCSD 6114070: 
	SS Worldwide_23: 
	DMO 2613000: 
	School Specialty LLC_23: 
	DMO 2561000: 
	ITEM 24 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Violet Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103009 Violet: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_24: 
	WCSD 6114080: 
	SS Worldwide_24: 
	DMO 1909500: 
	School Specialty LLC_24: 
	DMO 1833500: 
	ITEM 25 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches White Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103026 53SC White: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_25: 
	WCSD 6114090: 
	SS Worldwide_25: 
	DMO 10452000: 
	School Specialty LLC_25: 
	DMO 8268000: 
	ITEM 26 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 9 x 12 Inches Yellow Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103004 Yellow: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_26: 
	WCSD 6114100: 
	SS Worldwide_26: 
	DMO 3618000: 
	School Specialty LLC_26: 
	DMO 3474000: 
	ITEM 27 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 12 x 18 Inches Black Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103061 Black: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_27: 
	WCSD 6114110: 
	SS Worldwide_27: 
	DMO 4000000: 
	School Specialty LLC_27: 
	DMO 3700000: 
	ITEM 28 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 12 x 18 Inches Blue Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103054 Blue: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_28: 
	WCSD 6114120: 
	SS Worldwide_28: 
	DMO 2600000: 
	School Specialty LLC_28: 
	DMO 2496000: 
	ITEM 29 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 12 x 18 Inches Brown Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103056 Dark Brown: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_29: 
	WCSD 6114130: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_15: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_15: 
	SS Worldwide_29: 
	DMO 1000000: 
	School Specialty LLC_29: 
	DMO 912500: 
	ITEM 30 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 12 x 18 Inches Deep Green Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P102961 Holiday Green: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_30: 
	WCSD 6114140: 
	MANUFACTURER  MFR MODEL Earlychildhood LLC dba Discount School Supply_16: 
	MIN ORDER QTYNO BID_16: 
	SS Worldwide_30: 
	DMO 600000: 
	School Specialty LLC_30: 
	DMO 666000: 
	ITEM 31 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 12 x 18 Inches Green Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103038 Festive Green: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_31: 
	WCSD 6114150: 
	SS Worldwide_31: 
	DMO 2400000: 
	School Specialty LLC_31: 
	DMO 2532000: 
	ITEM 32 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 12 x 18 Inches Light Brown Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103057 Warm Brown: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_32: 
	WCSD 6114160: 
	SS Worldwide_32: 
	DMO 600000_2: 
	School Specialty LLC_32: 
	DMO 541500: 
	ITEM 33 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 12 x 18 Inches Orange Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103034 Orange: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_33: 
	WCSD 6114170: 
	SS Worldwide_33: 
	DMO 1000000_2: 
	School Specialty LLC_33: 
	DMO 960000: 
	ITEM 34 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 12 x 18 Inches Bright Pink Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103045 Shocking Pink: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_34: 
	WCSD 6114180: 
	SS Worldwide_34: 
	DMO 1600000: 
	School Specialty LLC_34: 
	DMO 1536000: 
	ITEM 35 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 12 x 18 Inches Red Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103432 Festive Red: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_35: 
	WCSD 6114190: 
	SS Worldwide_35: 
	DMO 2000000: 
	School Specialty LLC_35: 
	DMO 1920000: 
	ITEM 36 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 12 x 18 Inches Violet Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103041 Violet: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_36: 
	WCSD 6114200: 
	SS Worldwide_36: 
	DMO 1200000: 
	School Specialty LLC_36: 
	DMO 1152000: 
	ITEM 37 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 12 x 18 Inches White Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103058 White: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_37: 
	WCSD 6114210: 
	SS Worldwide_37: 
	DMO 10000000: 
	School Specialty LLC_37: 
	DMO 7400000: 
	ITEM 38 Paper Construction Sulphite Heavyweight 12 x 18 Inches Yellow Pack of 50 Approved Product DIXON TICONDEROGA TRURAY P103036 Yellow: 
	NO SUBSTITUTIONS_38: 
	WCSD 6114220: 
	SS Worldwide_38: 
	DMO 2000000_2: 
	School Specialty LLC_38: 
	DMO 1850000: 
	The Office Suppliers Inc dba Office Plus of NevadaRow1: 
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